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State of New Hampshire

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES
25 Capitol Street — Room 100
Concord, New Hampshire 03301

(603) 271-3201 Office@das.nh.gov

Catherine A. Keane
Charles M. Arlinghaus Deputy Commissioner
Commissioner

Sheri L. Rockburn
Assistant Commissioner

September 10, 2025
Her Excellency, Governor Kelly A. Ayotte
and the Honorable Council
State House
Concord, New Hampshire 03301

REQUESTED ACTION

Authorize the Department of Administrative Services to enter into a contract with Irving
Oil Terminals Inc., (VC#210991), Portsmouth, NH in an amount up to and not to exceed
$2,478,857.11 for #2 Heating Oil Fuel Supply and Delivery with the option to extend for one
year, effective upon Governor and Executive Council approval through August 31, 2027.

- Funding shall be provided through individual agency expenditures, none of which shall
be permitted unless there are sufficient appropriated funds to cover the expenditure.

EXPLANATION

The Department of Administrative Services, through the Bureau of Purchase and
Property issued request for bid (RFB) 3047-25 on June 5, 2025, with responses due on June 20,
2025. This bid reached 200 vendors through the NIGP procurement sourcing platform with 12
additional vendors sourced directly. There were three (3) compliant responses received. Irving
Oil Terminals, Inc. provided a compliant response and was the low-cost bid for the specified
locations, which is intended to be multi-award. C. Bean Transport will service locations in
District 1 not awarded as part of this contract.

The requested price limitation for this contract is $2,478,857.11, to provide agency
locations statewide with #2 heating fuel oil. The price limitation includes an allowance of
$495,771.42, or 25%, for unanticipated heating oil needs. This contract was awarded by location
to the vendor that could provide the lowest mark-up price over the Oil Price Information System
(OPIS) oil price daily sheet. OPIS is an independent, third-party monitoring system that collects
and distributes fuel rack prices on a daily basis, and is used by the State and fuel providing
vendors to establish fair market pricing. To determine the price limitation, the 2024 average
seasonal price per gallon of $2.3328 was utilized as the base line amount. The traditional heating
season runs from October of the current year through March of the following year, a six month
period. Individual site mark-ups were then added to the 2024 average seasonal price per gallon,
then multiplied by the annual estimated fuel usage per site and finally totaled to determine the
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estimated spend per District. Upon approval, Irving Oil Terminals Inc. would provide #2 heating
fuel oil to agency locations in Districts 1 through 6.

Contract financials
Estimated District 1 annual spend $172,418.59
Estimated District 2 annual spend $177,344.84
Estimated District 3 annual spend $174,163.04
Estimated District 4 annual spend $81,102.37
Estimated District 5 annual spend $166,672.82
Estimated District 6 annual spend $219,841.18
Estimated annual $991,542.845 |
Estimated contract term spend (2 years) $1,983,085.69
Vendor allowance (25%) $495,771.42
Requested price limitation $2,478,857.11

The Department of Administrative Services has determined that the vendor is in good
standing with the Secretary of State’s Office, has secured the required levels of insurance, and
has provided evidence of authority to execute and be bound by the contract. Documents
supporting these assertions are available at the agency, for review upon request.

Based on the foregoing, I am respectfully recommending approval of contract with [rving
Oil Terminals Inc.

Respectfully submitted,

a ~ 7
J /

Charles M. Arlinghaus
Commissioner

TDD ACCESS: RELAY NH 1-800-735-2964
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Statewide Contracf or Amendment

Division of Procurement Support Services Gary S. Lunetta
Bureau of Purchase Property Director
(603) 271-2201
RFB Bid Summary
Bid Description #2 Heating Fuel Oil Supply and Delivery [Agency Statewide
RFB# 3047-25 Requisition# N/A
Agent Name Ryan Fuller Bid Closing June 20, 2025
Indicates Award: e
o :
PR o = i s e R
1 75,843 | Gallon $2.3328 $0.1777 $190,403.85 No Bid No Bid
2 71,215 | Gallon $2.3328 $0.1693 $178,187.05 No Bid No Bid
3 #2 Heating 71,787 | Gallon $2.3328 $0.1454 $177,902.54 No Bid No Bid
4 Fuel Oil 31,487 | Gallon $2.3328 $0.2560 $81,513.55 No Bid No Bid
S 67,186 | Gallon $2.3328 $0.1817 $168,939.20 $0.9900 $223,245.64 $0.6500 $200,402.40
6 91,682 | Gallon $2.3328 $0.0814 $221,338.68 $0.9900 $304,640.95 $0.5594 $265,162.68
Sub Total $1,018,284.87 $527,886.59 $465,565.08
Estimated annual spend| $991,542.845 Expiring contract annual| $1,362,967.61
Estimated term spend| $1,983,085.69 Expirin; contract term| $2,725,935.22
Add allowance for balance of product line| $495,771.42 Cost increase/Savin;s X% or| -$247,078.11
Recommended price limitation| $2,478,857.11 Delta: new vs. expiringF -10%

Statewide Contract
Term of Contract 2 Years
Price Limitation $2,478,857.11
Number of Solicitations Received 3
Number of Sourced bidders 12
Number of NIGP Vendors Sourced 200
Number of non-responsive bidders 209
P-37 Checklist Complete Yes
D&B Report Attached Yes
Method of Payment (P-card/ACH) Both
FOB Delivered Yes
Expiring Contract Price Limitation $2,725,935.22
Total Cost Savings/Increase ($/%) -$247,078.11 | -10%
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AL USAGE

'NH DEPT. OF ADMIN
SERVICES, BUREAU OF
s - i LANCASTER - COOS COUNTY COURTHOUSE s sf::&t;;:zn SARAH LINEBERRY 856-5702|  COURTFACIUTIES2S | 114918 | PT | 1/6000 | #2 14,000
FACLITIES CAPITOL ST. ROOM 115
CONCS
Department of Safety,
660 Trudeau Road,
, . B 5 &
DEPANTMENT OF Division of Fire Standards & Training Bethlehem, NH - feffrey Phillps  223- | Division of Fire Standards PT 1275 0 550
SAFETY (DOS) Ca 13 Training, 33 Hazen Drive,
. Concord NH
DEPT. OF BUSINESS & 2434 ST. JOHNSBURY RD, | LARRY LENDERMAN | 100 NORTH MAIN ST. SUITE
ECONOMIC AFFAIRS UTTLETON REST AN/ UTTLETON 573-6346 100 CONCORD, NHo03301| M43 T 22m " 1400
DEPT. OF BUSINESS & US ROUTE 3 NORTH LARRY LENDERMAN | 100 NORTH MAIN ST. SUITE
4 PT ;
ECONOMIC AFFAIRS COLEBROOK REST AREA COLEBROOK 573-6346 100 CONCORD, NHo03301| ™M14% a2 " b
DEPT. OF NATURAL & NH DNCR
CULTURAL GORHAM - MOOSE BROOK STATE PARK PRIMIOWNEROAD, * | ‘AUMINBEAEIOUR S0 | L e biet | i PT 1/275 ” 1,200
GORHAM 3860
RESOURCES Concord, NH 03301
S FRANCONIA NOTCH,
DEPT. OF NATURAL & " | GEORGELEMERISE 823- | NH DNCR, 172 PEMBROKE uG
CULTURAL ResOURCEs| ~ CANNONMOUNTAIN - HEADQUARTERS mmoa G 8800 X703 RD. CONCORD, NH 03301 | M1 T ] 12000 | *2 3000
__FRANCONIA _
3 FRANCONIA NOTCH
DEPT. OF NATURAL & " | GEORGELEMERISE 823- | NHDNCR, 172 PEMBROKE
CULTURAL RESOURCeS| CANNON MOUNTAIN MAINTENANCE GARAGE: | EXIT 348 OR 34C, paane a0, CONCED, eroasns | M3 PT 2275 n 2,100
S FRANCONIA NOTCH,
DEPT. OF NATURAL & " | GEORGELEMERISE 823- | NH DNCR, 172 PEMBROKE v
CULTURAL ResOURces|  CANNON MOUNTAIN - NOTCH VIEW LODGE E"'FT s g" 246, 8800 X703 RD. CONCORD, NH 03301 | M T 12000 | * 4,000
____FRANCONIA
DEPT. OF NATURAL& |  CANNON MOUNTAIN - COMPRESSOR BLDG. | ° Zm‘::n;r;zcn, GEORGE LEMERISE 823- | NHONCR, 172 PEMBROKE | - i w 3000
CULTURAL RESOURCES WILL CALL ONLY . > 8800 X703 RD. CONCORD, NH 03301
FRANCONIA _
DEPT. OF NATURAL & 6298 MAIN STREET, | MARGARET MACHINIST 78| NH DNCR, 172 PEMBROKE
CULTURAL RESOURCES| LANCASTER - REGION 1 OFFICE LANCASTER 4157 EXT. 307 RD. CONCORD, NH 03301 | 'O kY 1/a00 " 2000
26 LAFAVETTE
DEPT. OF NATURAL & NH DNCR, 172 PEMBROKE
ki eatmsentnd LAFAYETTE PARK CAMPGROUND CAMPGROUND RD, | NICOLE NATT - 823.9513 | o0 W M2 FEMBRONE | PT v27s w 275
LINCOLN
DEPT. OF NATURAL &
SANDY YOUNG NH DNCR, 172 PEMBROKE
CULTURAL COLEMAN LODGES 35 ECKERD WAY il o Co s e e PT 7/275 w
RESOURCES
NH ENV. SERVICES, DAM
HY
DES PITTSBURG - MURPHY DAM MU:::TsaZ:z ':‘iw' DANMATTAINI  271-3406  BUREAU PO BOX 95 PT 1275 0 805 23328
d CONCORD, NH 03 No Bid No Bid
NH DEPT. OF ADMIN
SERVICES, BUREAU OF
OHHS BERLIN - DHHS DISTRICT OFFICE A SR ETBERIN ponsmITH 7527800 | COURT FACILTIES 25 PT 4375 w0 2,200 23328
CAPITOL ST. ROOM 115
¢ No Bid No Bid
- - NH DNCR
DNCR LANCASTER - REGION 1 TRAILS BUREAU o Sirea: Bga'";::'::; 172 Pembroke Road PT 1275 n 1,000 23328 )
ncaster - o b No Bid No Bid
JAMES FORTIN/FRED | NH DOT - DISTRICT 1, 641
Hi NH ROUTE 16, PINKHAM
zﬂmzﬁ:nm; PINKHAM NOTCH - PATROL SHED s = GILBERT MAIN STREET LANCASTER, |  109p PT 3275 0 500 23328
603-466-3 03584 No Bid No Bid No Bid
JAMIE GOODEN/MARTY | NH DOT - DISTRICT 1, 641
H! us
:ﬂg&:x‘; CRAWFORD NOTCH - PATROL SHED mw“;f;:gi'm CULVER MAIN STREET LANCASTER, | M112 PT 1/2,000 ) 1,000 23328
603-278-5572 NH 03584
NH DOT - DISTRICT 1, 641
} :
m{;g:’::‘:: FRANCONIA PATROL SHED s Zm‘;;‘w’ JENNIFER FORTIER 788-4641| MAIN STREET LANCASTER, | M116 PT 3275 w 1,000
NH 03584
NH DOT - DISTRICT 1, 641
DOT HIGHWAY 327 BUTTERHILL RD u/e
et BUTTERHILL PATROL SHED esbbiosiy JENNIFER FORTIER 788-4641| MAIN mngsr;:wwsa, M124 | e | ® 500
NH DOT - DISTRICT 1, 641
AY .
DOT HIGHW UITTLETON - PATROL SHED TANK 1 Z0LDELSROAD, |\ NNIFER FORTIER 788-4641 | MAIN STREET LANCASTER, | 125 PT u/e w0 1,500
MAINTENANCE UTTLETON 1/1,000
___NH 03584
NH DOT - DISTRICT 1, 641
T HIGHWAY 1 0AD, ot
a'xmr:mu o UITTLETON - PATROL SHED TANK 2 ) UD:I,L”;RW O | sENNIFER FORTIER 785-4641| MAIN STREET LANCASTER, | M125 PT U‘:/:m 0 1,500
NH 03584 v
N DOT - DISTRICT 1, 641
DOT HIGHWAY BROWN ROAD, :
MAINTENANCE GROVETON PATROL SHED GROVETON JENNIFER FORTIER 788-4641| MAIN STREEJ;ANCASTER, M104 PT 1/1,000 L3 750
NH DOT - DISTRICT 1, 641
DOT HIGHWAY 180 SPRUCEVILLE ROAD, :
T WEST MILAN - PATROL SHED e JENNIFER FORTIER 788-4641 MAIN sr::a;rzu:curzn, M105 T | 11000 [ m 750
___ NHO03584
NH DOT - DISTRICT 1, 641
DOT HIGHWAY 32 STATE GARAGE ROAD, .
Kot MILAN PATROL SHED IV JENNIFER FORTIER 788-4641| MAIN smssur;musrsa, M106 e | 2727 0 450
_NHO03584




NH DOT - DISTRICT 1, 641

DOTHGHWAY LANCASTER DISTRICT OFFICE G41MAINSTREET, |\ \NIFER FORTIER 788-4641| MAIN STREET LANCASTER, | M198 1275 0 450
MAINTENANCE LANCASTER
NH DO - DISTRICT 1, 641
DOT HIGHWAY 160 STAG HOLLOW RD, : . u/e
#
ol JEFFERSON PATROL SHED porceciesie JENNIFER FORTIER 788-4641| MAIN STREET LANCASTER, | M108 75 000 2 500
______NH 03584
NH DOT - DISTRICT 1, 641
DOT HIGHWAY WHITEFIELD PATROL SHED mx:r;'.:;i'w"in' JENNIFER FORTIER 788-4641| MAIN STREET LANCASTER, | M107w 1275 0 275
MAINTENANCE
NH DOT - DISTRICT 1, 641
OOT HGHWAY GORHAM -PATROL SHED IMORNDRIVE, | e NNIFER FORTIER 788-4641| MAIN STREET LANCASTER, | M109 11000 | s46
MAINTENANCE GORHAM
_NHO3584
DOT HIGHWAY $41 DOF- DESTRICY:1, 641
MONROE PATROL SHED NHRT. 135, MONROE | JENNIFER FORTIER 788-4641| MAIN STREET LANCASTER, | M125M 1275 0 275
__NHO3584
NH DOT - DISTRICT 1, 641
DOT HIGHWAY 2335 MAIN STREET, .
e LISBON - PATROL SHED - NEW BUILDING e JENNIFER FORTIER 788-4641| MAIN STREET LANCASTER, | M124 - N 11000 | w2 750
_____NHO03584
NH DOT - DISTRICT T, 641
DOT HIGHWAY 2335 MAIN STREET, ;
ey LISBON - PATROL SHED - OLD BUILDING Heaon JENNIFER FORTIER 788-4641| MAIN STREET LANCASTER, | M114 - O 1275 0 s
______NHO03584
NH DOT - DISTRICT 1, 641
DOT HIGHWAY 65 OLD AIRPORT RD, . ue
Rt LINCOLN - PATROL SHED b JENNIFER FORTIER 788-4641| MAIN STREET LANCASTER, | M115 iow | ® 2,000
__NH 03584
DOT HIGHWAY NH DOT - DISTRICT 1, 641
Ay GLEN - PATROL SHED US ROUTE 302, GLEN | JENNIFER FORTIER 788-4641 MAIN STREET LANCASTER, | M113G 12000 | w2 2,000
_____NHO03584
NH DOT - DISTRICT 1, 641
DOT HIGHWAY 641 MAIN STREET, .
e LANCASTER DISTRICT OFFICE il JENNIFER FORTIER 788-4641| MAIN STREET LANCASTER, | M198 1275 0 450
______NHO03584
NF DOT - DISTRICT 1, 641
DOTINGHWAY COLUMBIA PATROL SHED BGRANTROAD, | 16 \NIFER FORTIER 788-4641| MAIN STREET LANCASTER, | M102 1000 | @ 750 23328
MAINTENANCE COLUMBIA )
NHO3SBA No 8id No Bid No 8id
DOT HIGHWAY M1 DOT -DESTRICT 2, 641
oA ERROL PATROL SHED 143 DAM ROAD, ERROL | JENNIFER FORTIER 788-4641| MAIN STREET LANCASTER, | M103€ 11000 | w2 750 23328
N 03584 No Bid No Bid No Bid
NH DOT - DISTRICT 1, 641
m::&m PITTSBURG - UPPER 1055 :m'“‘m"“ :2"“ " |JENNIFER FORTIER 788-4641| MAIN STREET LANCASTER, | M101U 2275 0w 500 23328
__ NHo3584 Nosig No Bid No 8id
NH DOT - DISTRICT 1, 641
DOTHIGHWAY PITTSBURG - LOWER 2947 S MAIN STREET, | 1 NNIFER FORTIER 785-4641| MAIN STREET LANCASTER, | M101L 2275 0 762 23328
MAINTENANCE PITTSBURG
NH DOT - DISTRICT 1, 641
DGT HIGHWAY BEHIND THE BALSAM : .
DIXVILLENOTCH PATROL SHED iy JENNIFER FORTIER 788-4641| MAIN STREET LANCASTER, | M1020 1275 0 500
____NH 03584
NA DOT Mechanical
DOT Mechanical 3 " 502 Route 302 Services
e Twin Mountain Satelite T 302 | Adam white s03-846-5741 o #1/GD 1200 | w2 4,600
NF DOT MECHANICAL
DOT MECHANICAL 647-A MAIN STREET,
s LANCASTER SATELLITE i, MARK CORRIGAN 788-4177 sceuvu::s, POBOX 483 n 12000 | w2 3,500
NH FISH & GAME BUSINESS
FISH & GAME BERLIN - HATCHERY YORK POND ROAD, BERLIN| WAYNE PASCHAL 449-3412 | OFFICE 11 HAZEN 801 sooo | w2 2,500
DR.CONCORD, NH 03301
NH FISH & GAME BUSINESS
FISH & GAME BERLIN - HATCHERY YORK POND ROAD, BERLIN| WAYNE PASCHAL 4493412 | OFFICE,11 HAZEN 3/330 0 1,000
DR.CONCORD, NH 03301
NH FISH & GAME BUSINESS
FISH & GAME BERLIN - HATCHERY YORK POND ROAD, BERLIN| WAYNE PASCHAL 448-3412 | OFFICE11 HAZEN 2330 " 2,000
DR.CONCORD, NH 03301
) NH FISH & GAME BUSINESS
FISH & GAME TWIN MOUNTAIN - HATCHERY - ResiDence | 1450 ROUTE SN TWIN | yyayne pasciiag aas3a1a | ofice 1 HAZEN 101 1275 n 1,000
DR.CONCORD, NH 03301
NH FISH & GAME BUSINESS
FISH & GAME TWIN MOUNTAIN - HATCHERY - OFfice | 14S0ROUTEIN. TWIN |\ e o coial 449.3012 | OFFICE 11 HAZEN 102 1275 n 900
T DR.CONCORD, NH 03301
NH FISH & GAME BUSINESS
FISH & GAME TWIN MOUNTAIN - HATCHERY BLDG TASOROUTESN. TWIN | \yAYNE PASCHAL 4493412 | OFFICE11 HAZEN 103 1275 w 3300
DR.CONCORD, NH 03301
1450 ROUTE3N. TWIN TREDH & GAME BUEINESS
FISH&GAME | TWIN MOUNTAIN - HATCHERY VISITOR CENTER iy WAYNE PASCHAL 449-3412 | OFFICE,11 HAZENDR. | TO-4 2275 0 1300
CONCORD, NH 03301
) : 159 Main Street Caitlyn Polizos 50 Storrs Street
Liquor Sto a
Liquor Commission iquor Store #52 3-230.7083 ) 03301 #52 1/275 #2 780

$ 172,418.5034




DEPARTMENT

U/G = UNDERGROUND TANK
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&R
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Newport

Bold Font = Automatic
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#

OPIS Price

$ 23328

DAS
Courts Facilities

Lebanon District Court

38 Centerra Parkway
Lebanon

Sarah Lineberry
603-856-5702

Court Facilities
Room 115
25 Capitol Street

Concord

&

1/500

“w

DAS GENERAL SERVICES

CLAREMONT- OLD MILL

17 WATER STREET,
CLAREMONT

ANDY DESCOTEAU  558-1020

LNH 03301

NH DAS BUSINESS
OFFICE. 25 CAPITOL ST.
ROOM 418 CONCORD,

1555100

PT

u/G
1/10,000

#2

10,000

“w

DEPT. OF BUSINESS & ECONOMIC
AFFAIRS

SPRINGFIELD REST AREA

1-89 NORTHBOUND,
SPRINGFIELD

LARRY LENDERMAN
573-6346

—_NHO03301
100 NORTH MAIN ST.
SUITE 100 CONCORD,

243

2/330

#

s

DEPT. OF BUSINESS & ECONOMIC
AFFAIRS

LEBANON REST AREA

1-89 EXIT 18 SOUTHBOUND,
LEBANON

LARRY LENDERMAN
573-6346

—___NH 03301 _
100 NORTH MAIN ST.
SUITE 100 CONCORD,

242

2/275

“w

DHHS GLENCLIFF HOME

GLENCLIFF/ GROUNDS
GARAGE

393 HIGH STREET,
GLENCLIFF, NH

DAVID BROWN 989-5204

_NH 03301
NH GLENCLIFF HOME,
PO BOX 76. GLENCLIFF,

#

1,500

w

DHHS GLENCLIFF HOME

GLENCLIFF/ CARPENTER SHOP

393 HIGH STREET,
GLENCLIFF, NH

DAVID BROWN 989-5204

_NH 03238
NH GLENCLIFF HOME,
PO BOX 76. GLENCLIFF,
H 0:

GCAR

#2

1,700

v

DHHS GLENCLIFF HOME

GLENCLIFF/ BIRCHWOOD

393 HIGH STREET,
GLENCLIFF, NH

DAVID BROWN 989-5204

NH GLENCLIFF HOME,
PO BOX 76. GLENCLIFF,

#2

1,200

2.3328

s

DOT BRIDGE MAINTENANCE

FRANKLIN - YARD (between

7am-3:30pm M-F)

13 RANGE RD, FRANKLIN

CHRISTOPHER BALCH
5735

934-

NH 03238
NH DOT BRIDGE MAINT.

PO BOX 483 CONCORD,
NH 03301

26-13A

U/G 1/500

#2

1,000

23328 |

w

DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE

NEW LONDON PATROL SHED

(Old Shed)

63 DUMP RD NEW
LONDON

DISTRICT2  448-2654

NH DOT DISTRICT #2, 8
EASTMAN HILL RD.
IELD,

OLD “214"

2/275

2.3328

w

DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE

NEW LONDON PATROL SHED

(New Shed)

63 DUMP RD NEW
LONDON

DISTRICT2  448-2654

NH DOT DISTRICT #2, 8
EASTMAN HILL RD.
FIELD, NH 03747

DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE

WENTWORTH PATROL SHED

465 E SIDE DR,
WENTWORTH

448-2654

NEW “214"

2/275

$ 23328

NH DOT DISTRICT #2, 8
EASTMAN HILL RD.
ENFIELD, NH 03747

DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE

RUMNEY PATROL SHED

43 OLD N GROTON RD,
RUMNEY

DISTRICT2  448-2654

202

2/275

#

w

2.3328

NH DOT DISTRICT #2, 8
EASTMAN HILL RD.
IE H 03747

DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE

BRISTOL PATROL SHED

84 AYERS RD, BRISTOL

DISTRICT2  448-2654

203

u/6
1/1,000

1,200

s

2.3328

NH DOT DISTRICT #2, 8
EASTMAN HILL RD.
ENFIELD, NH 03747

206

2/275

L.23

1,600

23328 §

w

DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE

FRANKLIN PATROL SHED

38 SALISBURY ST. FRANKLIN

DISTRICT2  448-2654

NH DOT DISTRICT #2, 8
EASTMAN HILL RD.
ENFIELD, 47

211

PT

u/G
1/1,000

#2

$ 23328)°

DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE

ANDOVER PATROL SHED

17 SWITCH RD. ANDOVER

DISTRICT2  448-2654

NH DOT DISTRICT #2, 8
EASTMAN HILL RD.
ENFIELD, NH 03747

210

u/G
1/1,000

2

23328 |

v

DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE

CANAAN PATROL SHED

490 NH RTE 118, CANAAN

DISTRICT2  448-2654

NH DOT DISTRICT #2, 8
EASTMAN HILL RD.
ENFIELD, NH 037

DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE

CORNISH PATROL SHED

220 STAGE & TOWNSHOUSE

RD, CORNISH

DISTRICT 2 448-2654

205-2

u/G
1/1,000

#2

“w

2.3328

NH DOT DISTRICT #2, 8
EASTMAN HILL RD.
NFIELD, NH 03747

212

PT

2/275

#2

$ 23328

DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE

LEMPSTER PATROL SHED

390 US RTE 10, LEMPSTER

DISTRICT2  448-2654

NH DOT DISTRICT #2, 8
EASTMAN HILL RD.
FIELD, NH 03747

DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE

LEBANON PATROL SHED

138 ETNA ROAD, LEBANON

DISTRICT2  448-2654

215

PT

2/275

#2

No Bid

No Bid

v

2.3328

NH DOT DISTRICT #2, 8
EASTMAN HILL RD.
ENFIELD, NH 03747

DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE

SUNAPEE PATROL SHED -

WASH BAY

8 POST OFFICE RD, SUNAPEE

DISTRICT2  448-2654

207

2/275

#2

«

2.3328

NH DOT DISTRICT #2, 8
EASTMAN HILL RD.
ENFIELD, NH 03747

"WASH BAY" 213

PT

2/275

#2

$ 23328

DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE

SUNAPEE PATROL SHED - NEW

DOT SHED

8 POST OFFICE RD, SUNAPEE

DISTRICT2 ~ 448-2654

NH DOT DISTRICT #2, 8
EASTMAN HILL RD.
ENFIELD, NH 03747

“NEW" 213

1/500

"2

1,200

23328

“w

No Bid

No Bid



—NH 03301

ENFIELD DISTRICT OFFICE (224 | BEASIMAN HIL RD, . we
DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE DISTRICT2 4482654 EASTMAN HILLRD s
Balzol Shed Bide 3) ENFIELD o ze i | B | R
N:LDOT DISTRICT 12,8
ENFIELD DISTRICT OFFICE (QId | B EASTMAN HILL 8D,
DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE DISTRICT2 4482654 EASTVAN HILLRD. s
224 Patrol Shed Bidg 7) ENFIELD - e~ — o | & A
ENELOOSTRICTOFFICE. | BEASTMAN HULRD. b~
DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE DISTRICT2 4482654 EASTMAN HILRD. s
(Warehouse Bide 2) ENFIELD 2An el B a
ENFELDDISTRICT OFFICE. | R.EASTMAN HILLRD. MUDILOAIRCLIZE
DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE DISTRICT2 4482654 EASTMAN HILLRD s
{Distict Office Blde 1) ENFIELD o vp ) — ot i
ENFEDDISTRICTOFFICE | BEASTMAN HILL RD, MUDOLOGIRCLEL.E
DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE DISTRICT2 4482654 EASTMAN HILLRD. 3 s
(Welding Shop Bidg 4) ENFIELD A20E0 el Z0
NH DOT DISTRICT #2, 8
DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE NEWBURY - PATROL SHED | 201 VILLAGE RD, NEWBURY, DISTRICT2 _ 448-2654 EASTMAN HILL RD. 216-1 1/275 #2 [} $
_ENFIELD, NH 03747
NH DOT DISTRICT #2, 8
ue
DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE RY - P, 1 NEW DISTRICT2 _ 448-2654 EASTMAN HILL RD. 216-2 #2 0 $
ENFIELD, NH 03747 14.000
NH DOT DISTRICT #2, 8
DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE ORFORD PATROL SHED 946 NH RT 10, ORFORD DISTRICT2  448-2654 EASTMAN HILL RD. 201 1/1000 2 600 §
NFI
NH DOT DISTRICT #2, 8
DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE HAVERHILL PATROL SHED 375 HWV“::\‘I‘ET:HTLL GE DISTRICT 2 448-2654 EASTMAN HILL RD. 204 2/275 " 1,950 S
Fl| 7
NH ENV. SERVICES,
ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES FRANKLIN;uumP Evimaty SIF::'::S:r:iET SHARON MCMILLIN 'WATER DIVISION. PO BOX u/G# 1/1,000 #2 1,000 S
J 95 CONCORD, NH 03302
NH ENV. SERVICES,
ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES FRANKLN, Stﬂﬂo: dary SZ:R:I’\‘I::N NHET SHARON MCMILLIN 'WATER DIVISION. PO BOX u/G #2 1/1,000 " 1,000 S
’ 95 CONCORD, NH 03302
WWT! NH ENV. SERVICES,
ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES FRANKUN, rsy P Digaster SZF;:INVKES:I:EHH SHARON MCMILLIN 'WATER DIVISION. PO BOX u/G#3 1/5,000 #2 2,500 s
’ 95 CONCORD, NH 03302
NH ENV. SERVICES,
ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES ERANKLIN, B‘dﬂp ation SI:R:NNKE::r:E‘H SHARON MCMILLIN WATER DIVISION. PO BOX U/GHa 1/5,000 # 1,000 S
! 95 CONCORD, NH 03302
NH FISH & GAME
o 25 FISH HATCHERY RD STERLING BAKER 764- BUSINESS OFFICE,11
FISH & GAME WARREN - FISH HATCHERY WARREN 8593 HAZEN DR. CONCORD, wo1 2/275 2 3,300 S
NH FISH & GAME
'WARREN - FISH HATCHERY - 13 FISH HATCHERY RD STERLING BAKER 764- BUSINESS OFFICE,11
FIS|
H & GAME Wi ™ N DR. G ] W02 1/220 #2 1,000 $
NH FISH EM
'WARREN - FISH HATCHERY - 23 FISH HATCHERY RD STERLING BAKER 764- BUSINESS OFFICE,11
FISH & GAME
% VISITOR CENTER WARREN 8593 NAZEH DR. CONCORD, 1ars 2 1,200 $




U}G = UNDERGROUND TANK PT = PEDAL TRUCK | TT = TRACTOR TRAILER
Legend:| Unlined Font: Gravity Bold Font = Double L Font: Delivery, top off all tanks when delivering, s
o e requires separate delivery ticket for each tank ID c Font = Approx. 1,000 gallons per daiivery only
DEPARTMENT LOCATION PHYSICAL ADDRESS CONTACT PERSON & TELEPHONE REMIT ADDRESS TANK ID T TANK SIZE ¢ J6L TvPE it 7
NH DAS BUREAU OF
FACILITIES AND ASSET MGMT.
DAS - BFAM LACONIA BLDG #1 54 GREEN ST. LACONIA LEF SMITH 485-3806 129 PLEASANT STREET, PT 1/275 w2 1,020
CONCORD, NH 03301
NH DAS BUREAU OF
FACILITIES AND ASSET MGMT.
= L = .
DAS - BFAM LACONIA BLDG #2 68 GREEN ST. LACONIA LEE SMITH 485-3806 129 PLEASANT STREET, PT 1/275 2 650
CONCORD, NH 03301
NH DEPT. OF ADMIN
NORTH CONWAY - SERVICES, BUREAU OF COURT
DAS - COURT FACILITIES NORTHERN CARROLL RT. 302, NORTH CONWAY SARAH LINEBERRY 856-5702 FACILITIES 25 CAPITOL ST. PT 2/275 "2 2,800
COUNTY COURTHOUSE ROOM 115 CONCORD, NH
2 RVICES,
CARROLL COUNTY i D:Z;EZFU?”Z: 5 RT ES,
DAS - COURT FACILITIES ot 6. WATER WLIAGE kO SARAH LINEBERRY 856-5702 FACILITIES 25 CAPITOL ST. 115530 PT /5000 H2 14,500
*~1000 GAL / OSSIPEE u/G
DELIVERY ROOM 115 CONCORD, NH
03301
NH DEPT. OF AMIN SERVICES,
PLYMOUTH - DISTRICT 26 GREEN STREET, : BUREAU OF COURT FACILITIES| u/G
. 3 4 PT 2 7,000
DAS - COURT FACKITIES COURTHOUSE PLYMOUTH SARAH LINEBERRY:856 5702 25 CAPITOL ST. ROOM 115 14796 1/3,000
CONCORD, NH 03301
DEPT. OF & S, ON REST 1-93 MILE MARKER 61 LARRY LENDERMAN 100 NORTH MAIN ST. SUITE PT 1/275 w2 587
ECONOMIC AFFAIRS AREA SOUTHBOUND 573-6346 100 1
DEPT. OF BUSINESS & 3654 WHITE MOUNTAIN LARRY LENDERMAN 100 NORTH MAIN ST. SUITE
AREA 1R PT 2 #2 9
| economicarpais | CONWAYREST AREA | AY, N _srae36 100 concoRD, Nossor | M3 shaas s
TAMWORTH - WHITE NH DRED BUSINESS OFFICE,
DEPT. OF NATURAL & 1632 WHITE MTN. HWY, u/G
LAKE STATE PARK ERIC NELSON  419-0572 172 PEMBROKE RD. TANK 9 PT #2 500
T 'ORTH 1/1,000
CULTURAL RESOURCES SHOWER HOUSE AMW( /1,
NH DOT District 3
Moultonborough 220 Holland Street Todd Nason M305 TANK 2 &
DOT Highway Maintenance Putrol Shed Moultonborough 603-524-6667 2 Sawmill Road 3 PT 2/275 (7] 1,502
Gilford, NH 03246
NH DOT District 3
Moultonborough 710 Whittier Highway Todd Nason
DOT Highway Maintenance 603-524-6667 2 sawmill Road Mm310 PT 1/330 #2 725
NH DOT District 3
Tuftonboro 328 Middle Road Todd Nason
DOT Highway Maintenance Patrol Shed Tuftonboro 603-52 7 2 Sawmill Road M311 PT 2/275 # 1,840
_Gilford, NH 03246
NH DOT District 3
Meredith 142 Parade Road Todd Nason
DOT Highway Maintenance Patrol Shed Meredith 603-524-6667 2 Sawmill Road M309 PT 2/275 #2 725
NH DOT District 3
New Hampton - I-93 42 Dot Drive Todd Nason
DOT Highway Maintenance Patrol Shed New Hampton 603-524-6667 fSawmlll Road M324 PT 1/3,000 #2 820
NH DOT District 3
Loudon 1013 Route 106 North Todd Nason
DOT Highway Maintenance Patrol Shed et 24-6667 2 Sawmill Road M316 PT 2/275 #2 1,293
NH DOT District 3
Conway 608 Eaton Road Todd Nason
DOT Highway Maintenance Patrol Shed Cotway 603-524-6667 2 Sawmill Road M301 PT 2/275 H2 1,180
NH DOT District 3
Freedom 18 State Garage Way Todd Nason
DOT Highway Maintenance Paticl Stied Noikig 603-5: 2 2 Sawmill Road M303 PT 2/275 # 1,235
Gilford, NH 03246
493 White Mountain NH DOT District 3
Ti rth d Naso
DOT Highway Maintenance amwe Highway Tod B 2 sawmill Road m302 PT 2/275 " 1579
Patrol Shed 603-524-6667
Tamworth il
NH DOT District 3
Thornton RR1 Laundromat Road Todd Nason
DOT Highway Maintenance Patrol Shed it 603-52. 7 2 Sawmill Road M325 PT 2/275 # 1,510
NH DOT District 3
Wakefield 1540 Wakefield Road Todd Nason
DOT Hi int: 666
ighway Maintenance Patrol Shed Wakefield 603-52 7 2 Sawmill Road M312 PT 2/275 2 1391
NH DOT District 3
Alton DOT 3 Road Todd Nason
Di
0T Highway Maintenance PutrotShod Alton 2 7 2 Sawmill Road M315 PT 2/275 # 1,063
NH DOT District 3
Gilford 2 Sawmill Road Todd Nason
Hi inte:
DOT Highway Mal nance District - Gilford 7 2 Sawmill Road M398 PT 2/250 # 1,455
NH DOT District 3
Tilton 427 Depot Street Todd Nason
T Hi Main
DOT Highway Maintenance Patrol Shed Belmont 603-52. 7 2 Sawmill Road Mm313 PT 2/275 # 1576

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid




NH DOT District 3
Belmont 10 Brown Hill Road Todd Nason
DOT Highway Maintenance Patrol Bel 603.524-6667 2 Sawmill Road Mm314 PT 2/275 0 1,472
Gilford, NH 03246
NH DOT District 3
Ashland 42 North Ashland Road Todd Nason
DOT Highway Maintenance watvol Ashland 603-524-6667 2 Sawmill Road M308 PT 2/275 # 873
Gilford, NH 03246
NH DOT District 3
Ossipee 20 Old Route 28 Todd Nason
DOT Highway Maintenance Patrol 603-524-6667 2 Sawmill Road M307 PT 2/275 w2 1,010
Gilford, NH 03246
CTR OSSIPEE SATELLITE
15 HODGDON SHORE RD, CTR DOT. MECH SERV. PO BOX u/G
DOT MECHANICAL SERVICES . SUH:D OSSIPEE DARRELL JOHNSON 539-4583 483 CONCORD,NH 03301 H PT 1/2,000 H2 100
BACK-UP USE ONLY
NH ENV. SERVICES, DAM
ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES LAKEPORT DAM 93 ELM ST, LAKEPORT, NH DAN MATTAINI  271-3406 BUREAU PO BOX 95 PT 1/275 #2 1,035
NH Fish & Game Business
Powder Mill Hatchery 287 Merrymeeting Road EJ Malone Office #U/G
Fieh & Game New Durham New Durham 603-859-2041 11 Hazen Drive T 1/500 " 1200
Concord. NH 03301 i
= NH Fish & Game Business
Powder Mill Hatchery 287 Merrymeeting Road EJ Malone Office
fish &iGame New Durham New Durham 603-859-2041 11 Hazen Drive i aers 2 525
Concord, NH 03301
NH Fish & Game Business
Region 2 Office 200 Main Street Kristine Rines Office
Fish & Game New Hampton New Hampton 603-744-5470 11 Hazen Drive £ W e 2000
Concord. NH 03301
NH Fish & Game Business
New Hampton 30 Hatchery Road William Phinney Office
1,
Fishy& Gama Hatchery Residence New Hampton 603-960-0708 11 Hazen Drive T s - w0
Concord. NH 03301
NH Fish & Game Business
William Phinney
New Hampton 204 Main Street Office
Fish & Game Ha New Hampton 603-744-3x 11 R PT 2/275 # 4,000
9600 Concord. NH 03301
NH Fish & Game Business
Owl Brook
387 Perch Pond Road Tom Flynn Office
Fish & Game Hunter Education oldainass 603-536-1290 11 Hazen PT 2/275 #2 1,000
Center Drive
NH Fish & Game Business
Zac Curran
NEW HAMPTON 142 MAIN ST, NEW Office
Fish & Game HATCHERY PTON 603—744-::? 11 i PT 1/275 H 1,200
Concord. NH 03301
35 Center Street Caltiyn Polizos NH Liguor Commission
Liquor Commission Liquor Store #39 Clark Plaza * 603-230-7083 PO Box 503 #39 PT 1/275 #2 782
—Wolfeboro
NH EMERGENCY COMM. - 50
SAFETY EMERGENCY LACONIA - BUREAU 50 COMMUNICATIONS DR., u/G
COMMUNICATION OFFICE LACONIA PETE DENUTTE  271-6911 COMMUNICATIONS DR. PT H2 400
NH EMERGENCY COMM. - 50
SAFETY EMERGENCY LACONIA - BUREAU 50 COMMUNICATIONS DR., u/6
COMMUNICATION OFFICE LACONIA PETE DENUTTE  271-6911 COMMUNICATIONS DR. SER PT 1/3,000 "2 6,900
LACONIA, NH 03246
TILTON VETERANS
VETERANS HOME “tBACKUP |  WINTER STREET, TUTON e | RIS M | ) o ol 500
¢ 527-4452 WINTER ST TILTON, NH 03276 -
__USEONLY 1/12,000




U} ‘G = UNDERGROUND TANK PT = PEDAL TRUCK | TT = TRACTOR TRAILER
Legend:| Unlined Font = Tanks are U/G Bold Font = Double Underlined Font: Automatic Delivery, top off all tanks when Unlined Font = Have overfill alarms set at 90% of tank
& Require Pressure Delivery | Automatic Delivery delivering, requires separate delivery ticket for each tank ID capacity and requires automatic delivery
NH DEPT. OF ADMIN SERVICES,
DAS JAFFREY - PETERBOROUGH | 84 PETERBOROUGH SARAH LINEBERRY 856- BUREAU OF COURT FACILITIES 25
PT 5,500 2.3328
Courts Facilities DISTRICT COURT STREET, JAFFREY 5702 CAPITOL ST. ROOM 115 CONCORD, 15z 50 ”
—__NH 03301
395 OLD STREET NH DNCR - URBAN FORESTRY
DEPT. OF NATURAL & CULTURAL | SHEILING FOREST MCGREAL AJ DUPERE
5 5 650 2.3328
RESOURCES HOUSE b :OAD 4316774 ng‘:“a' 45 ELWYN RD. PT 1/27 0 328 |
- R B
DEPT. OF ?:‘AE;UO:'AL & CULTURAL | GREENFIELD STATE PARK 27 MAINTENANCE | ALEC WOOLLEY 892 NH DNCR, 172 PEMBROKE RD. GR-1 T 1/275 0 805 23328 )i
DEPT. OF NATURAL & CULTURAL FRANKLIN PIERCE y RTE31, ANDREW CUSHING NH DNQlé;n PEMBROKE RD. 1275 P 1,400 23328) dgos
DEPT. OF NATURAL & CULTURAL CHESTERFIELD GORGE 1823 ROUTE 9 CLARE JOYCE 856- NH DNCR, 172 PEMBROKE RD. Ps1 T 1/275 n 489 23328}
RESOURCES NATURAL AREA CHESTERFIELD 6305 CONCORD, NH 03301
520 OLD i
DEPT. OF NATURAL & CULTURAL CLARE JOYCE 856- NH DNCR, 172 PEMBROKE RD.
PISGAH ST. 1 PT 275 # 489 2.3328
RESOURCES ST. PARK CHEATERIELD RO 6305 CONCORD, NH 03301 . M i
NH DNCR - Fox Forest
309 Center Road Inge Seaboyer £
- - PT 1,250 2.3328
DNCR Hillsboro - Fox Forest Hillsboro 603 3453 PO Box 1175 F-2 1/275 2 ;
NH DNCR Businsess Office
Monadnock State Park 116 Poole Road Mary Shotton
5 2.33
DNCR Jaffrey Jaffrey 603-532-8862 lc:2 Pembroke Road MO-1 PT 1/27! 0 604 28 |
NH DOT District 4
DoT 565 Fitchburg Road Karen Buono )
5 # 500 2.3328
Highway Maintenance Srownville Patrol Shad Greenville 603-352-2302 s:z Baze Hl:: fosc 415 . v 2 §
NH DOT District 4
poT Route 123 Karen Buono I
# 900 2.3328)
inghway Malntenance Walpole Patrol Shed Walpole 603-352-2302 19 Base Hill Road 401A PT 1/275 2
NH DOT District 4
) ol Charlestown Patrol Shed | 187 Claremont Road Kaven fuiono 19 Base Hill Road 401 PT 1/275 " 900 2.3328
Highway Maintenance Charlestown 603-352-2302
NH DOT Di 4
istrict
pot Route 10 Karen Buono
Highway Maintenance Marlow Patrol Shed Mo 603-352-2302 19 Base Hill Road 403 PT 1/275 " 1,500 23328 |
679 West Main NH DOT District 4 i
poT Karen Buono % &
Highway Maintenance Hillsboro Patrol Shed ?tlee( 603-352-2302 19 Base Hill Road 404 PT 1/275 L7 700 23328}
sboro Swa
22 South Street NH DOT District 4 b
—— fzrmmm Stoddard Patrol Shed Route 9 ;’;g’;:‘;‘;’;‘; 19 Base Hill Road 407 PT 1/275 ” 950 23328
S NH 03446
poT 1247 Alstead Center KarenSiaono NH DOT District 4
Highway Maintenance Alstead Patrol Shed Road 603-352-2302 19 Base Hill Road 403-A PT 1/275 2 400 23328}
Alstead
NH DOT District 4
DboT 418 Route 101 Karen Buono
Highway Maintenance Temple Patrol Shed Temple 603-352-2302 519 Base Hill Road 414 PT 1/275 #2 700 2.3328
wanzey, NH 03446
NH DOT District 4
DOT #1972 Route 119 Karen Buono S
Rindge Patrol Sh: pabe
Highway Maintenance (e Rindge 603-352-2302 slz BaseT N ®> Fr vars " 1700 23328
Wa N
NH DOT District 4
poT Marlboro Patrol Shed 607 Dublin Road Karen Buono i
Highway Maintenance Route 101 Marlboro 603-352-2302 slBi Base Hil Road a2 pr yars " 2,000 23328
W
poT Marlboro Patrol Shed lmmnadnock Karen Buono Neipor D:Isltrm:
Highway Maintenance Route 12 way 603-352-2302 19 Base Hill Roa a1 PT 1275 2 1,200 23328
Marlboro Swan:
DOT 470 Ashuelot Main Karen Buono NH DOT District 4
Highway Malntenance Winchester Patrol Shed .Slrea( 603-352-2302 19 Base Hill Road 410 PT 1/275 2 1,500 2.3328
Wij Swanzey.
’ NH DOT District 4
poT 265 Sawmill Road Karen Buono
Highway Maintenance Greenfield Patrol Shad Greenfield 603-352-2302 sls Dese "':: R‘”ds 409 i v2rs " 1900 233
wa
DOoT Hancock Patrol Shed 83 Bennington Road Karen Buono N: boT Dilsllrlct A
Highway Maintenance Hancock 603-352-2302 19 6ase 8 Romd 408 PT 1215 " 800 23328}
NH DOT District 4
poT Route 12 Karen Buono
Highway Maintenance Westmoreland Patrol Shed Wactmoratsnd 603-352-2302 519 Base Hill Road 405 PT 1/275 " 1,500 23328
_Swanzey. NH 03446 _
NH FISH & GAME BUSINESS
KEENE REGION 4 OFFICE (on 15 ASHBROOK TERESA CLOUTIER 352-
FISH E
& GAM monthly basis) COURT KEENE 9669 OFFICE,11 HAZEN DR. CONCORD, Ko1 PT 1/275 0 1,050 2.3328
. NH Liquor Commission
2 . 1008 Route 9 Caitlyn Polizos
Liquor Commission Li Store #2
iq! s iquor Store West Chesterfield 603-230-7083 . PO Box 503 PT 3/275 #2 600 2.3328
oncord. NH 03301

A

Al

R
o

No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid



SAFETY-STATEPOUICE KEENETROGR € l 15 ASHBROOK JIM MINERY 419- | B&PA 33 HAZEN DRIVE CONCORD, l = | 1/1,000 I 0 | 1,500 5
| _COURT, KEENE, NH 9451 03305




UiG = UNDERGROUND TANK PT = PEDAL TRUCK | TT = TRACTOR TRAILER
Legend:| Unlined Font = Tanks are U/G & Bold Font = Double L d Font: Delivery, top off all tanks when rlined
it: Gravity D
delivering, reguires separate delivery ticket for each tank ID Undochnad For =
State Surplus
144 Clinton Street Jason Wright
1440 Street PT 1/275 # 1, 23328
DAS White Farm State Surplus Co 603-271-5655 inton /2 ,000
Concord, NH 03301
NH DOC I M: it 14
poc Concord Vocational Training 312 North State Street Debra Shepard pgs;:‘ l;r;zgemm oT 1275 n 748 2.3328 "f’
Building Trades Concord 603-271-3904 ” § i
oncord 1
NH DOC Fiscal Management
126 Lowell Street Josh Leonard
PT 1/275 .73 1,610 2.3328
poc Manchester Calumet House Manchester 603-271-1990 PO Box 1806 /2 U
DOC Fiscal Manage t E
Concord Probation & Parole 314 North State Street Jonathan Boisselle i o o - - - _ 5555
District Office Concord 603-271-5651 o ’
ncord, NH 03301
NH DEPT. OF ADMIN SERVICES,
DAS Hillsboro South County 30 Spring Steet BUREAU OF COURT FACILITIES
SA INEBERRY 856-5702 6JA02342 PT 1/275 #2 156 23328
Courts Facilities Superior Court Nashua RAH L 85 25 CAPITOL ST. ROOM 115 /
CONCORD, NH 03301
“ DAS CENTRAL FACILITIES
DEPT. OF ADMINISTRATIVE 1 GRANITE PLACE, CONCORD | SEAN MICHAUD 603-545- | BUREAU 25 CAPITOL STREET, 2.3328
SERVICES 1 GRANITE PLACE NH 2803 ROOM 408 CONCORD, NH T 1/10,000 #2 16,000
DEPT. OF BUSINESS & SUTTON REST AREA ROUTE 89 SOUTHBOUND LARRY LENDERMAN 100 NORTH MAIN ST. SUITE 544 PT 2/275 2 546 23328l
ECONOMIC AFF; SUTTON
DEPT. OF BUSINESS & LARRY LENDERMAN 100 NORTH MAIN ST. SUITE il
Y RES’ A 3 NORTH ERBURY 541 PT 1/500 # 345 23328 &
EC c RS CANTERBUR' T ARE 1-9: CANTH 573.6346 o /!
| ——LCONOMIC AFFAIRS 5
st g' s SALEM REST AREA 1-93 NORTH, SALEM "“";;"DE'""”' 200 NORTH NN SE.OUNE. | PT 2/275 w 1,006 2338 )
CI:JE:{TU OF I;ATURAL & FROST FARM 122 ROC RD, CUSHING NH DNCR, 172 PEM:ROKE RD. FF1 T 1/275 2 1,006 23328
| CULTURAL RESOURCES — _DERRY | = 2713238 |
Bear Brook Residence
Allenstown - Bear Brook 10 Podunk Road Christina Pacuk
DNCR Park Residence Aanatoum 603-892- 157 Deerfield Road7 PT 1/275 # 1,200
Allenstown, NH 03275 _
DEPT. OF NATURAL & 157 DEERFIELD RD, NH DNCR, 172 PEMBROKE RD. u/G
EAR DD P HEI -87: 3 2 1,006 2.332 .
CULTURAL RESOURCES o BROOK DDEM SHO! ALLENSTOWN SANCYHEISLER 227:8745 CONCORD, NH 03301 8- il 1/1 & g
HAUN BRESNAHAN &
CDUEFT. OF, N:TUR:L & BOSCAWEN, NURSERY 405 D.W HWY, BOSCAWEN b ;‘ :‘ DN, 172 PEM:.‘DKE 0. 184052 PT 1/275 # 1,500 23328 .
96-2323 |  CONCORD, NH 03301
249 PINEWOOD RD, NH DOT DISTRICT 5, 16 EAST
DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE ALLENSTOWN PATROL SHED 4 ALISSA VOS 485-9526 POINT DR. BEDFORD, NH 506 PT 1/1,000 L.7] 200
ALLENSTOWN
_03110
6 EAST POINT DRIVE NH DOT DISTRICT 5, 16 EAST
DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE BEDFORD PATROL SHED BEDFORD ALISSA VOS 485-9526 POINT DR. BEDFORD, NH 511 PT 2/275 " 100
03110
123 WEST ROAD, NH DOT DISTRICT 5, 16 EAST
DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE CANTERBURY CANTERBURY ! ALISSA VOS 485-9526 POINT DR. BEDFORD, NH 525 PT 1/1000 2 150
(3110
NH DOT DISTRICT 5, 16 EAST
DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE CHICHESTER PATROL SHED 36{DEERMEADOWRD, ALISSA VOS 485-9526 POINT DR. BEDFORD, NH PT 1/1000 #2 1,200
CHICHESTER
NH DOT DISTRICT 5, 16 EAST
)
DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE LONDONDERRY 469 MAMMOTH RD, ALISSA VOS 485-9526 POINT DR. BEDFORD, NH 512 PT 1/500 (.73 300
LONDONDERRY
03110
NH DOT DISTRICT 5, 16 EAST
DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE MILFORD 33 BUXTON ROAD, MILFORD | ALISSA VOS 485-9526 POINT DR. BEDFORD, NH 510 PT 1/330 " 150
03110
NH DOT DISTRICT 5, 16 EAST
DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE LONDONDERRY PATROL SHED (4 WEST ROAD LONDONDERRY | ALISSA VOS 485-9526 POINT DR. BEDFORD, NH 516 PT 1/1,000 #2 500
__03110
NH DOT DISTRICT 5, 16 EAST
DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE HENNIKER PATROL SHED 57 STATE SHED RD, HENNIKER| ALISSA VOS 485-9526 POINT DR. BEDFORD, NH PT 1/1,000 #2 1,200
03111
2 PETERS BROOK RD, NH DOT DISTRICT 5, 16 EAST
DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE HOOKSETT PATROL SHED HOOKSETT ALISSA VOS 485-9526 POINT DR. BEDFORD, NH 508 PT 1/ 1000 2 350
03110
NH DOT DISTRICT S, 16 EAST
DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE CANDIA PATROL SHED 376 OLD CANDIA RD, CANDIA| ALISSA VOS 485-9526 POINT DR. BEDFORD, NH 509 PT 1/1,000 H2 600
03110
NH DOT DISTRICT 5, 16 EAST
DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE WARNER "35" 35 WARNER ROAD WARNER | ALISSA VOS 485-9526 POINT DR. BEDFORD, NH 526 PT 1/1000 2 1,500 2.3328
03110
NH DOT DISTRICT 5, 16 EAST
DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE WARNER "103" 186 ROUTE 103 WARNER ALISSA VOS 485-9526 POINT DR. BEDFORD, NH 501 PT 2/275 L.23 500 2.3328)
03110
NH DOT DISTRICT 5, 16 EAST
DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE BOW PATROL SHED 1266 RT. 3A, BOW ALISSA VOS 485-9526 POINT DR. BEDFORD, NH 5058 PT 1/1,000 #2 500 2.3328
03110

0.9900 No Bid
0.9900 No Bid
0.9900 0.5500
0.9900 No Bid
0.9900 No Bid
0.9900 No Bid
0.9900 No Bid
0.9900 No Bid
0.9900 No Bid
0.9900 No Bid
0.9900 No Bid
0.9900 No Bid
0.9900 No Bid
0.9900 No Bid
0.9900 No Bid
0.9900 No Bid
0.9900 No Bid
0.9900 No Bid
0.9900 No Bid
0.9900 No Bid
0.9900 No Bid
0.9900 0.7500
0.9900 No Bid
0.9900 No Bid
0.9900 No Bid
0.9900 No Bid




NH DOT DISTRICT 5, 16 EAST

DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE |  GOFFSTOWN PATROL SHED = CG';:::;'OSW' NEET' ALISSAVOS ~ 485-9526 |  POINT DR. BEDFORD, NH 507 PT 2275 " 1,300
—
NH DOT DISTRICT 5, 16 EAST
DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE HOLLIS PATROL SHED 224 DEPOTRD, HOLLIS [ ALISSAVOS 4859526 |  POINT DR. BEDFORD, NH 515 pr | 11000 | w2 2,000
__03110
NH DOT DISTRICT 5, 16 EAST
DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE CHESTER PATROL SHED 825 RAYMOND RD CHESTER | ALISSAVOS ~ 485-9526 |  POINT DR. BEDFORD, NH | 513C eT 2275 " 500
NH DOT DISTRICT 5, 16 EAST
,
DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE DERRY BRINE BLDG SOKENDALLPONDRD |\ \ccavos 4859526 |  POINTDR.BEDFORD,NH | 528.8 PT 1275 " 550
DERRY
DOT Turnpikes
oot Mssiimack Sodte 30W tietpey Thnottey Stawvatt NH|>o Bex 2950 12 PT 13000 | 2 4,200
Turnpikes Maintenance Merrimack 603-485-3806 ! -
Bot MeseiasackTdy Eﬁ:::?r:rnb;:d Timothy Stewart N"pm"g::’ ’ 35 ™ y/e " 10,250
Turnpikes IND. Toll ey 603-485-3806 1/8,000 "
Dot Hooksett Toll 1-93 Northbound Timothy Stewart NNP?B‘::‘Z’;SO 2 T u/G n 3750
Turnpikes Side Road Hooksett 603-485-3806 1/3,000 .
__Concord, NH03302
NH FISH & GAME BUSINESS
FISH & GAME MILFORD FisH HATCHERY | 86 N: mv:a:‘zn, MILFORD | 1\/ERESA ROGERS 673-1416|  OFFICE11 HAZEN DR, mo1 Pt | 14000 | 5,000
NH FISH & GAME BUSINESS
FISH & GAME MILFORD FisH HATCHERY | P08 N- '""ﬂ‘“:"' MILFORD, |. THERESA “musms s OFFICE,11 HAZEN DR. mo2 T 1275 w” 1,100
CONCORD, NH 03301
NH FISH & GAME BUSINESS
FISH & GAME MILFORD FiSH HATCHERY | 364 N-RWV E“":‘D' MUFORD, || TIHERESA l'w‘ uems 673 OFFICE,11 HAZEN DR. mo3 PT 17275 " 1,100
__CONCORD, NH 03301
SAFETY STATE POLICE WINDHAM WEIGH STATIONS |  1-93 N& S, WINDHAM, NH | M MINERY 358- | - BAPA2S HAZEN DRIVE PT 20275 | . m 900

3333




U}G = UNDERGROUND TANK PT = PEDAL TRUCK | TT = TRACTOR TRAILER
Legend:| Unlined Font = Tanks are U/G & | Bold Font = Double Underlined Font: Delivery, top off all tanks when delivering, requires | Underlined Font: Complex has 1 fill location with 2
uire Pre arate delivery ticket for each tank ID filler to su all buil
DEPT. OF BUSINESS & LARRY LENDERMAN | 100 NORTH MAIN ST. SUITE 100
pes SEABROOK REST AREA 1-95 NB, SEABROOK . 15 T 2/275 " 3519 2.3328 0.9900 0.5500
OF NAT Ll = Y : o
OEPTOFMATURALE CULTURAL|  pgaw romestay R ELNMRE A | centen, as ELWN RO, urc e | s | m 2450 23328 m
RESOURCES PORTSMOUTH 431-6774 0.9900 | § 0.5000
DEPT. OF NATURAL & CULTURAL WENTWORTH COOLIDGE 397 LITTLE HARBOR RD|  ANDREW CUSHING NH DNCR, 172 PEMBROKE RD. We-1 oT 1/275 n 500 23328f .
PORTSMOUTH 2713 ORD, 1 v 09900|$ 05000 |
DEPT. OF NATURAL & CULTURAL WENTWORTH COOLIDGE 397 LITTLE HARBORRD|  ANDREW CUSHING | NH DNCR, 172 PEMBROKE RD. I - 1275 0 500 233288 ¥
MANSION PORTSMOUTH 2713 CONCORD, NH 03301 099001 %  0.5000
DEPT. OF NATURAL & CULTURAL WENTWORTH COOLIDGE 397 LITTLE HARBORRD|  ANDREW CUSHING | NH DNCR, 172 PEMBROKE RD. We3 oF 1275 0 %00 2.332 R
RESOURCE! MANSION PORTSMOUTH 271-32 CON NH 03301 09900 |5 05000 |
DEPT. OF NATURAL & CULTURAL WENTWORTH COOLIDGE 397 LITTLE HARBOR RD|  ANDREW CUSHING | NH DNCR, 172 PEMBROKE RD. B3
wC-4 PT 1/275 L 500 23328}
RESOURCES PORTSMOUTH _271-3 CONCORD, NH 03301 / 09900 |5 05000 |
DEPT. OF NATURAL & CULTURAL WENTWORTH COOLIDGE 397 LITTLE HARBOR RD|  ANDREW CUSHING NH DNCR, 172 PEMBROKE RD.
2 -5 PT 275 7] 500 23328
RESOURCI PORTSMOUTH 27132 CONCORD, NH 03301 we v 09900 |$ 05000 |
DEPT. OF NATURAL & CULTURAL WENTWORTH COOLIDGE 397 LITTLE HARBOR RD|  ANDREW CUSHING | NH DNCR, 172 PEMBROKE RD.
g . 2.3,
RESOUR MANSION PORTSMOUTH 271-3 CONCORD, NH 03: We:s T Vars s 500 el 0990 (S5 05000 |
DEPT. OF NATURAL & CULTURAL [WENTWORTH MANSION VISITORS| 375 LITTLE HARBOR | ANDREW CUSHING | NH DNCR, 172 PEMBROKE RD. 1275 i Lo 23328 8
RESOURCES CENTER RD PORTSMOUTH -3 | CONCORD, NH 03301 _ ¥ : 09900 [$ 05000 |
DEPT. OF NATURAL & CULTURAL BRIAN PARISE 227- NH DNCR, 172 PEMBROKE RD. g
- 7 5 .3328 |
RESORACES ODIORNE POINT HOMESTEAD | 505 OCEAN BLVD, RYE e B ki giaot OH-1 PT 1/275 0 1,03 2.33. 0.9900 0.5500
DEPT. OF NATURAL & CULTURAL 920 OCEAN BLVD | BRIAN PARISE 227-| NH DNCR, 172 PEMBROKE RD.
REROKIHE NORTH BEACH BATHROOMS o emintie 714 i NH-1 PT U/G 1/550 #2 1,173 23328 0.9900 0.5500
DEPT. OF NATURAL & CULTURAL 128 MTN RO, DAVID RICHARDSON | NH DNCR, 172 PEMBROKE RD.
T - £ 5 - PT 1 035 .33
Gteotincee PAWTUCKAWAY MAINTENANCE-1 NG 8355081 CONGORD Nl 0 PW-1 /275 [2] 1 23328 0.9900 0.6500
Aaron Stuart (w) 603- . .
HAMPSTEAD HOSPITAL (STANDBY 218 East Rd. 218 East Rd Hampstead, NH Site 1D:198 70301 3 Facility y
DHHS 329-5311 (cell) 603-724- ; T 1/6000 1] 12,700 23328)
ALONE OUTSIDE TANK) Hampstead, NH 03841 03841 1D:000 1371 i 09900 | 0.6500
BARBARASILVA | NH DOT DISTRICT 6, PO BOX 740
DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE LEE PATROL SHED 65 PINKHAM RD, LEE 5 i e 605 PT 1/2,000 #2 1,100 23328 0900 | s 0.6500
50 GERRISH RD, SILV) DOT D 740 %
DOVER PATROL SHED 606 2/2 . ? s
DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE DOVER PA SHED e =3 606 PT 75 # 1,650 23328 0.9900 0.6500
61 DOW LANE, N. BARBARA SILVA NH DOT DISTRICT 6, PO BOX 740 A5l
z L i ¢
DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE | RYE / N.HAMPTON PATROL SHED s sy o o 610 PT 1/1,000 # 950 23328) 0.9900 0.5500
245 WHITE MTN HWY, | BARBARASILVA [ NH DOT DISTRICT 6, PO BOX 740
DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE MILTON PATROL SHED s P = 601 PT 2/275 # 1,300 2.3328 0.9900 | s 05500
25 CEMETERY RD, BARBARASILVA | NH DOT DISTRICT 6, PO BOX 740
Ti E GONIC PATROL SHED 1/, i
DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCS IC PATROL SHi = Dlaniasa = 603 PT 000 0 1,000 2.3328 0.9900 | s 0.7000
1ST NH TURNPIKE, Box| ~ BARBARASILVA  |NH Ri BOX 7
DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE ( NORTHWOOD PATROL SHED 1 ey 2 = & 604 PT 2/275 1,550 2.3328
868-1133 DURHAM, NH 03824-0740 i 0.9900 0.7000
LVA | NH DOT DI 2 i
EPPING PATROL SHED 73 COFFIN RD, EPPING E %
T HIGHWAY C EPPING PATROL 3 C - e pe 608 PT 2/275 700 2.3328 0.9900 0.5500
DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE NEWFIELDS PATROL SHED #1108 420 cotLeae SARRARASAYA, | NP D:T DESTRIC & 0 m;x L 609 PT 1/1,000 (7] 800 2.3328 0.9900 0.5500
253 EPPING RD, BARBARA SILVA NH DOT DISTRICT 6, PO BOX 740
DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE EXETER PATROL SHED 607 PT 1/1,000 (7] 1,500 23328 69000 08300
143 SOUTH DISTRI
DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE | NORTH HAMPTON PATROL SHED | 243 Ror SARBARASILVA. ~ | W DOTDESTRICT &, PO . 612 et | 11,000 1,200 2.3328) a 05500
.HAMPTON | .9900 .
35 Newton Junction BARBARASILVA | NH DOT DISTRICT 6, PO BOX 740 2
DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE KINGSTON PATROL SHED . ;
oo 33 40 613 PT 1/1,000 #2 11,700 2.3328 0.9900 0.5500
KINGSTON MILL ROAD PATROL BARBARASILVA [ NH DOT DISTRICT 6, PO BOX 740
DOT HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE 65 MILL RD, KINGSTON 2 £
oy pop 611 PT 1/1,000 # 1,700 2.3328 0.9900 05500
NH DOT MECHANICAL SERVICES,
DOT MECHANICAL SERVICES NO. HAMPTON SATELLITE 1:‘7::::?;: i A BUR%‘;;CO 941" po Box 483 CONCORD, NH "7 L " /‘;/:oo #2 3,220 2.3328
= 03301 X 0.9900 0.5500
poT Hampton Toll +95 Norttibound Timothy Stewart NH DOT Turnpikes 5
Turnpikes Ramp B2 603-485-3806 PO Box 2950 42 PT 1/5,000 #2 10,800 23328
Hampton Concs 0.9900 0.5500
NH DOT Turnpikes
DoT Hampton Toll 1-95 Northbound Timothy Stewart
: PO Box 2950 41 TT 1/10,000 #2 15,300 2.3328
T -485- X %
urnpikes Main Road Hampton 603-485-3806 Coa p 0.9900 0.5500
NH DOT Turnpikes
pot Hampton Toll 1-95 Southbound Timothy Stewart
" PO Box 2950 25 PT 1/5,000 H2 5,600 2.3328
Turnpikes Maintenance Hampton 603-485-3806 Eanioed 3 0.9900 0.5500
NH Fish & Game Business Office
Gi | t
Fish & Game resniand Grant Bay 60 Dapot Road Cory Riley 11 Hazen Drive s01 PT 1275 " 700 23328
Depot House Greenland 603-868-1095<ns1:XMLFault xmlns:ns1="http://cxf.apache.org/bindings/xformat"><ns1:faultstring xmlns:ns1="http://cxf.apache.org/bindings/xformat">java.lang.OutOfMemoryError: Java heap space</ns1:faultstring></ns1:XMLFault>