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- State of New Hampshire

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES
25 Capitol Street
Concord, New Hampshire 03301
(603) 271-3201 | Office®@das.nh.gov

. Catherine A, Keane
Charles M. Arlinghaus Deputy Commissioner
Commissioner

Sheri L. Rockburn
Assistant Commissioner

May 30, 2025

Her Excellency, Governor Kelly A. Ayotte

and the Honorable Council
State House ,
Concord, New Hampshire 03301

REQUESTED ACTION

Authorize the Department of Administrative Services to enter into a contract with
Monadnock Commercial Building Company, LLC (VC#277107), Jaffrey, NH in the amount of
$1,712,963.00 for Carpentry Services with the option to renew for up to an additional two-year
period, effective upon Governor and Council approval through May 31, 2030.

Funding shall be provided through individual agency expenditures, none of which shall
be permitted unless there are sufficient appropriated funds to cover the expenditure.

EXPLANATION

The Department of Administrative Services (DAS), through the Bureau of Purchase and
Property (BoPP) issued request for bid (RFB) 3009-25 on February 19, 2025, with responses due
on March 12, 2025. This RFB was issued to create a new contract for carpentry services serving
all ten (10) State of NH counties. The RFB reached three-hundred and thirty-five (335) vendors
through the NIGP registry and directly sourced. There were eight (8) compliant responses
received for this multi-award contract with Monadnock Commercial Building Company, LLC
submitting competitive pricing for carpentry services in six (6) counties with approximately one-
hundred and forty-eight (148) buildings.

It is the Department’s intent to enter into a contract with cach of the eight (8) contractors
who submitted compliant responses. When an agency wishes to use this service, that agency will
develop a scope of work (SOW) and request a quote from each of the contractors. Each SOW
will detail various requirements related to the services requested, planning, and implementation
of new projects. The project engagement will be awarded to the lowest-cost, qualified quote who
has availability to meet the project timeline. The eight (8) contractors upon approval will be
Monadnock Commercial Building Company, LLC, D.L. King & Associates, Inc., Covered
Bridge Outdoor Construction Corp., Integrated-Builders Incorporated, Kritos & Son’s Property
Services LLC, Skovic Construction, Tibbetts Construction LLC, and Triple Construction, LLC.



Her Excel]ency, Governor Kelly A. Ayotte
and the Honorable Council
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This is a new contract with no historical spend. The price limitation is based on the
estimated annual spend of $500,000.00 for all New Hampshire counties. This figure was divided
by the number of buildings in each county then multiplied by the five-year term of the contract to
arrive at a price limit per county. Each contractor’s price limitation is based on the projected
spend for each county bid. Since requests for quotes (RFQs) will be issued to each contractor
prior to project engagement, forecasting which contractors will receive projects is not possible at
this time. Therefore, each contractor has been awarded a price limitation that will provide cost
coverage for all projects, should that be the outcome of the RFQ process.

Contract financials .
Sullivan County — 4 buildings $9,259.26
Strafford County — 30 Buildings $69,444.44
Cheshire County — 5 buildings $11,574.07
Hillsborough County — 7 buildings $16.,203.70
Rockingham County — 28 buildings $64,814.81
Merrimack County — 74 buildings $171,296.32
Estimated annual spend $342,592.60
Estimated 5-year term spend $1,712,963.00
Price limitation $1,712,963.00

" Based on the foregoing, I am respectfully recommendmg approval of the contract with
Monadnock Commercial Building Company, LLC.

Respectfully submitted,

(.- A

Charles M. Arlinghaus
Commissioner

TDD ACCESS: RELAY. NH 1-800-735-2964



Division of Procurement Support Services
Bureau of Purchase Property

RFB Bid Summary

Bid Description Carpentry Projects Under $25,000 Apgency Statewide
RFB# 3009-25 Requisition#
Agent Name, Steven Burgess Bid Closing 3/19/2025 10:00 AM
Lniicates Award: [ . .
: COOS COUNTY i e "JCwér_e:ﬁ;Bridg_e L DLng ‘ ‘Il“liégl:at'e,drlliii;l'dé_ . _ Kritos and Sins -
Carpenter/Lead| ="~ $200.00 U $166:00 .. No Bid No Bid
Helper| -+...$175.00 -, 8137.00 o No Bid No Bid
GRAFTON COUNTY _
Carpenter/Lead| - -. $175.00 . $15000° No Bid St $64.00 7
Helper| -~ : - '$100.00 - $127.00 . No Bid 850,00 .
CARROLL COUNTY
Carpenter/Lead| . .S175.00 o 8150700 No Bid . . $64.00 . . ...
Helper|'" " '/'$100.00_ T US127.00. . - No Bid o $50.,00
BELKNAP COUNTY
Carpenter/Lead §173.00 - .§80.00. $64.00
Helper| - . _$100.00 $70.00 "~ .- ~ $50.00
SULLIVAN COUNTY '
Carpenter/Lead| ™ > - §175.00 . $125.00 No Bid e v §6400, L
Helper| . .= s10000 - US110.00. No Bid 7 85000
STRAFFORD COUNTY
Carpenter/Lead| .~ . $175.00 ‘ _ $80.00 . 864:00.
Helper| ™ ~ $100.00, - $70.00 $2-850.00 -
CHESHIRE COUNTY
Carpenter/Lead|“/". $250.00 . - $125.00 - $80.00 - " EGc - §73.00
Helper| .. $125.00 . '$110.00. " $70.00 . . $55.00. .
HILLSBOROUGH COUNTY
Carpenter/Lead|. > $115.00. . s T s60.007 - 64,00 .
Helper| . - 7 -§70.00 . ' ' $56.00 * $50.00
ROCKINGHAM COUNTY
Carpenter/Lead| ., $116.00 ~ $60.00 $64.00
Helper| ... . - $70.00 ! - $56.00 =< v $50.00
MERRIMACK COUNTY
Carpenter/Lead|. - S11500 . © $115.00 $60.00. $64.00
Helper|- §70.00 $100.00 $56.00 . . $50.00

Gary S. Lunetta
Director
(603) 271-2201
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Division of Procurement Support Services Giry 8. Lunetta
Bureau of Purchase Property Director
(603) 271-2201

RFB Bid Summary

?:dqnadnof:l{ . i "| Tibbets Construction. | Triple Cohsfru_s;tion Westway Consirﬁcﬁbn
_Commercial S N T R e
No Bid No'Bid ] No Bid Non-Compliant
No Bid No Bid ~ No Bid
No Bid No Bid $75.00
No Bid No Bid __ §50.00
No Bid No Bid No Bid C- 812612
No Bid No Bid No Bid s 10526
No Bid No Bid *'$75.00 | $126.12
No Bid NoBid : $50.00 T 810526
i_sig‘_s.oo . No Bid . 871500 - | - s12612
- $75.00 No Bid _$50.00 | . 810526
______ Co$9580 | $62:00° . No Bid
187500 $52.00 - No Bid
v $95,00° No Bid No Bid . 812612
L §75.00 No Bid No Bid '§105.26
o 89500 - No Bid L i8T78.00 .
- $75.00° No Bid < %50,00
%95.00. - $62.00 No Bid ]
87500 - | $52.00 .0 No Bid P
89500 No Bid = $75.00 o $12612
$75.00 . No Bid O $50.00 $105.26
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Division of Procurement Support Services
Bureau of Purchase Property

RFB Bid Summary

Recommendation Summary

Statewide Contract or Amendment Statewide
Term of Contract . Five Years
Price Limitation $1,712,963.00
Number of Solicitations Received 3
Number of Sourced bidders 335
Number of non-responsive bidders 327
P-37 Checklist Complete Yes
D&B Report Attached ' N/A
Confirmed Vendor is not debarred or suspended {Sam.gov) N/A
Method of Payment (P-card/ACH) Both
FOB Delivered Yes

Special Notes: Multi-Award contract. Eight (8) contractors will be awarded a contract; D.L, King & Associates, Inc., Covered
Bridge Outdeor Construction Corp., Integrated-Builders Incorporated, Kritos & Son’s Property Services LLC, Monadnock
Commercial Building Company, LLC, Skovic Construction, Tibbetts Construction LLC, and Triple Construction, LLC.

Gary S. Lunetta
Director
(603) 271-2201
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2. SERVICES TO BE PERFORMED. The State of New
‘Hampshire, acting” through the agency identified in block 1.1

(“State”), engages coritractor identified in block 1.3 (“Contractor”
to perform, and the Contractor shall perform, the work or sale of
goods, or both, identified and more particularly described. in ‘the
attached EXHIBIT B. which is incorporated hercin. by reference
(“Services™.

3. EFFECTIVE DATE/COMPLETION OF SERVICES.
3.1 Notwitlistanding any provision of this Agreement to the
contrary, -and subject to the approval of the Govemor and

Exccutive Couneil of the State of New Hampshire, if applicable,

this Agreement, and all obligations of the parties herevnder, shall
become effective on the date the Governor and Executjve Council
approve this Agreement, unless-no such approval is required, in
which case the Agreement shall become effective an the date the
Agreement is signed by the State Agency as shown in block 1,13
(“Effective Date™).

3.2 If the Contra¢tor commences the Services priof to the Effective
Date, all Services performed by the Contractor prior to the
Effective Date shall be performed at the sole risk of the Contractor,
and in the everit that this A greement does not become effective, the
State shall have fo. liability to. the "Contractor, including without
limitation, any -obligation to pay'the Contractor for any -costs
incurred or Services performed.

3.3 Contractor must complete all Services by the Completion Date
specified in block 17,

4. CONDITIONAL NATURE OF AGREEMENT,
Nomiﬂ;staﬁding-‘any provision of this Agreemient-to the contrary,
all obligations of the State hereunder, including, without limitation,
the continuance of payments hereunder, are contingent upon the
availability and continued appropriation of funds. In no event shall
the State be liable for any payments hereunder in excess of such
available appropriated funds. In the event of a reduction or
termination of appropriated finds by any state or federal legislative
or executive action: that reduces, eliminates or otherwise modifics
the approptiation or availability of funding for this Agreement and
the Scope for Services provided in EXHIBIT B, in whole or iri part,
the State shall have the right to-withhold paymert until such funds
become available, if ever, and shall have the right-to reduce or
terminate the Services under this Agrcement immediately upon
giving the Contractor notice of such reduction or termination, The
State shall nat be required to transfer funds from any other account
or source to the Account identified in block 1.6 in the event funds
in that Account are reduced or unavailable.

5. CONTRACT PRICE/PRICE LIMITATION/ PAYMENT.
5.1 The contract price, method of payment; and terms of payment
are identified and more particularly described in EXHIBIT C
which is incorporated herein by reference,

5.2 Nowithstanding any provision in this Agreement to the
contrary, and notwithistanding unexpected circumstances, in no
event shall the total of all payments authorized, or actually made
hereunder, exceed the Price Limitation set forth in block 1.8. The
payment by the State of the contract price shall be the.only and the
complete reimbursement to the Contractor for all expenses, of
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whatever nature incurred by the Contracter in the performance
hereof and shall be the only and the complete coripensation to-the
Contractor for the Services. -

5.3 The State reserves the right to offset from any amounts
otherwise payable to- the Contractor unider this Agreement those
liquidated amounts. required or permittéd by N.H. RSA 80:7
through RSA 80:7-c or any other provision of law.

5.4 The State's. liability under this Agreemeént shall be limited to
monetary damagesnot-to exceed the'total fees paid. The Contractor
agrees that it has an adequate remedy at law for any breach of this
Agreement by the State.and hereby waives any right to specific
performance or other equitable remedies agamst the State,

6. COMPLIANCE BY CONTRACTOR WITH LAWS AND
REGULATIONS/EQUAL EMPLOYMENT
OTPORTUNITY.

6.1 In connection with the performance of the Services, the

‘Contractor shall comply with all applicable statutes, laws,

regulations, and orders of .federal, state, county or municipal

authorities which impose any abligation or duty upon the

Contractor, including, ‘but not limited. to, civil rights and equal
emplayment opportunity laws and the Governor’s arder on Respect
and Civility in the Workplace, Executive order 2020-01, [n
addition, if this Agreément is funded in any part by monijes of the
United States, the Contractor shall comply with all feéderal
eXceutive orders, rules, regulations and statutes, and with any rules,
regulations. and guidelines as. the State or the United States issue to
implement these regulations. The Contractor shall also comply
with all applicable intellectual property laws.

6.2 During the term of thig Agrecment, the Contractor shall not
discriminate against employees or applicants for employment
because of age, sex, sekual orientation, face, color, marital status,
physical or niental disability, religious ‘creed, national: origin,
gender identity, or gender expression, and will take affirmative
action to prevent such discrimination, unless ‘exempt by state or
federal law, The Contractor 'shail ensure. any subcontragtors
comply with these nondisctimination requirements.

6.3 No payments or transfers.of value by Contractor or jts
representatives in connection with this Agreement have or.shall be
made which have the purpose ‘or effect of public or commercial
bribery, or acceptance of or‘aequiescence in extortion, kickbacks,
or other unlawful or improper méans of obtaining business. '
6.4. The Contractor agrees to permit the State or United States
access to any of the Contfactor’s hooks, records and accounts for
the purpose of ascertaining conipliance with this Agreement and
all rules, regulations and orders pertaining to the covenants, ternis
and conditions of this Agreernent.

7. PERSONNEL.
7.1 The Contractor shall at its own expense. provide all personpel
ngcessary {o perform the, Services, The Contractor wartants that all

Personne] engaged in the Services shall be qualified to perform the:

Servicesand shall be properly licensed.and otherwise authofized to
do 50 under all applicable laws.

7.2 The Contracting Officer specified in block 1.9, or any
successor, shall be the State’s point of contact pertaining to this

Agreement,
Contractor Initial;é‘y’ {;
.- Date Z ’@[254



8. EVENT OF DEFAULT/REMEDIES.

8.1 Any one or more of the follewing acts or omissions of the
Contractor shall constitute an event of default. hereunder (“Event
of Default™);

8.1.1 failure to perform the Services. satisfactorily or on scheditle;
8.1.2 fathure to submit any report required hereunder; andfor

8.1.3 failure-to perform any other covenant, term or condition of
thig Agreement.

8.2 Upon the occurrence of any Event of Default, ihe State may
take any one, or more, or all, of the-following actions:

8.2.1 give the Contractor a written tiotice specifying the Event of
Default and requiring it to be remedied within, in the absence of a
greater or lesser specification of time, thirty (30) calendar days
from the date of the notice; and if the Event of Default is not timely
cured, terminate this Agreement, effective two (2) calendar days
after giving the Contractor notice of termination;,

8.2.2 give the Contractor a written notice specifying the Event of
Default and suspending’ all payments to be made under this
Agreementand ordering that the portion of'thé contract price whigch
would otherwise-accrue to the Contractor during the period from
the-date of such notice until such time as the State determines that
the Cositractor has cured the Event of Default shall never be. paid
to the Contractor;

8.2.3 give the Contractor a-written notice specifying the Event of
Default and set off against any other obligations the State may owe
to-the Contractor any damages the State suffers by reason of any
Event of Default; and/or

8:2.4 give the Contractor a ‘written notice specifying the Event of
Default, treat the Agreement as breached, terminate the Agreement
and puisue any of its-remedies atlaw of in equity, or both.

5. TERMINATION.

9.1 Notwithstanding paragraph 8, the Stat¢ may; at its sole
discretion, terminate the Agreement for any reason, in whole or in
part, by thirty (30) calendar days written notice 1o the Contractor
that the State is exercising its option to terminaie the Agreement.
9.2 In the event of an early termination of this Agreement forany
reason othiér than the completion of the Services, the Contractor
shall; at the State’s discretion, deliver to the Contracting Officer,
not later than fifteen (i5) calendar -days after. the date of
terptindtion, a report: (“Termination Report”) describing in detail
all Services performed, and the contract price earhed, to and
including the date of termination. In addition, :at the Stale’s
discretion, the Contractor shall, within fifteen (15) calendar days
of notice of early termination, develap and submit té the State a
transition plan for Services under the A greement,

10. PROPERTY OWNERSHIP/DISCLOSURE.

10.1 As used in this Agreement, the word “Property” shall mean
all data, information and things developed or obtainéd during the
performance of, or Acquired or developed by reéason of, this
. Agreement, including; butnot limited to, all studies, reports, files,
formulae; survéys, maps, charts, sound fecordings, video
recordings, pictorial reproductions, drawings, analyses, graphic
representations, computer programs, computer printouts, notes,
letters, memoranda, papers, and documents, all whether finished or
unfinished.
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10.2 All data and any Property which has beén received from the
State, or purchased with funds provided for that purpose under this
Agreement, shall be the property of the State, and shall be returned
to the State upon demand or'upon termination of this Agreement
for any reason.

10.3 Disclosure of data, information and other records shall be
governed by N.H. RSA chapter 91-A and/or otlier applicable law.
Disclosure requires prior written approval of the State.

11, CONTRACTOR*S RELATION TO THE STATE: In the
performance of this Agreement the Contractor is in all respects an
independent contractor, and is neither an agent nor an employee of
the State. Neither the Contractor norany of its officers, employees,
agents or members shall have authority to bind the State-or receive
any benefits, waorkers’ compensation or dther emoluments
provided by the State to its employeés,

12, ASSIGI\WENTIDELEGATIQNISUBCONTRACTS.

12.1 Contractor shall provide the State written notice at least fifteen
(15) calendar days before any proposed assignment, delegation, o
other transfer of any interest in this Agreement. No -such
assignment, delegation, or other transfer shall be effective without
the written consent of the State.

-12.2 For purposes of paragraph 12, a Change of Control shall

constitute assignment. “Change of Control” means (a) merger,
consolidation, of a transaction or series of related transactions in
which a third party, together with its affiliates, becomes thie direct
or indirect owner of fifty percent (50%) or more of the voting:
shares or similar equity intercsts, of combined voting power of the’
Contractor, or (b) the.sale of all ot substantially afl of the assets of
the Contractor.

12.3 None of the Services shall be subcontracted by the Contractor
withont prior written notice and'consent of the State,.

12.4 The State is entitled to copies of all subcontracts and
assignment agreements and shall not be bound by any provisions
contained in a subcontract or an assi griment agreement to which it
is not a party.

13. INDEMNIFICATION. The Contractor shall indemnify;
defénd, and hold harmless the State, its officers, and employees
from and against all actions, claims, damages, demands,
judgments, fincs, Habilities, losses, and other expenses, including,
without limitation, reasonable attorneys’® fees, atising out of or
relating to this Agreement dircetly or indirectly arising from death,
persomal injury, property damage, infellectuil property
infringement, or other claims asserted against the Siate, its officers,
or employces caused by the acts or omissicns of negligence,
reckless or willful misconduct, or fraud by the. Contractor, its
einployees, agents, or subcontraciors. The State shall not be liable:
for any costs incurred by, the Contractor atising under this
paragraph 13. Notwithstanding the foregoing, nothing. herein
contained shall be deemed to constitute a waiver of the State’s
sovereign immunity, which immunity is hereby resérved to. the
State. This covenant in paragraph 13 shall survive the fermination
of this Agreement.

14. INSURANCE.




14,1 The Contractor shall, -at. its sole expense, obtain and
contintously maintain ut:foreé, and shall require any subcontractor

or assignee to ‘obtain and. Maintein in force, the following

Insurance:,
J4.L1 commercial

bodily-injury,,deaz_h-qrpfaperty'damagg,;'inamqwgs-ofndt‘Iéss:ttzan
$1,000,000 per occurrence. afid $2,000,000- aggregate or excess;.
dnd

14.1.2 special causc of 1038 Coverage form covering all Praperty
subject to. subparagraph 10.2 Herein; in an amount not less’ than
80%.0f the whole replacemeitt valie of the Property,

14,2 The policics,désﬁzribéd'in-subparagraph- 14:1 heiein shall be.on
policy forms. and endorsements approved for use i the-State. of
New Hampshire by the N.H. Depariment of Ihsurance, and jssued
by instirers licensed in. the. State of New Hampshire.

14.3 The Contractor shall furnish to the Conttacting. Officer
identified. in block 19, or any successor, a certificate(s) -of
insurance for-all insurqngc_; required under. this Agreenient, At the.
request of the Contracting Officer, or anysuccessor, thé Contractor
'shall provide ceriificate(s) of insurance for all renewal(s) of
insurance required: under this, Agreement, The- cefiiﬁcat‘c(s) of
insurance and. any: renéwals, thereof shall be -attached: and. are
incorporated herein by refereice.

15" WORKERS’ COMPENSATION.

15.1 By signing this agreément, the Contractor agrees, certifiesand
warrants that the Contractor. s in Gompliance with or exempt;from,
the. reqairements of 'NH. RSA chapter 281-A (“Workers’
Compensaiion™), .

13.2. To the extent the Coniractor is-subject to the fequirements of
NH. RSA chapter 281 -A, Contractor-shall maintain, and féguire
any subdotiteactor or assignee to secure:and maintain, payment. of
Workers” Compensation in conriection with activities which the
person proposes to undertake pursuant to this Agreement. The
Contractor shall fornish the Contracting Officer identified in'block
1.9, ‘ot any ‘successor,. proof of Workers® ‘Compensation. in the
manner described in N.H..RSA chapter 281-A and any applicable
rénéwal(s) thereof, which shall be attached and arc incorporatcd
hérein by reference. The:State'shall notbe responsible:for paymicnt
ofany Workers' Compeisation premiums or for any other claim or
benefit for Contractor, or any subcontractor or employed -of
Cohtractor, which. might arise under applicable State. of New
Hampshiré: Workers® Compensation taws in cannection- with the
performance of the-Services undef this Agtecment,

16, WAIVER OF BREACH. A State's failure to enforce ifs rights

with respect.to any single or continuing breach of this Agreement’

shall not dct as a waiver of the rightof the State to later enforce any
such rights orto enforce any-other or any subsequent breach,

17. NOTICE. Any notice by a party hereto to the other party shall

by ‘deeied to have been duly delivered of given at the time of"

mailing by certified mail, postage-prepaid, in a United: States Post:
Offiée addressed to the parties.ut the addrésses given in blocks 1.2
and: 1.4, heréin,
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general fability insurance against ail claims of °

“reforerice. putposes only,

18, AMENDMENT. This Agreement may:be amerided, ‘waived or
discharged only:by. ap, instrument in-writing signed by the parties.
hereta’ and. orily after approval of such amendment, waiver ot
discharge by the Governor-and Execittive Conncil of the Siate of
New Hamipshiie unless' no. such approval is required under the

‘circamstances frsuant to State liw, tls or policy,

19. CHOICE OF LAW AND FORUM,

19.1 This Agreecnient shall- be:governéd, interpreted and.constried
in-accordance with the:laws of the State of New Hampshire excapt
where the Federal suprémacy clause Tequires’ otherwise. The
wording used in this, Agreement. is. tlie, wording chosen by the
parties toexpress their mutual tntent; and no rule of construction

shall'be applied agaitist.or in favor of any party.

19.2 Any actions ariging out. of this' Agreement, including- the
breach or alleged breach thereof, may not be submitted to-binding
Arbitration, but must, instead, be brought and maintained.in- the-
Merrimack County Stpérior Court of New Hampshire whicls shall
have-exclusive jirisdiction thereof,

:20. CONFLICTING TERMS, In the event of a conflict between
the-termis-of this P-37 form (as. modified i EXHIBIT A) and any
other portion of this, Agreement including any attachmienis, therets,
the terms of_the P-37(as modifiad in EXHIBIT A) shall control,

21. THIRD-PARTIES. This Agrecment is being entered it For

the sole:benefit.of the parties hereto, and nothing hierein, express or

imiplied, is intended 16 or will confer any legal o equitable right,

benefit, o remedy of any naturg-upom any othér person,
22. HEADINGS The headings throughoit the Agreementaré for
; _ and the words contained therein shall in
no way be held: o explain, modify, amplify or aid ‘in the.
interpretation; constriiction or meaning of the provisiens of this
Agreement,

23. SPECIAL. PROVISIONS, Additiofial o modifying
provisions set forth in the attached EXHIBIT A are incorporated
licrein by reference.

24. FURTHER ASSURANCES. The Contrictor,-along with its
agents and.afﬁ'liates',;shall',_ﬁp its¥own costand eXpense, execute any
ddditional documents and take such further actions as may be
‘Teasonably required-to carty ouit the provisions.of this-Agreement
and give effect to the transactions contemplated-herchy.

25, SEVERABILITY. Inthe¢vent any of the provisions of this
Agreement are beld by a court. of competent jurisdiction to be
contrary o any state or federal law, the rematting provisions. afs
this Agreement will remain ifi fulf force and effict,

26.. ENTIRE AGREEMENT: This Agreement, which, ray. be
executed in a number of counferparts, each of which shall be
deemed an original; -constitutes. the entire agreement and
understanding between the partics, and -supersedgs all prior
agreements.and understandings with respect to the-subject matter

hereof,
Contraetof Initia k@’&




EXHIBIT A - SPECIAL PROVISIONS
There are no-special provisions.of this contract,
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EXHIBIT B'- SCOPE OF SERVICES.

1. ‘INTRODUCTION:

Lt

2.2

3.2,

4.1.

4.2,

43,

4.4.

CONTRACT DOCUMENTS:
2.1

“Monadnock Commercial Building Company, LLC (hereinaftér reférred to-as.the “Caiitractor™) hereby agrees to

provide thé Sfate of New Hampshiire.(here‘inziftﬁ:’f'ﬂtdfé?fed to-as the “State™), Department of Administrative

Serviges; wifhi(iatpentry,Servige;s in accordarnice with the bid submission in response to State Requiest for Bid
3009-25 and as described hsreiii.

This Coniract consists of the following documents ("_“Cq;ntr‘act:Documents")_:
» State oﬁ*New:Han_ipf,hii'e Tetms and Conditions, General Provisions Form P37
‘EXHIBIT A Special Provisiong
EXHIBITB . Scopé of Services
EXHIBITC  Method of Payment:
In the event:of any conflict among the termis:or provisions of'the docurents listed above; the following order of
priority shall indicate which documerits control: (1) Form Number P-37 as:modified by EXHIBIT A “Special
Provisions”, (2),EXHIBIT B “Scope of Services™, (3) EXHIBIT C*Mathod of Payment”. \

TERM OF CONTRACT:
3.1,

The term of the:contract shall commence June 1, 2025, o upon exec ution by the Commissioner of the

Department of Administrative: Services; whichever is later (the “effettive date™) and shall continue thereafter for
a petiod of-approximately five-(5) years, ‘

The'Contract may be extended for up to an additiohal two (2) years thereafier upon the same terins, conditions
-anid pricing structure-with the approval of the Commissioner of the Departinent-of Adininistrative Services.

. SCOPE OF WORK:

Contractor shali supply all labor, todi‘s‘, trangportation, m&ierigls, equipment and permits as necessary and’
required to perform services-as described herein, :
Individual picjécts are.not to exceed $25,000 including all costs associated with any individisal project,
inclading supervision, fabor, mi ledge, equipment, ;:bnﬁmcfiomeqﬂipm&ng maﬁcghiﬁ'ew"and.supp‘lieset_c., unless a
Waiver is granted by the Director of the Départment of Public. Works.
Contractor shall provide material safety data sheets with the delivery of any and all products covered by RSA
377-A, the“Worker's Right to Know Act.™
.The Contractor(s) shall provide:supervision, labor, materials, transpoﬂiation,?tugls,-_equipmém,_ and machinery
necessary to s‘nti“s;factoril'y complete the Carpentry Services including, but not limited to:
4.4.1, Dembolition of gypsumn wall board, plaster, metal, masonry and wood wallsystems
4.4.2. Demolition, repair or-replacement of (ﬂoo‘ring; and subflooring systems
4.4.3. Rough carpentry related to commercial Constriiction of walls, doors; windews and ceilings

4.4.4. Finish-carpénitry related to commercial constriction of walls, doors, windows-and ceilings
44.5. P'at*c'iﬁhg,ucaulkjng,.;pti'ming_ and -pafnting‘-on staining of :&néx;zited-'areas
4:4.6. Installing céramic and other walltiles
4477, Demolition, repair or replacemient of ceilings
4.4.8. Demolition, repair or réplacement'df suspended acoustical tile ceilings
4.4.9. Demolition, repair, fabrication, installation orreplacement of cabinetry’ _
4.4.10:Installation and removal of 'iempomry'en_glosurés‘ comprised of materials rated for the purpose
4:4.1'1. Protection of flooring and countertop surfaces with' Builder Board, Ram Board Or'eq_uiva]ént-
4.4.12. Demolition, repair, or replicement.of building envelope components
4.4.13.Installing of firestopping or canlking
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4.4.14, Restoration cleaning of reriovited areas
4.5, .A_gchciéé'sliall’,tquc;;;- services by issting a Request for Quoté {RFQ) with scope of work detailing as much
infomlatian_glgagnt-'thg’projﬁéctas‘avaﬂab'le;
4.6. The Contractor(s) shall be.requited 16 performa site-visit prior to submitting a fixed-pice quote for individual
projects at rates established ini this contract(s).

4.7. For Carpentry Services requiring immediateiattention, the Contractor(s} will work on a time and materials basis
at rates as detailed herein: When submitting an-invoice, the Contractor(s) imiist provide detajl-of the work
performed, dates-and {ogition of the, Carpentry Services, a copy.of the material invoices to-verify mark up and:
number of hottfs pét person worked.

4.7:1.Hourly Rate - The Hourly Rate per person-with taols and equipment to provide Carpentry Services as
described herein; The Houtly Rate shall be for the-actual amount of time at the*respectivejob sites,

4.7.2 Materials - All‘materials shall be invoiced at.a markup not te exceed 10% over contractor or
subcontractor’s cost.

Manager. Any work performed by subcontractors shall be inveiced at 4 markup not to exceed 10% aver
‘contractor cost:

4.7.4, Equipment -~ For any machinery or special equipment required to complete the Carpentry Services, the
Contractor(sy will receive areasonable refital.charge-to. which no percentage will be added. This rental
charge must be‘approved in advance by the Agency Project Manager before any work begiis, The
rental rate shall include all. fuel, transportation, fubricants, and the upkeep of'the equipment. Equipment
does not include any smiall tools and accessoriss for small tools.

4.8. The Contractor shall secure any permits, schedule inspections and be onsite during inspections, The Contractor
shall ensure. that inspections are made by the appropriate State and or lo¢al authority having jurisdiction. The
‘Contractor(s) wi Il'invoice the:State for-the cost:of the pérmit or?inspectigq fees, at no markup, as part of the
Carpentry'Services. The permit.or inspection cost will be itemized on the detailed invoice at the completion of
the work;

4.9, For SchedulgdCar_pent’:y Ser*iiq_e_s completed on a fixed price basis, the Céntract@ﬁshall provideinformation on
the invoice that includes:detail of the wark performed, dates arid location of the Carpentry Services.

4:10. ‘All work performed under any ensuing contract(s) shall be scheduled by the Agency Project Manager.

4,7.3. Subcontractors — The'use of any subcontractors must be approved in'aEiVance by the-State Project

4,11, The successful Contractor(s) shall notify the Agency Project Manager of _an)g‘maintenance-—télateq issues that are
discovered -whiigtperfoxfmih'g‘ e vork.

4.12. The Coritractor(s) shall'dlso be awarte.of liws and regulations relating to hazardous materials that may be
encountered during construction operations. The healtli arnid safety of employees, the, general public, and the
potential of damage to- the overall environment is possible if hazardous materials afé-not recognized, reported,
and the appropriate action taken to dispose:of, remove from the site, of otherwise contain thé possible
contaminants.

4.12.1. If at any timg during the performance of the work required by the;@pntraqt(‘s);:a..eontractor(s)__finds,-

: N

qr has.reason to-suspect, the presence of asbestos, fead paint, or other HaZardous materials it the.

work arga, the Gontra‘ctor‘j_(s)'-Shali;irr;med‘iatel'y notify the-State representative setfing forth their-
observatioss, suspicionis-and Tequesting instructioris: No-further work shall.be conducted in the
area-of the contarinated material until the site has been investigated and the State has given
approval to.continue the work in-the area. At the: same time, the-Contractor(s) shall withdraw- 4l
personnel from the potentially contaminated area. The Contractor(s) shallfuilly cooperate with thie -
State'and perform dny femedial work as directed.

4.13. The Contractor(s) shall {ake all reasonable precautions for the safety of, and skiall provide all reasofiable
protection o prevent damage, injury or loss to; .
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4.14,

4.15.
4.16.

_ 417

418,

4.19.

4.20;

4.21,

4.22,

COMMERCIAL RE

5.6

4.13.1.- All employees of the work and all other persons who-may be affected thereby:

4.13.2, All'work, matérials, and equiptent, Whether in storage oni-or off the site, under the care; custody or
contiol of the.successful Contractor(s) orany of ‘their's,uhigoni_r_acfo_r(js).

The Contractor(s) .shafl;,ini_ti‘até, maintain, and supervise all safety precatitions and programs in connection With.
the work. "Theﬁontractor(s_l shqllizprévide:'tﬁe;necessary equipment’and comply with all City, State and or
Federal safety regulations. "

The Contractor(s) shall give all notices and comply with all applicable laws, ordindnces, tules, regulations, and
lawful orders of 2:public afulhoﬁtyﬁbearingpn;.thaisafety of personnel or property or their protection from
damage, injury; or loss. = ,

The Contractor(s) shall erect-and maintain; as required by-exist_i'u'gpohdi't'i6i;s~‘ahd‘;prqg;'ess.of the work, all

reasonable safeguards-for safety aid jirotection, including posting danger signs and other warnings against

"hazards, promulgating safety regulatii'onsé_(angi;.nétifying_gdwnﬁsangi users.of the adjacent utilities,

The Contfﬁétgr_(s) shall provide adequate supervision of their eémployees to'ensure-complete and satisfactory
performanie of all work in-accordance. with thie terms of the contract(s).

The Contractor(s) shall ensiire that all mat’eriaf_s-sﬁail fb¢ af the best quality, all ‘work is completed in a
professional manner; and 'gH"as;_)\_ectsrqf the proj écf:are delivergd;in_‘goodawbrking_ order, complete and perfect in

shall be'good quality free from-faults and defects.
The Contractor(s) shail firther ensure that all dirt and debris resulting from the work imndér any resulting

contract(s} shall-be disposed of at the end of each - day or at the completion of work. The Contragtor(s) is
responsible ifcr-pmperiyrdisﬁd’sing of any materidls removed or replaced. In-addition, any areas di sturbed should
be restored to their original condition, ’

The Contractor(s) shall supervise and direct the:work, using theirbest skills aid aftentiof. The-Contractor(s)
shall be.solely responsible for all constructioi means;, methods, technigues, sequences. and procedures and for
coordinating all portions of the work, Allaspects-of the project shall be:subject to the inspection and approval
of the State. The COntrdcfor(s) guaraniees to repait; replace, re-éxecute, or otherwise correct:any defectin
workifiafiship, material, or the like that fails to-conform to the requirements of the'S tate, or that appear during
the progress of the-Wwork or within one yearof final acceptance by the State. The Contractor(s) shall supply the
State with-all warranty information whothes it be expressed or implied. '

The Contractor(s) shall perform all the:work and futnish-all the materials; tools,-equipment and safety devices
necessary to perform-in the manner and within the time hereinafter specified, The Contractor(s) shall complete
the entire work to the. satisfaction of the State and in -accordance with the specifications herein mentioned at the
price hetein agreed upon and fixed, therefore. All the work, labor furished under this contract, shall be done,
and furnished strictly pursuant to, and in conférmity with the Specifications described herein, and the:directions
of the:State representatives as given from time to time; during the progress of the work, under the terms. of this
contract(s).

The Contractor(s) shall 'adequz&fely;se;:iure and protect theit own tools; equiprent; materials and supplies; The
State assumes na liability for any damage; theft, ornegligent injuty to the Contractor's property or to the
property of their employees, agents orapproved sub-contrictors.

UIREMENTS:

The State of New Hampshire rescrves. the right to add or delete locations/equipment throiighout the term of the
contract. For the addition of a new location ornew equipment, a-requesting agency through the Divisian of
Procurement:and Support Services shall submit a request foi quote (RFQ) including ardetailed scope.of work to
serviceshall be performed until décumented: acceptance by the State is received, The Contract may be amended
by agreement. of the parties, effective upon approval of the commissioner of the Departrhent of Administrative
Services or designee, without further approval needed by the Governot and Executive.Counci,as long as the
priceé limitation i's.unc“hanged or decreased as a result of the new or deleted locations/equipment.

Contractor 'Initia!%‘ Q’é/
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8.

5.2. Unless otherwise stited:in the Scope of Services, all'services performed-undsr this Contract(s) shall be

performed befween the hours of 7:00' AM. and 5:00:P.M. for State businiess days, unless other arrangements are
made.in advance with the.State. Any deviation in work hours-shall be pre-approved by the Contracting Officer.
The State requires ten:day advance knowledge of said wotk schedules to provide security and access to
respective:work areas, No premium charges shall be-paid for'any off-hour. work:

5.3. The Contractor shall not éommence wotk until a-conference is held with each.State agency intending to utilize
the Cotitractor’s services; at which représentatives:of the Contractor and the State are:présent. The.conferénce
will be-arranged by the: State agency:

5.4, The State shall require correction of any defective work and.the repair of any damages to ariy part of a building
or its appurtenances caused by the Contractor or its employees, subeontractors, equipmént or supplies. The
Contractor shall correct; repair, or replace.all defective work; as needed, to.complete said work: in:satisfactory
condition, and damages socaused in order to restore the:building and its appurtenances to their previous
condition. Upon failute of the, Contractor to-proceed promptly with the necessary cofrections or repairs, the
State may withlold any amount necessary to correct afl defective work.or repair all. damages from payments to
the Contractor,

5.5. The work staff shall. consist of qualified persons completely familiar with the products and equipment that they

* will use.. The Contracting Officer may require the Contractor to dismiss from the work such.employees as the
Contracting Officer deems incompetent, careless, insubordinate, or dtherwise objectionable, or whose continued
employment on the work.is deemed to be contrary t6 the-public inferest or inconsistent with the best interest of
security and the State.. :

3:6. Neither the'Contractor nor its émployees or subcontraciors:shall represent thémselves as émployees or agents of
the State,

5.7. While on Stdte propeity the Contractor, its.employees, and its sub-contractors shall be subject to the authority
and control of the State, but underno ¢ircumstances shall such persons be deemed to be eriiployees of the State.

5.8. All personnel shall.observe all regulations: or special restrictions in effect.at any State agency location at which
services are to be provided:

5.9, The Coﬁtractog"s persormel shall be allowed only. in aréds where services are to be:provided. The usé of State
telephones by the Connacmr:'itS'ﬁmponees, or'its sub-contractors is prohibited.

5.10. If sub-contractors are to be utilized, Contractor sﬁaii..prowr_ide-infonnzj.tign_regmjding the proposed sub-contractors
including the name of the-company, their address, contact person and threa references for clients they are
ocurrently servicing. Approval by:the State:must be received prior to a sub-contractor starting any wotk,

WARRANTY REQUIREMENTS: _ ) _

0.1 The successful Confractor shall bé required to provide warranties on all-work performed by the Contractor for a
period of not less than one (1) year or, when equipment is installed, the- manufactiier’s standard warran
perfod, whichever is greater, commencin g.0n the date that the equipment i§ received, inspected, and accepted by
the State of New Hampshire. The warranty shall cover 100%:of repair oraeplacement costs, incliding all parts,
shipping, labor, travel, ladging, and cxperises.

USAGE REPORTING: o : __ o

7.1 The Contractor shali submit a quarterly and annual usage report for analysis‘for each state-agency or eligible

participant. Reports are dueno latet than 30 daiys after the end of each calendar quarter to Steven Burgess at.the
Buteau of Purchase and Property and sent electronic to--S’tevenaH’.‘-Burgess@__DAStNH;Gcw. Ata miiiimum, the
Report shall include: ‘

7.1.1.  Contract Number .

7.12. Urilizing Agency and Elj gible Participant

713, Total Cost.of all Services/Products Purchased. Ability to sort by agency/eligible participant.
7.1.4. Preferred in Excel format

OBLIGATIONS AND LIABILITY OF THE CONTRACTOR:
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8.1. TheContractor shall provide all Carpentry Services strictly pursuant to, and in-conformity \'#‘i‘ftﬁ;the

specifications described in State REB 3009-25, as described herein, dnd urider the: terms of this Contract.
8.2, Itis the responsibility of the Contractor to'maintain this coritract and New Hampshire Vendor Registration with.
up-to-date contact infoitation, :

8:3. Contract specific con_fact'infor‘lnﬁtion'(_S_ales-gqptacf; Contractdr contract manager, etc.) shall be sent to the
State’s Contracting OfficeJisted in Box 1.9 of Form P-37.

8.4. Additionally, all updates i.e., telephone numbers, contact names, email addresses, W9, taxidentification

numbers are.required to be-current through a formal electronic submission to'the Bureau of Purchase.and
Property a't:;htt-bs;h‘.das,nh.go‘v!ﬁurc:hag‘i.nﬁ/;vcndvorre istration/(S(q0fzcvSSqhaeqsd SipyqSids))welcome. aspx.

8.5, The Contractor shall agree to hold the State of NH harmless from liability arising out of irjjuries or damage

caused while performing this work. The Contractor shail agree that any damage to building(s); materials,
equipment, or other property during the: performatice of the service shall be repaired at its own expense, to the
State’s satisfaction.

8.6. Contractor shall not be allowed torequire any other type of ordery nor shall the Contractor be allowed:to require.
the filling 'out or sigring of'any other document by State of New Hampshire personnel, .

8.7. The successtul Contractor shall perform all work.and furtish all materials, tools, equipment; and safety devices
Decessary to. perform the requested services in the mannisr and within the time hereinafter specified. The
Contractof shall provide-:_sai'd services to the satisfaction of the State and in accordarice with the specifications
and:at.the price set forth herein: All'work to be performed and all equipment to be furnished pursuant to the
Scope of Services included herein-shall be performed and furnished i strict aceordance with the specifications
included herein, the tertiis; of any contract awarded as aresult of this solicitation, any associated contract
drawings, and the directions of State repiesentatives as may be given from time'to time-while the work is in
progress.

8.38. The successful Contractor shall take full responsibility foi the work to be performed pursuant to the Scope of
Serviees included: herein; for the protéction of said work; and:for preventing injuries to persons and damage to
‘property.and utilities on or about said work. The Contractor shall in rio way be relieved of such responsibility
by any authority of the State to give permission-or i'ssnf:'orqgrs*relati11g=to :any, part of the work, by any-such
permission given or orders issued, or by any faiture of the State to give such permission-or issue such orders.
The successful Contractor: shall bear all Tosses accruing to the Contractor as.a. result of the asmount, quality, or
c¢haracter of the work required, orbecalise the naturé or characteristics of the work location is«different from
what the Contractor estimated or éxpected, or due'to delays,or other complications caused by the weather,
eléments, or other natural causes. -

8.9. The successful Contractor agrees that-any damage.or injury to any buildings, materials, equipment, or other
property resulting; from the Contractor’s performance of the requested:services shall be repaired at the-
Contractor’s own.expense so that such buildings, materials, equipment; or-other property are satisfactorily
restored to their prior. condition.

DEBARMENT, SUSPENSION, INELIGIBILITY AND VOLUNTARY EXCLUSION LOWER TIER

COVE__RED?ZTRANSAGTIONS; ‘ ' ' -

9.1, ’F'Eie.‘._Comfactbr-cérﬁﬁes_,_ by signatiire of this contract; that-neither it nor its'principals is presently debarréd,
suspended, proposed for debarment, declared ineligible, or voluntarily excluded from participation in this

tranSaction by any Federal Department or Agency. o

). CONFIDENTIALITY & CRIMINAL-RECORD: :

10.1. If requested by the.using ageney, the Contractor and its employees; and Sub-Conttactors {ifany), shall be

required to:sign anid submit a Cohfidential Nature of Department Records Form and a’ Criminal Authorization

R L

Records Férm. These forms-shall be submitted to the individual using agency prior to the start of any. work.
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11. CONTRACT PRICE; |
1L The Contractor hieraby agregs'to provide Carpentry Services:in .sgr_‘ict{g_gmﬁ_ﬁ_an_cea

' PRICE: ,

specified.in.Extibit B-for an amount up to-and not to-exceed d pric of $1,712;
considéred a guarantéed or minimuti figure; however, it shall:be considered a
effective date through the expiration date a5 indicated in Form P-37 Black 1.7.

12. PRICING STRUCTURE:

Description

Cat@égter&eé& i |
Helpér

‘ .Carpeﬁter[ﬁeﬁd _
-Helper,
Description’

Caxpe’zifqp’]}‘égd
Helper

EXHIBIT C- METHOD OF PAYMENT

Page-11 of 13
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[T

) ‘Description
v “Car;‘:zentjer_fh'ea& '
Heljper _
Description
.-‘Ga;pe;xtcg!;[.éad
Helper
' B
bescripfian'
|-Carpentet/Lead
: ;He'ipe:f-
13. ERICING QUOTATIONS FOR INDIVIDUAL PROJECTS;: | o :
13.1.State will requiest quotations by 'p:oviding.;a SOW describing the‘services required:and the:applicable techitical.
. qualifications. Contractor must return quotes within five:(5) business days, unlgs_ss;al-tematec-arfanfgementg' have
been made with:the requesting agericy. The quotéd hourly rates shallnot exceed the rates established under.this
’ =,  coiittact.for the county the work will be completéd in. T

13.2. The Contractor shall not be,aIIQWed,to:reqﬁirer any otheritypé.of order, tior shall the Contractorbe allowed to

14. CONTRACT RETAINAGE: ;

require the filling out orsigning of any ‘L{)tilgfar‘:dqcument‘by State of New Hampshire personnel.
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14.1. 'fhe‘st;a‘tgz_usf,lial,l:geytaih 5% of total fixed fees from'éach milestone payment; to-be released upon the coimplétion
and acceptance by. the State.

15. INVOICE: ‘ | : |

15,1 Itemized-invoices shall besubmitted to the individuat agency after the completion of the job/services and shall
inchide a brief description of the work done along with the location of work.

¥5.2. Contractor shall be paid within 30 days after teceipt of propeily documented invoice and acceptance of the work
to the State’s satisfaction, :

15.3. The invoi:c‘e}shﬁl‘l‘he;sen't-t’o the address ﬁf'tﬁljehsiﬁg agency under agreetent,

16. SUBCONTRACTOR RELEASE; _ _ , |

16.1. Neither the final paymentnor any part of the refained. percentage shall become dueuntil-the Contractor shall
deliver a complete teleasé of all.claims arising under and by virtue of thig Confract, including.claims for all
Subtontractors and suppliers of either matérials:or.labor, plus-arelease of the Contract Bond and a statement
that all Shbqoat"ractprs_'and.sgpptiéfsg have been paid. The Commiﬁssioﬁér"may,_ﬁay any and all such claims, in
whole or in part, and deduct the amount.or amounts'so paid from any-partial ar final pdyment,

16.2. The acceptance of the Final Payment by the Contractor shall Be-and shall-operate as 4 release to the Contractor
of all claims and 6f all-liability to-the State for dll things done-or furnished. in connection with this work. No.
payment, however, final or otherwise; shall operate'to %rqle;ﬁs_@theﬁqn&abiqr.and its Surcties from any
obligations under this Contract:or:the Contract Bond, Acceptance of Final Payment shall not impact any’
warrantees provided by the Contractor with respect-to-this project:

17. PAYMENT: S _
17 L. Piayments may-be made via ACH or P-Card. Use.the:following link to entoll with the-St’ate‘Treasnlfyf'fqr=AC'H

_payments: https://www.iih gov/treasury.
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State of New Hampshlre

Department of State
- CERTIFICATE

I, David M. Scanlan, Secretaty-of State ‘of the State of New. Hampshire; do hereby certify that MONADNOCK COMMERCIAL
BUILDING COMPANY, LLCis a Ng;W"ngppslii're;Limitbd Liabiiity(?ampany’ registered to transact: businiess in:New
Hampshire on January 23, 2002 I’fpt}h&fﬁeﬁify&hat all fees anddobuments%rgéiﬁire& by theSecretary.of State’s office have been
 received and is in good standing as:far ds this.office is concerned,

Business; ID: 394985
Certificate. Number: 0007166601 -

INTESTIMONY WHEREOF,

Ihereto et my hand.an&rcause- to be affixed
the Seal of the'State of New Hampshire;
‘this 23rd day,of April A.D. 2075,

David M. Scanian

Secretary of 'St‘ajc




{Limited parmership, Liriited c’tabshty prajéss:anac‘
purtnership or LL(,Z:}

Certificate:of Authority 43

Ui GV\ a &(f?[(l » hereby certify that 1 am:the:Sole Partrier, Member or
(Name)

Manager and the sole offi icer o , st Ay sld o 4 iimited:":l-iabi']'it.y'pa’litnérship

(Name of Parmersth or LLC) '

l

-"nnder.RSA_:_304~B a limited hablhty professmnal partncrsth under. RSA 304-D, or a limited
liability company under RSA 304-C.

I certify that I am '“aut11ori"zed to bind the partnership or LLC. I further certify that it is
understood that the State of New Hampstire will rely on this ceftificate as evidence that the.
person listed above currently occﬁpiés.sthe position indicated and thar ,t'fxéy have full authori ty

to bind thepartnership or LLC,

DATED: %//t?/ QSM . J—

(Name & T:ﬂe)
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CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

MONACOM-01 AGRAY
DATE (MM/DD/YYYY)

4/25/2025

REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

THIS CERTIFICATE. IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY ‘OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED

IMPORTANT:

If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the pollcyues) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed.
If SUBROGATION 1S WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on
this certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

PRODUCER
Boufford Insurance A%ency
167 S River Rd. Unit1
Bedford, NH 03110

NAME:
_(_c, %, Ext): (603) 673-7228
EMAlE <. ashley@bouffordins.com

CONTACT Ashley Gray

[TA% u0)(603) 673-7290

INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIG #
MsURER A : Ohio Security Insurance Company 24082
INSURED nsURER B : Progressive Insurance Company
T::g‘:::;:: Commercial Building Company LLC msurer ¢ : The Ohio Casualty Insurance Company 24074
32 Fitzgerald Drive Uriit 10 INSURER D :
Jaffrey, NH 03452 INSURERE :
INSURER F ;
COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: REVISION NUMBER:

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE ‘POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN1S SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS,

ISR TYPE OF INSURANCE e e, POLICY KUMBER (DBAYYY) | (RO EYe) _ LIMITS
A | X | COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY EACH OCCURRENGE 3 1,000,000
| cLamsmave [ X ] occur BKS68950573 3/25/2025 | 31252026 | JAVAGEIORENTED 300,000
| ] MED EXP (Any ene person} 3 16,0 00
| PERSONAL 8 ADV INJURY |- $ 1,000,000
| GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: GENERAL AGGREGATE 8 2,000,000
| X | poLicy D JiSs Loc PRODUCTS - COMP/OP AGG | § 2,000,000
_ OTHER: 8
B | auTomoBnE LaBILITY Ao NCLELIMIT ] 1,000,000
ANY AUTO 995036413 312512025 | 3/25/12026 | popILY INJURY (Per person) 4 §
CWNED SCHEDULED .
AUTOS ONLY AUTOS BODILY INJURY {Per accident)| §
L.OWN PROPERTY DAMAGE
L HEJRI'EODS ONLY ﬁgyo%%ﬁe (Per agcident} 3
: : s
[+ L UMBRELLA LIAB L QCCUR ] EACH OCCURRENGE [ 5!000!000
EXCESS LIAB CLAIMS-MADE US068950573 3/25(2025 | 3/25/2026 | | oonenne 8 5,000,000
pep | X [ revenmions 10,000 s
COMP| -‘PER OTH-
A | RoRERE SRS el X] e | [
ANY PROPRIETOR:‘PARTNERIEXECUTIVE XWS88950573 | 3126/2025 | 3/25/2026 E.L. EACH ACCIDENT § 1,000,000
GEFICERMEMBER EXCLUDED NIA -
{andatory in NH) : E.L. DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE] § 1,000,000
If yes, describe under - 1.000.000
DESCRIPTION OF GPERATIONS below "E.L. DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT | § 4,97

Workers Comp Exclusion for owner Jonathan Clough

i

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS [ LOCATIONS { VEHICLES {ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, may be attachad if more space is required)

CERTIFICATE HOLDER

CANCELLATION

State of New Hampshire Department of Administrative
Services
Bureau of Purchase and Property
25 Capitol St, Room 102
. Concord, NH 03301

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE

THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREQF; NQTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS. v

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

ACORD 25 (2016/03)
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