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State of New Hampshire
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES

25 Capitol Street
Concord, New Hampshire 03301

(603) 271-3201 | Office@das.nh.gov

Catherine A, Keane
Charles M. Arlinghaus Deputy Commissioner
Commissioner _

Sheri L. Rockburn
. Assistant’ Commissioner

May 30, 2025

Her Excellency, Governor Kelly A. Ayotte
and the Honorable Council

State House

Concord, New Hampshire 03301

REQUESTED ACTION

Authorize the Department of Administrative Services to enter into a contract with
Covered Bridge Outdoor Construction Corp. (VC#396938), Manchester, NH in the amount of
$2,500,000.00 for Carpentry Services with the option to renew for up to an additional two-year
period, effective upon Governor and Council approval through May 31, 2030.

Funding shall be provided through individual agency expenditures, none of which shall
be permitted unless there are sufficient appropriated funds to cover the expenditure.

EXPLANATION

The Department of Administrative Services (DAS), through the Bureau of Purchase and
Property (BoPP) issued request for bid (RFB) 3009-25 on February 19, 2025, with responses due
on March 12, 2025. This RFB was issued to create a new contract for carpentry services serving
all ten (10) State of NH counties. The RFB reached three-hundred and thirty-five (335) vendors
through the NIGP registry and directly sourced. There were eight (8) compliant responses
received for this multi-award contract with Covered Bridge Outdoor Construction Corp.
submiiting competitive pricing for carpentry services in ten (10) counties containing
approximately two-hundred and sixteen (216) buildings.

It is the Department’s intent to enter into a contract with each of the eight (8) contractors
who submitted compliant responses. When an agency wishes to use this service, that agency will
develop a scope of work (SOW) and request a quote from each of the contractors. Each SOW
will detail various requirements related to the services requested, planning, and implémentation
of new projects. The project engagement will be awarded to the lowest-cost, qualified quote who
has availability to meet the project timeline. The eight (8) contractors upon approval will be
Covered Bridge Outdoor Construction Corp., Integrated-Builders Incorporated, Tibbetts
Construction LLC, Kritos & Son’s Property Services LLC, Monadnock Commercial Building
Company, LLC, Skovic Construction, D.L. King & Associates, Inc., and Triple Construction,
LLC.



Her Excellency, Governor Kelly A. Ayotte
and the Honorable Council
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This is a new contract with no historical spend. The price limitation is based on the
estimated .annual spend of $500,000.00 for all New Hampshire counties. This figure was divided
by the number of buildings in each county then multiplied by the five-year term of the contract to
arrive at a price limit per county. Each contractor’s price limitation is based on the projected
spend for each county bid. Since requests for quotes (RFQs) will be issued to each contractor
prior to project engagement, forecasting which contractors will receive projects is not possible at
this time. Therefore, each contractor has been awarded a price limitation that will provide cost
coverage for all projects, should that be the outcome of the RFQ process.

Contract financials
Coos County — 17 buildings $39,351.85
Grafton County — 24 buildings $55,555.56
Carrol County — 12 buildings $27,777.78
Belknap County — 15 buildings $34,722.22
Sullivan County — 4 buildings | $9,259.26
Strafford County — 30 Buildings $69,444.44
Cheshire County — 5 buildings $11,574.07
Hillsborough County — 7 buildings $16,203.70
Rockingham County — 28 buildings $64,814.81
Merrimack County — 74 buildings $171,296.31
Estimated total annual spend $500,000.00
Estimated 5-year term spend $2,500,000.00
Price limitation $2,500,000.00

Based on the foregoing, I am respectfully recommending approval of the contract with
Covered Bridge Outdoor Construction Corp.

Respectfully submitted,

(- aL

Charles M. Arlinghaus
Commissioner

TDD ACCESS: RELAY NH 1.800-735-2964



Division of Procurement Support Services
Bureau of Purchase Property

Gary S. Lunetta
Director
(603) 271-2201

RFB Bid Summary

Bid Description Carpentry Projects Under $25,000 Agency Statewide
RFB# 3009-25 Requisition#
Agent Name Steven Burgess Bid Closing 3/19/2025 10:00 AM
Indicates Award: —
L COO0S COUNTY, : Co;‘ercd Bridge Kritos and Sony
~ Carpenter/Lead] .- $200.00 No Bid
Helper| " .. $195.00 No Bid
GRAFTON COUNTY
Carpenter/Lead $175.00 i §150.000 No Bid U 56400 0
' Helper] . $100.00 . $127.00. No Bid , $50.00 --
CARROLL COUNTY ‘
Carpenter/Lead].: '* $175.00 No Bid h $64.00 . " -
Helper| = $100.00 No Bid _ $50.00 *
BELKNAP COUNTY ,
' Carpenter/Lead] = $175,00 C:$125.00 . | $80.00 .. $64.00
‘ Helper|.© . $100.00 ~$110.00 | C 870007 $50.00;
SULLIVAN COUNTY 4
Carpenter/Lead] - $175.00 - $125.00 No Bid ) . $64.00
Helper|] .  s100.00 $110.00 No Bid CL 850,00
STRAFFORD COUNTY ' '
Carpenter/Lead| - §175.00 4 8125.00 -5 $80:00 . | . $64.00.
Helper - $100.00 CUS110,00 [ o .870.00- 0 i $50.00
CHESHIRE COUNTY
Carpenter/Lead| ~° $250.00 - Y0$125.00 . $80.00 - | $73.00 .
Helper| = $125.00 .. $110:00 - 87000 . . | - $55.00. .
HILLSBOROUGH COUNTY -
Carpenter/Lead| $115.00 L $115.00 _ $60.00 $64.00 .
‘ Helper| = $70.00 $100.00 $56.00 85000
ROCKINGHAM COUNTY
Carpenter/Lead] .~ $110.00 . "$125.00 ~ 560.00  $64.00.
Helper| .. §70.00 . $110.00 .  $56.00 . §$50.00 .-
MERRIMACK COUNTY ' '
Carpenter/Lead $115.00 $115.00 . $60.00 . $64.00
Helper $70.00 $100.00 ., . |  $56.00. . . $50.00
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Division of Procurement Support Services Gary S. Lunetta
Bureau of Purchase Property Director
(603) 271-2201

RFB Bid Summary

¥ Monddrock’

N o8 7 | Skovie Construction | Tibbets Construetion | Triple Construction Weétwayﬂc'éi;i"s't‘rucmtidn‘
¢ Commetrcial RN . Fh R L e L

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Non-Compliant
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid - $75.00 .. - 8126.12.
No Bid Ne Bid - $50.00 . . 810526
No Bid No Bid No Bid “
No Bid ' Ne Bid No Bid -
Na Bid No Bid - §75.00
No Bid No Bid i $50.00 -
©l 205,007 7 - No Bid el BTS00 8126,12
o 87500 - No Bid 85000 - [ i $10526
G N895.00 0 ] . -$62.00-) No Bid
. 875.000 .- f.- " 85200 No Bid
. 895.00. . No Bid No Bid
d STRO00 T No Bid No Bid
. - %9500 No Bid o $75.00 - |. . U$126.12
| $75.00 No Bid S . $50.00, ¢ |0« $105.26
00 50T 862000 No Bid ks §12602 0
G $52,00 7 - No Bid 510526
No Bid © . $75.00. - $126.12
No Bid . 850,00 L. $10526
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Division of Procurement Support Services
Bureau of Purchase Property

RFB Bid Summary

—

Recomméndation Summary . S
Statewide Contract or Amendment ) Statewide
Term of Contract Five Years
Price Limitation $2,500,000.00
Number of Solicitations Received : 8
Number of Sourced bidders ‘ 335
Number of non-responsive bidders 327

P-37 Checklist Complete Yes
D&B Report Attached _ N/A
Confirmed Vendor is not debarred or suspended (Sam.gov) - ' N/A
Method of Payment (P-card/ACH) Both
FOB Delivered Yes

Special Notes: Multi-Award contract. Eight (8) contractors will be awarded a contract: D.L. King & Associates,
Inc., Covered Bridge Outdoor Constraction Corp., Integrated-Builders Incorporated, Kritos & Son’s
Property Services LLC, Monadnock Commercial Bhilding Company, LLC, Skovic Construction, Tibbetts
Construction LLC, and Triple Construction, LLC.

Gary S. Lunetta
Director
- (603) 271-2201
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FORM NUMBER: P-'S’i (version 2/23/2023)

Notice: Tinsagreemem and all of itz attachments shall becoig public-upot submission to Govérnorand
Executive Council for approval. Any information that is private, confidential.or proprietary must
be-clearly identified toithe agency andagreedtomwnnng puortusrgnmgthecqm

AGREEMENT
The State of New Hampshirs.and the, Contracsor Tiereby: mutnally agtec as follows:

GENERAL PROVISIONS

1. IDENTIFICATION.

1.1 State-Ageficy | Name
Diepartmiertof Administrative Services
‘Bureau of Purchaseasid Property

L2 State Agency Addres§
25 Capitol Street
Concond, NH: 03301

' 13 -Coiitractor Naine
- ‘CoveredBridge Outdoor Constructon Corp.

l 4 Contractor Address
149 Hiiiden Oak Way, Manchester NH, 03102

. j'1 3 Commctor?hone Number -

16 Account Unit and Class
(603) 479-9716.

Varions

1.7 Completion Date: 1.8 Piige:l_?'efj:r_n_itaﬁbn
‘May 31,2030 $2,500,000.00

‘14 Coufracting Officer for State Agency -
Gary Lunetta, Divector

(603} 271-2102

1. 10 State Agency Telephione Namber

111" Contractor Signature:

712, Name and Title 0f Contiactor Signatory,

Paulld v (EQ

/ Py SIS

8. Agency Slgmture
@L@,\Q ey €25

1.14 -Naﬁ:e‘aridTiﬂé:ofsmaAgency“S‘igmtmy
‘Charles:M. Arlingbans, Comissioner

By? |

n.Dms:on of Personnel (if applicable)

Director, On:

L16 Approval by the Attorey Geiieral (Form, Subisiznce and Execution) (if applicable)

By: (reatan [ avere

om: 6/7/25

117 Appovalby the Governorand Executive. Council (ifapplicdble)

G&C Hem number:

G&C Meeting Date;

Page L'of 14

Contractor Imtlals
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2. SERVICES TO BE PERFORMED. The State of New
Hampshire, acting through the agency identified in block 1.1
(“State™), engages contractor identified in block 1.3 (*Contractor”)
to perform, and the Contractor shall perform, the work or sale of
goods, or both, identified and more. particularly described in the
attached EXHIBIT B which is incorpérated herein b} Tefererice
(“Setvices™:

3. EFFECTIVE DATE/COMPLETION OF SERVICES.

3.1 Notwithstanding, any provision of this Agre¢ment to. the
contrary, and subject to the approval of the” Governor and
Executive Council of the State of New Hampshite, if applicable,
this Agreement, and all obligations of the parties hereunder, shatl
become effective on:-the-date the Governor and Executivé Couitcil

approve this Agréement, unless no such approval is. required, ini:

which case the Agreément shiall' becoime effective on the date the
Agreement is signed by the State Agency as shown in block 1.13
(“Effective Date™),

3.2 If the Contractor dommences the Services prior to the Effective
Daté, all Services. performied by the Contracior prior 1o the
Effective Date shall be-performed at the'sole risk of the Contractor,
and-in-the event that this Agreement dees not becoime effective, the
State shall have no liability to the Contractor, including without
limitation, any obligation (0 pay the Contractor for any costs
ingurred or Services performed:

3.3 Contractor must complete all Sarvices by the Completion Date
specified inblock 1.7.

4, CONDITIONAL NATURE OF AGREEMENT.
Notwithstanding any provision of this Agreement to the contrary,
-all obligations of the State hereunder, including, without Iimitation,
the continuance of payments hereunder; are contingent upon the
availability and continued appropriation of funds. In no event shall
the State be liablé for any payments hereunder in excess of such
available appropriated funds. In the event of a. reducfion or
termination of appropriated furids by-any state or fedéral legislative
or executive action that reduces, eliminates or otherwise modifies
the appropriation or availability of funding for this Agreement and
the Scope for Services provided in EXHIBIT B, ifrwhole or in-part,
the State shall have the right to withhold payment until su¢h funds
becorme available, if ever, and shall have the right to reduce or
teiminate the Services nnder this Agreement immediately upon
giving the Contractor notice of such reditction or termination, Thé
State shall not be required to transfer funds from any other acocount
or source to-the Account identified in block 1.6 in the event funds
in that Account are reduced or unavailable.

5, CONTRACT PRICE/PRICE LIMITATION/ PAYMENT.
5.1 The ¢dntract price, method of payment, and terms of payment
are identified and more particnlarly described in EXHIBIT C
which is incorporated herein by reference. _

5.2 Notwithstanding any provision in this Agreemerit to the
contrary, and notwithstanding umexpected circunistances, in no
event shall the total of all payments authorized, or actually made
hereunder, exceed the Price Limitation set-forth in block 1.8. The
payment by the State of the contract price shall be the only and the
complete reimbursement to the Contractor for all expenses, of
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whatever nature incurred by the Contractor in the performance.
hereof and shall be the'only and the complete compensation to the
Contractor for the Services.

5.3 The State .reserves the right to offset from any amounts
otherwise payable .t the Contractor under this Agreement those
liquidated amounts required or perinitied by N.H. RSA 80:7
thiough RSA 80:7-¢ or any other provision of law.

5.4 The State’s liability undér this Agregment shall be limited to
monetary damages not to exceéd the total fees paid. The Contractor
agrees that it has an adequate remedy at law for any breach.of this
Agreemient by the State aitd héreby waives any right to specific
performance or other équitable réiedies against the State.

6. COMPLIANCE BY CONTRACTOR WITH LAWS AND
REGULATIONS/EQUAL EMPLOYMENT
OPPORTUNITY.

6:1 In connection with the performance of the Services, the
Contractor shall comply with all applicable statutes, laws,
regulations, and otders of federal, state, county or municipal
authorities which: impose any obligation or duty upon the
Contractor, including, but not limited to, civil rglits and equal
employment oppottunity laws and the Governor's order on Respect
and Civility in the Workplace, Executive order 2020-01. In
addition, if this Agreeinent is funded in any part by monies of the
United States, the Contractor shall comply with all federal
executive orders, rules, regulations and statutes, and with any rules,
regulatitngand geidelines as the:State or the United Sates issve to
implement these segulations. The ‘Contractor shall also comply
with all applicable intellectial property laws,

6.2 During the term of this Agreement, the Coftractor shall not
discriminate agamst employees or applicants for employment
because of age, sex, sexual orientation, race, color, marital status,
physical or mental disability, religious creed, national origin,
gender identity, or gender expression, and will take affirmative
action to prevent such discrimination, unless exempt by state or
federal law. The Contractor shall ensure any subcontractors
comply with-these nondiscrimination requirements,

6.3 No payments or transférs of value by Contraclor or its
representatives in connection with this Agreement have or shall be
made which have the purpose of effect of public'or commercial
bribery, or acceptance of of acquiéscence in extortion, kickbacks,
or other uniawful or improper means of obtaining business.

6.4, The Contractor agrees to permit the State or United States
access'to any of the Contractor’s:books, records and accounts.for
the purpose of ascertaining compliance with this Agreement and
all rules, regulations and orders pertaining to the covenants, terms
and conditions of this Agreement.

7. PERSONNEE.

7.1 The Contractor shall at its own expense provide all personnel
neessary to perform the Services.-The Contractor watrants thatall
personnel engaged. in the Services shall be qualified to perform the
Services-and shall be properly licensed and otherwise authorized to
do so under all applicable laws,

7.2 The Contracting Officer specified in block 1.9, or any
successor, shall be the Siate’s point of contact pertaining (o this
Agreement.

Contractor Initjals / kj .
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Date 5



8. EVENT OF DEFAULT/REMEDIES,

8.1 Any one or more of the following acts or omissions of the
Contractor shall constitute an event of default hereunder (“Event
of Default™):

8.1.1 failure to perform the Services satisfactorily oron schedule;
8.1.2 failure to submit any report required hereunder; and/or

8.1.3 failure to perform any other covenant, term or condition of
this Agreement.

8.2 Upon the occurrence of any Event of Default, the State may
take any one, or-more, of all, of the following actions:

8.2.1 give the Contractor a written notice specifying the Event.of
Default and requiring it 16 be remédied within. in the-absence of a
greater or lesser specification of time, thirty (30) calendar days
from the date of the notice; and if the Event of Default is not timely
cured, terminate this Agreement, effective two {2) calendar days
after giving the: Contractor notice of termination,

8.2.2 give the: Connacior a written noticg specifying the Event of
Default and suspending all payments to be made under this
Agreement and ordering that the portion of the:contract price which
would otherwise accrug 1o the Contractor-during the period from
the date of such notice until such time as the State determines that
the Contractor has cured the Event of Default shall ncver be paid
to the Contractor; _ _
8.2.3 give the Contractor a wiitten notice specifying the Event of
Default and set off against any other obligations the State may owe
to the Contractor any damages the State suffers by eason of any
Event of Default; and/or 7
8.2.4 give the Contractor a wrilten notice specifying the Event of
Default, treat the Agreement as breached, terminate the Agreement
and pursuc any of its remedies at law or in equity, orboth,

9. TERMINATION.

9.1 Notwithstanding paragraph 8, the State may, at its sole
discretion, terminate the Agreement for any reason, in whole or in
part, by thirty (30) calendar days written'notice to the Contractor
that the State is exercising ils option to terminate the Agreement.
9.2 In the event of anearly termination of this Agreement for any
reason.other than the completion of the Services, th¢ Contractor
shall, at the State’s discretion, deliverto-the Contracting Ofﬁcer
not later than fifieen (15) calendar days after the date of
tfermination, a report.(“Termination Report™) describing in. detail
all Services performed, and the contract price ‘earned, to and
including the date of termination. In addition, at the State’s
discretion, the Contractor shall, within fifteen (15) calendar days
of notice of early termnination, develop and submit to the State a
transition plan for Services under the Agreement.

10, PROPERTY OWNERSHIP/DISCLOSURE.

10.1 Asused in this Agreement, the word “Property” shall mean
all data, information and things-developed: or obtained during the
performance of of acquired or developed by reason of, this
Agreement; mcludmg, but not limited to, all studies, reports, files,
formulae, surveys, maps, -charts, sound recordings, video
recordings, pictorial reproductions, drawings, analyses, graphic
representations, computer programs, computer printouts, notes,
letters,. memoranda, papers, and documents; all whether finished or
unfinished. '
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10.2 All-data and any Property which has been received from the
State, or purchased with funds provided for that purpose under this
Agreement, shall be the property of the State, and shall be réturned
to the State upon demand or upon termination of this Agreement
for any réason.

10.3 Disclosure of datd, information and other records shall be
govemed by N.H. RSA chapter-91-A and/or other appllcable Taw:;
Disclosure requires prior written approvalof the State.

11. CONTRACTOR’S RELATION TO THE STATE. In the
performance of this Agreement the Contractor is in all respects an
independent contractar, and is neither an agent nor an employee of
the State. Neither the Contractor nor any of its officers, employees,
agenis or members shall have authority to'bind the State or recejve
any benefits, workers’ compensation or other emoluments:
provided by the State to its employees.

12. ASSIGNMENT/DELEGATION/SUBCONTRACTS:

12.1 Contractor.shall provide the-State written notice at least fifteen
{13) calendar days before any proposed assignment; delegation, or
other transfer of any interest in this Agreement. No such
assignment, delegation, or other transfer shall be effective without
the written consent of the State.

12.2 For purposes of paragraph 12, a Change of Control shall
constitute assignment. “Change of Control” means (a) merger,
consolidation. or a transaction or series of related transactions in
which a third party, together with its affiliates, becomes the direct
or indirect owner of fifty: percent (50%) or more of the voting
shares or similar -equily interests, or combined voting power of the
Contractor, or (b) the sale of all or substantially all of the assets of
the Contractor, _

12.3 None of the Services shall be subcontracted by the Contractor
without prior written notice and consent of the State.

124 The State is- entitled to copies of all subcontracts and
assignment agreements. and shall not be bound by any prov:swns
contained in a subcontract or an assignment agreement to which it

is. oot a party.

13. INDEMNIFICATION.: The Contractor shall indemnify,
defend, and hold harmiess the State, its officers, and employees
from and against all actions, claims, damages, demands,
judgments, fines, liabilitiés, losses, and other expenses, including,
without limitation, reasonable attorneys’ fees, arising out of or
refating to this Agreement directly or indirectly arising from death,
pcrsonal  injury, property damage, inellectual property
infringement, or other claims asscried against the State, its officers,
or employees caused by the acts or omissions-of negligence,
reckless. or willfitl misconduct, or fraud by the: Contractor, .its
emplovees, agéxits, or subcontractors. The State shall not be liable
for any costs incurred by the Contractor arising under this
paragraph 13, Natw:tl’lstandmg the foregomg, nothing herein:
contained shall b2 deemed to constitute a waiver of thie State's
sovereign imimutity, which immunity is hereby reserved to the
State. This covenant in paragraph 13 shall. survive the termination

of this. Agreement.
Cc:mtractor-Iuiliaiﬂr—>

14. INSURANCE.
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14.1 The Contractor shall, at its sole expense; obtain- and
CDnn’nuoust maintain in force, and shall require any subcontractor
or assignee to obtain and maintain in force, the following
insurance:

14.1.1 commercial general liability insurance against all claims of
bodily injuiy, death arproperty damage, inamounts of not less than
$1,000,000 per ocouirence and $2,000,000 aggregate or excess;
and

14.1.2 special cause of loss coverage form covering all Property
subject to subparagraph 10.2 herein, it an amount. not less than
80% of the whole replacement value of the Property.

14.2 The policies described in subparagraph 14.1 hefein shall be on
policy forms and endorsements approved for use in the Stale of
New Hampshire by the N.H, Department of Insuraiicé, and issued
by insurers licensed in'the State of New Hampshire.

14.3 The- Contracter shall fum:sh to the Contracting Officer
identified in- block 1.9, or any succéssor, a certificate(s) of
insurance for all insurance required under this Agreement; At the
request of the Contracting Officer, ofany successor, the Contractor
shall provide certificate(s) of insurance for all renewil(s) of
insnrance required under this Agreement. The certificate(s) of
insurance and any renewals thercof shall be autached and are
incorporated herein by reference.

15. WORKERS' COMPENSATION,

15.1 By signing this agreement, the Comtractor agrees, certifies and
warranis that the Contractor is in compliance with or exempt from,
the requirements of N.H. RSA chapter 281-A (“Workers'
Compensation”).

15.2 To the extent the Contractor is-subject to the requirements of
N.H. RSA chapter 281-A, Contractor shall maintain, and require
any subconttactor or assignee to. secure and maintdin, payment of
Workers' Compensation in connection with activities which the
person proposes to undertake pursuant to this Agreement. The
Centragtor shall furnish the Contracting Officer identificd in block
1.9, or any successor, proof of Workers™ Compensahon in the
manner described in N:H. RSA chapter 281-A and any applicable
rencwal(s) thereof, which shall be attached and are incorporated
hereinby reference. The State shail notbe responsible for payment
of any Workers® Compensation premiums orfor any other claim or
benefit for Contractor, or any subcontractor or employee of
Contractor, which might arise under apphcahle State of New
Hampshire Workers’ Compensation laws' in connection with the
performance of the Services under this Agreement.

16. WAIVER OF BREACH. A State's failure to-enforee its rights
with respect to any single or continuing breach of this Agreement
shall fiotdct as a watver of the right of the State té later enforce any
such rights or to enforee any other oriany subsequent breach,

17. NOTICE. Any notice by a party hereto to the other party shall

‘be deemed to have been duly delivered or given al the time of
mailing by certified mail, postage prepaid, in 2 Unitéd States Post
Office addiessed to the parties at the addresses given inblocks 1.2
and 1.4, herein,
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18. AMENDMENT. This Agreement may be amended, waived or
discharged only by-an instrument in writing signed by the parties

hereto and only after approval of such amendment, waiver or

discharge by the Govérnor-and Executive Council of the State of

New Hampshire unless no such approval is required under the-

circumstances pufsuant to State law, rule or policy.

19. CHOICE.OF LAW AND FORUM.
19.1 This Agreement.shall be governed, interpreted and constriied

ir accordance with the Jaws of the State of New Hampshire except.

where the Federal supremacy clause requires otherwise. The
wording used in this Agreement is the wording chosen by the
partics to express. their mutual intent, and no rule of construction
shall be applied against or in favor of any party.

19.2 Any actions arising out of this Agreement, including the
breach or alleged breach thereof, may not be submitted to binding
arbitration, but must, instead, be ‘brought and mmnmmed in the

Metrimack Cuunzy Superiof Court of New Hampshxre whiich shall.

have exclissive jurisdiction theréof,

20. CONFLICTING TERMS. In the event of a conflict between
the terms of this P-37 form (as modified in EXHIBIT A) and any
other portion of this Agreement including any attachments thereto,
the terms of the P-37 (as modified in EXHIBIT A) shall conirol,

21. THIRD PARTIES; This Agreement is being entered into for
the sole benefit of the parties hereto, and nothing herein, express or
implied, is:intended to or will confer any legal or equitable right,
benefit, or remedy of any nature uponvany other person,

22, HEADINGS. The héadings throughout the Agreement are for
reference purposes only, and the words contained therein shall in
no way be held to explain, modify, amplify or aid in the
interpretation, construction or'meaning of the provisions of this
Agreement.

23. SPECIAL PROVISIONS. Additional or modifying
provisions sct forth in the-attached EXHIBIT A are incorporated
herein by reference.

24, FURTHER ASSURANCES. The Contractor, along with its
agents and affiliates, shall, at its own cost-and expense, execute any
additional documents and take sach further actions as may be.
reasonably required to carry out the provisions of this Agreement
and give effect to the transaclions contemplated hereby.

25. SEVERABILITY. Inthe event any of the provisions of this
Agreement are Held by a court of competent jurisdiction to be.
contrary to any state or federal law, the remaining provisions of
this Agreement will remain in full force and effect,

26. ENTIRE AGREEMENT. This Agreement, which may be

exccuted in a mumber of counierpans, each of which shall be
deerned an original, constitutés tle' entire. agreement and
understanding between the parties, and supersedes all prior
agreements and understandings with respect 1o the subject matter

Contractor Imﬂals&l

Date

hereof.
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EXHIBIT A - SPECIAL PROVISIONS

Theré are no special provisions of this-contract.

Page 5 of 14 . é Z;
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EXHIBIT B - SCOPE OF SERVICES

1. INTRODUCTION: )
1.1. Covered Bridge Qutdoor Construction-Corp. (hereinafier referred to as the “Contractor”) hereby agrees to
provide the State of New Hampshire (hereinafter referred to as the “State™), Depa.rtment of Administrative

Services, with Carpentry Services in accordance:with the bid submission in response to State Request for Bid
3009-23 and as described herein.

2. CONTRACT DOCUMENTS:
2.1. This Contract'consists of the following documents (“Coiitract Docuinents™):
o State of New Hampshire Terms and Conditions, General Provisions Form P-37
» EXHIBITA, Special Provisions
« EXHIBITB  Scope of Services
e EXHIBITC Method of Payment

232. Inthe cvent of any conflict among the terins or provisions of the documenis listed abave, the following order of
priority shall indicate which documents control: (1) Form Number P-37 as. modified by EXHIBIT A “Special
Provisions”, (2) EXHIBIT B “Scope of Services™ (3) EXHIBIT C “Method of Pavment“

3. TERM OF CONTRACT: _

3.1. "Theterm of the contract shall commence June 1, 2025, or upon execution by the Commissioner of the
Department of Administrative Services, whichever is later (the “effective date™) and shall continue thereafier for
a period of approximately five (3) years.

3.2. The Contract may be extended for up to,an additional two (2) years thereafter upon the same terms, conditions
and pricing structure with the approval of the Commissioner of the Department of Administrative Services.

4. SCOPE OF:-WORK:

4.1. Contractor shall supply.all labor, tools, transportation, materials, equipment and permits as necessary and
required to perform services as described hercin.

4.2. Individual projects are not to excecd $25,000 including all costs associated with any individual project,
including supervision, labor, mileage, equipment, construction equipment, machinery and supplies etc., unless a.
waiver is granted by the Director of the Department of Public Works.

4.3. Contractor shall provide material safety data sheets with the delivery of any and all products covered by RSA
277-A, the “Worker’s Right to Know Act.”

4.4. The Contractor(s) shall provide supervision, labor, materials, transportation, tools, equipment, and machinery
necessary to satisfactorily complete the Carpentry Services including, but not lifiited to:

44.1. Demolition of gypsum wall board, plaster, metal, masonry-and wood wall systems
4.4.2. Demolition, repair or replacement of flooring and subflcoring systems

44.3. Rough carpentry related to commercial construction of walls, doors, windows and ceilings
44 4. Finish carpentry related to commercial construction of walls, doors, windows and céilings
4:4.5. Patching, caulking, priming and paintihg or staining of renovated areas
4.4.6. Installing-ceramic and other wall tiles
44.7. Demolition, repair or replacement of ceilings
4.4.8. Demolition, repair or replacement of ‘suspended acoustical tile ceilings
4.4.9. Demolition, repair; fabrication, installation or.replacement. of cabinetry
4.4.10. Installation and remioval of temporary enclosures comprised of materials rated for the purpose
4.4.11. Protection of flooring and countertop surfaces with Builder Board, Ram Board or equivalent
4.4.12. Demolition, repair, or replacement of building envelope componerits
4.4.13.Installing of firestopping or caulking
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4.6

4.7

4.8,

49,

4.10:

4.11.

4.12.

4.13.

4.4.14. Restorzation cleaning of renovated areas

5. Agencies shall request services by issning a Request for Quote (RFQ) with scope of work detailing as much

infounati'on about the proj ectas available

projects at rates estabhshed in this. contract(s)

For Catpentry Services féquiring iniriediaté attention, the Contractor(s) will wark on a time-and materials basis
at rates as detafled hereit. ' When submitting an invoice, the Contractor(s) must provide detail of the work
performed, dates and location of the Carpcntry Services, a copy of the material mvoices to verify mark up and
number of hours per person worked.

4.7.1.Hourly Rate - The Hourly Rate per person with tools and equipment to provide Carpentry Services as
described herein. The Hourly Rate shall be for the actual amount of time at the respective job sites.

4.7.2.Materials - All materials shall be invoiced at a.markup not to-exceed 10% over-contractor-or
subcontractor’s cost..

4.7.3. Subcontractors - The use.of any:subcontractors must be approved in advance by the State Project:
Manager. Any work performed by subicontractors shall be invoiced at a- markupnot to-exceed 10% over
contractor-cost,

4.7.4. Equipment — For any machxnery or special equipment required to complete the Carpentry Services, the
Contractor(s) will receive a réasonable rental charge to which no percentage will be added. This mntal
charge must be approved in advance by the Agency Project Manager before any work begins, The
rental rate shall include all fuel, transportation, lubricants, and the upkeep of the equipment. Equipment
does not include any small tools and accessories for small tools.

The Contractor shall secure any permits, schedule inspections and be on site during inspections, The Contractor
shall ensure that mspectlons are made by the:appropriate State and or local authority having jurisdiction. The

Contractor(s) will invoice the State forthe cost-of the permiit or inspection foes, at no’ markup, as-part of the
Carpentry Services. The permit or ingpection cost will be itemized on the detailed invoice at the completion of

the work.

For Scheduled Carpentry Services completed on a fixed price basis, thé Contractorshall provide information on
the invoice that includes detail of the work performed, dates and location of the Carpentry Services,

All work perfbnned under any ensuing contract(s) shall be scheduiled by the Agency Project Manager,
The successful Contractor(s) shall notify the Agency Project Manager of any maintenance related issues that are

_discovéred while performing the work.

The Contractor(s) shall also be aware. of laws and regulations relating to hazardous materials that may be
encountered during construction: operations. The health and saféty of employees, the'general public, and the
potential of damage to the overall environinent is possible if hazardous materials aré not recognized, reported,
and the appropriate action taken to dispose of, remove from the site, or otherwise contain the possible
contaminants.

4.12.1. If at any time during the performance of tlie work required by the Contract(s), a Contractor(s) finds,
‘or-has reason to suspect, the presence of asbestos, lead paint, or other hazardous materials in the
work area, the Contractor(s) shall immediately-notify the State representative setting forth their
observations, suspicions and requesting instructions. No further work shall be conducted in the
area of the contaminated material until the site has been investigated and the State has given:
approval to continue the work: in the area. At the same time, the Contractor(s} shall withdraw all
personnel from the potentially contaminated area. The Contractor(s) shall fully-cooperate with the
State and perform any remedial work as directed.

The Contractor(s) shall take all reasonable precautions for the safety of, and shall provide all reasonable
protection to prevent damage, injury or loss to:
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4.14.

4.15.

4.16.

4.117.

4.18.

4.19,

4.20;

421,

4.22,

4.13.1.  All employees of the.work and all other persons who may be affected thereby;

4.13.2.  All work, materals, and equipment, whether in storage on or off the site, under the care; custody or
control of the successful Contractor(s) or any-of their subcontractor(s).

The Contractor(s) shall initiate; maintain, and.supervise all safety precautions and programs in connection with-
the work. The Contractor(s) shall provide the necessary equipment and comply with all City, State and or
Federal safety regulations.

The Contractor(s) shall-give all notices and comply with all applicable laws, ordinances, mles, regulanons and
lawful orders of a public authority bedring onthe safety of personnel or property or their protection from
damage, injury, or loss. '

The Contractor(s) shall erect and maintain; as required by existing conditions and progress of the work, all
reasonable safeguards for safety and protectxon including posting danger signs.and other warnings against
hazards, promulgating safety regulations, and notifying owners and users of the-adjacent utilities.

The Contractor(s) shall provide adequate supervision of their employees to ensure complete and satisfactory
performance of all work in accordance with the terms of the contract(s).

The Contractor(s) shall ensurte that all materials shall be of the best quality, ail work is. completed in a
professional manner, and all aspects of the project are delivered in good working order, complete and perfect in
every respect. All materials and equipment shall be new unless otherwise specified and all Carpentry Services
shall be good quality free from faulfs and defects.

The Contractor(s) shall further ensure that all dirt and debris resulting from the work under any resulting
contraci(s) shall be disposed ofat the end of each day or at the completion of work, The Contractor(s) is
responsible for propetly disposing of any materials removed or replaced. In addition, any areas disturbed should
be restored to their original.condition.

The: Contractor(s) shall supervise-and direct the work, using their best skills and attention. The Contractor(s)
shall be solely responsible for all construction mearis, methods, techniques, sequences and procedures and for
coordinating all portions,of the work. All aspects of the project shall be-subject to the inspéction and approval
of the State. The Contractor(s) guarantees to repair, replace,. re-execute, or otherwise correct any defect in
workmanship, material, or the like that fails to conform to the requirements of the State; or that appear during
the progress of the work or within.one year of final acceptance by the State. The Contractor(s) shall supply the
State with all warranty information whether it be expressed or implied.

The Contractor(3) shall perform all the work-and fumish all the materials, tools, equipment and safety devices
necessary to perform in the. manner and within the time hereinafter specified. The Contractor(s) shall completz
the entire work to the satisfaction of the State and in accordance with the specifications hersin mentioned, at the
price herein agreed upon and fixed, therefore, All the work, labor furnished under this contract, shall be done,
and farnished strictly pufsuant to, and in conformity with the specifications described herein, and the directions
of the State representatives as given from time to time during the progress of the work, under the temms of this
contract(s).

The Contractor(s) shall adequately secure and protect their own tools, equipment, materials arid supplies. The
‘State assumes no liability for any damage, theft, or negligent injury to the Contractof’s property or to the
property of their employees, agents or approved sib-contractors.

. COMMERCIAL REQUIREMENTS:

5.1

The State 6f New Hampshire reserves the right to.add or delété locations/equipment throughout the term .of the
contract. For the addition of a new location or new equipment, a fequesting agency through the Division of
Procurement and Support Services shall submit a. request; for quote (RFQ) including a-detailed scope of work to
the contractor. Quotes shall be in accordance with pricing and service requirements contained herein and no
service shall be performed until documented acceptance by the State is received. The Contract may be.amended,
by agreement of the parties, effective upon approval of the commissioner of the Department of Administrative
Services or designee, without further approval needed by the Governor and Executive Councilas long as the
price limitation is unchanged or decreased as a result of the new or deleted locations/equipment.
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52,

5.3.

57.
58.

5.9.

3.10.

Unless otherwise stated in:the Scope of Services, all services performed under this Contract(s) shall be
performed between the hours of 7:00 A.M. and 5:00 P.M. fot State business days, unless other arrangements are
made in advance with the State. Any deviation in work hours shall be pre-approved by the Contracting Officer..
The State requires ten=day advance knowledge of said work schedules to provide security and access to-
respective work areas, No premium charges shall be paid for aiy off-hour work,

The, Contractor shall not commence work until a conference is held with each State agency intending to utilize
the Contractor’s services, at which réprésentatives of thé Contractor and the State are present, The conference
will be arranged by the State agency.

. The State shall require correction of any defective'work and the repair of any damages to any part of a building

or its appurtenances. caitsed by the Contractor or its. empldyees, subcontractors, €équipment or supplies. The
Contractor shall correct, repair, or replace all defective work, as needed, to complete said work in satisfactory
condition, and damages so caused in order to restore the bulldmg and its appurtenances to their prev:ous
condition. Upon failure of the Contractor to proceed promptly with.the necessary: corrections or repairs, the
Staté may withhold any amount necessary to correct all defective work or repair all damages from pavments to
the Contractor.

. 'The work staff shall.consist of qualified.persons completely familiar with the products and equipment that they

will use. The Contracting Officer may require the Contractor to dismiss from the work such employees as the
Contracting Officer deems incompetent, careless, insubordinate, or otherwise objectionable, or whose continued
employment on the work is deemed to be contrary to the public interest or inconsistent with the best intérest of
security and the State.

Neitherthe Contractor nor its employees or subcontractors shall represent themselves as employees or agents of
the State.

While on State property the Contractor, its employees, and its sub-contractors shall be subject to the authority
and control of the State, but under no circumstances shall such persons be deemed to be-employees.of the State.
All personnel shall observe all regulations or special restrictions in effect at any State agency location at which
seTvices.ate to be provided.

The. Contractor’s personnel shall be allowed only in arcas where services are to be provided. The use of State
telephones by the Contractor, its employees, or its sub-contractors is prohibited.

If sub-contractors are to be utilized, Contractor shall provide information regarding the proposed sub:contrdctors
including the name of the company, their address, contact person and three references for clients they are
currently servicing, Approval by the State must be received prior to-a sub-contractor starting any work.

WARRANTY REQUIREMENTS:

6.1.

The successful Contractor shall be required to-provide warranties on all work performed by the Contractor fora
period of niot less than one (1) year or, when equipment is installed, the manufacturer’s standard warrantv
period, whichever is greater, comiencinig on the date that the eqmpment is received; inspected, and accepted by
the State of New Hampshire. The waitanty shall cover 100% of repair or replacement costs, including all parts,
shipping, labor, travel, lodging, and expenses.

. * USAGE REPORTING:

7:1.

The Contractor shall submit a quarterly and annual usage report for analysis for each state agency or eligible
participant. Reports are due no later than 30 days after the end of each ¢alendar quater to Steven Burgess at the
Bureau-of Purchase and Property and sent electronic fo Steven. H. Burgess@DASNH Gov. At a minimum, the
Repott shall include:

7.1.1. Contract Number

7.1.2, Utilizing Agency-and Eligible Participant

7.1.3. Total Cost-of all Services/Products Purchased. Ability to-sort by agency/eligible participant,
7.1.4. Preferred in Excel format

OBLIGATIONS AND LIABILITY OF THE CONTRACTOR:
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8.1, The Contractor:shall provide all Carpentiy Services strictly pursuant to, and in confcnmty with, the
Speclﬁcanons described in State REB 3009-25, as described herein, and under the terms of this Contract.

8.2, Itisthe responsibility of the Contractor to maintain this contract and New Hampshire Vendor Registration with
up-to-date contact information.

8.3. Contract specific comac&mfonnafion‘(Saias-contact, Contractor contract manager, etc.) shall be sent to the
State’s Contracting Office listed in Box 1.9 of Form P-37.

8.4. Additionally, all updates.i.c., telephone numbers, contact names, email addresses, W9, tax identification
nuinbers are required to be current through a formal ‘electronic submission to the Bureau of Purchase and
Property at: htips:// v/purchasing/vendorregistration/{S(c OfzovSShae J543ipygSids)hvelcome.aspx.

8.5. The Contractor shall agree, to hold the State of NH harmless from liability arising out of i injuries or damage
caused while performing this work. The Contractor shall agree that any damage to building(s), materials,

equipment, or other property during the performance of the service shall be repaired at its own expense, to the
State’s satisfaction,

8.6. Contractor shall not be allowed.to require any other type of order, nor shall the Contractor be allowed to require
the filling out or signing of any other document by State of New Hampshire personnel.

8.7. The successful Contractor shall pe_:rform all work and furnish all materials, tools, equipment, and safety devices
.necessary to perform the. requested services in the mannerand within the time hereinafter specified. The
Contractor shall provide said services to. the satisfaction of the State:and in accordance with the specifications
and at the price set foith herein. -All work to be performed and all- eqmpment to bé furnished pursiant to the
Scope of Services included herein shall be performed and fumished in strict accordance with the specifications
included herein, the terms of any contract awarded as a resuit of this solicitation, any associated contract
drawings, and the directions of State representatives as may be given from time totime while the work is in
progress.

8.8. The successful Contractor shall take full responsxblhty for the work 1o be- performed pursuant to the Scope of
Services included herein; for the protection of said work; and for preventing injuries to persons and damage to
property and utilitics on or about said work. The Contractor shall in'no way be relieved of such responsibility
by any anthority-of the State to give permission or issue orders rcl'ating to any pax’t of the-work, by any such
permission givenor ordérs issued, or by any failure of the State to give such permission or issue such orders,
The successful Contractor shall bear all losses acéruing tothe Contractor as a result of the amount, quality, or
character of the work required, or because the nature-or characteristics of the work location is different from
what the Contractor estimated or expected, or due to delays or other complications caused by the weather;
elements, or other natural causes.

8.9. The successful Contractor agrees that any damage or injury to any.buildings, materials, equipmeat, or other
property résulting from the Contractor’s perfotrhance of the'requested services shall be repaired at the
Contractor’s-own expense so that such buildings, materials, equipment, or othér property are satisfactorily
restored to-their prior condition.

9, DEBARMENT, SUSPENSION, INELIGIBILITY AND VOLUNTARY EXCLUSION LOWER TIER
COVERED TRANSACTIONS: : |
9.1. The Contractor certifies, by-signature of this contract, that ni¢ither it nor its principals is presently debarred,

suspended proposed for debarment, declared ineligible, or voluntarily excluded from participation in this
transaction by any Federal Department or Agency.

10. CONFIDENTIALITY & CRIMINAL RECORD:

10.1. If requested by the using agency, the Contractor and its employees, dand Sub-Contractors (if any), shall be
required to sign and submit a Confidential Nature of Department Records Form. and a-Criminal Authorization

Records Form. These forms shall be submitted to the individual using agency prior to the start-of any work.
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EXHIBIT C - METHOD OF PAYMENT
11. CONTRACT PRICE:
11.1. The Contractor hereby agrees to provide Carpentry Services in strict compliance with the terms and conditions
specified in Extiibit B for an.amount up;to and not to exceed a price of $2,500,000.00; this figure shall not be

considered a guaranteed or minimum figure; however, it shall be considered 2 maximum figure from the
effective date through the expiration date as indicated in Form P-37 Block 1.7.

12. PRICING STRUCTURE;:

Description

Camenter/Lead
Helper

Description

Carpenter/Lead
Helper

Description

Carpenter/Lead
Helper
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Description

.-Friday

| soreMto6is9- |
- AM for immediate’ 1

work -

'.;ifMOnday thru

HourLy Rate

Carpenter/Lead

-~ $190.00

He;per

$11000

812500

Description

B Fﬂday o
7 AM tojS PM for

Mondaj}"thm‘
" Friday
5:01 PM to 6:59

: ‘ AM for 1mmed1ate ;

wnark

Sm’sday for' :
§“ 1mmedlate

_work

: S_t%th Holidays for
. "immediate work

Tioury Raie

Hourly Rate

Campenter/Lead

© $175.00.

© $190.00

$225 00 “.

$2?.5 00

- $100.00 -

| Helper _

81000
“Séction 6 - STRAFI

$12500

Description

Monday thrli
o Friday* T
7AM:t0'S PM- for
Quoted Projects

"Monday thru
. Friday,

| - 5:01 PMto 6:59"
: AMfor :mmed:ate ,"

work °

Satirday & -

- Sunday for

) work

rmmedlate )

Hourly Rate

Hourly Rate

Camenter/Lead

$115 00 -

. $120.00

$70 00

S'b 00

elper

Descripticn

7 AM fD 5 PM for
.Quoted Projects

1 _Monday thru

Friday
5:01 PM to 6:59

AM for lrnmedlate

work

wo_rk

immediate" .

|'- State Holidays for -
- ifiriediate work -

Hourly Rate "_ d 5 i g

Carpenter/Lead

. 25000

$275.00

Helper

$i2s00 |

_ $150.00

- $175.00
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Description

Carpenter/Lead

Hetper

Description -AM for immediate
Carpenter/Lead

Helper

Description

Carpenter/Lead

Helper

13. PRICING QUOTATIONS FOR INDIVIDUAL PROJECTS:

131, State will request quotations by providing a SOW describing the services required and the applicable technical
qualifications, Contractor must retum quotes within five (3) business days, unless altemnate arrangemenits have
been made with the requesting agency. The quoted hourly rates shall not exceed the rates established under this
contract for the county the work will be completed in. The SOW shall be issued to all Contractors under this
contract for a quote. The project engagement will be based upon the lowest cost qualified quote.

13.2. The Contractor shall not be allowed to require any other type of order, nor shall the Contractor be allowed to
require the filling out or signing of any other document by State of New Hampshire personnel.

14, CONTRACT RETAINAGE:

14.1. The state shall retain 5% of total fixed fees from each milestone payment, to be released upon the completion

and acceptance by the State.

15. INVOICE:

15.1. Itemized invoices shall be submitted to the individual agency after the completion of the job/services and shall

include a brief descriptior of the work done along with the location of work.
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15:2. Contractor shall be paid within 30 days after receipt of properly docuinented invoice aid acceptance of the work
tothe State’s satisfaction.

153. The invoice shall be sent to the address of the using-agency under agreement.
16, SUBCONTRACTOR RELEASE:

16.1. Neither the final paymentnor any part.of the retained percentage shall become due.until the Contractor shall
deliver a complete release of all claim arising under arid by virtue of this Contrict, including claims for all-
Subconfractors and suppliers of ¢ither materials or labor, plus a release of the Contract Bond and a statemerit
that all Subcontractors and supphcrs have been paid. The Commissioner, may pay any and all such claims, in
whole or in part, and deduct the amount or amoimts so paid from any partial or firial payment.

162, The accéptance of the Final Payment by the Contractor shall be and shall operate as a release to the Contractor
of all claims and of all liability to the State for all things done or furnished in connection with this work. No.
payment, however, final or otherwise, shall operate to release the Contractor and its Sureties from any
obligations under this Contract or.the Contract Bond. Acceptance of Final Payment shal! not impact any

warrantees provided by the Contractor with respect to this project.
17. PAYMENT:

17.1. Payments may be madé via ACH or P-Card. Use the following link to-enroll with the State Treasurv for ACH
payments: hitps://www.nh.govitreasury,
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State of New Hampshire
Department of State

CERTIFICATE

I, David M. Scanlan, Secretary of State of the State of New Hampshire, do hereby certify that COVERED BRIDGE QUTDOOR
CONSTRUCTION CORP. is a New Hampshire Profit Corporation registered to transact business in New Hampshire on December
14, 2012. I further certify that all fees and documents required by the Secretary of State’s office have been received and is in good

standing as far as this office is concerned.

Business ID: 716303
Certificate Number: 0007170860

IN TESTIMONY WHEREOQOF,

I hereto set my hand and cause to be affixed
the Seal of the State of New Hampshire,
this 29th day of April A.D. 2025.

David M. Scanlan

Secretary of State




Certiﬁcate of All[’hﬂ l'ity #1 {Corporation, Noh_—PfaﬁJ: Corporation)

Corporate Re«mluhon

LR vty (i ‘ova![
, hereby certify that T ard duly elected Cletk/Secretary/Officer.of
(que) ,

. T hereby certify the following:is a true copy of a vote taken at.
{Name of Corporaiion)

R n t Qr
[BV‘!“& rgar‘t),‘]“ ov—}d:ﬁ;l‘ [ofb‘} f\)d+\‘> P
a meeting of the Board of Directors/shareholders, duly cilled and held on_ “;l 8 20 _3;‘5

at which a querum of the Directors/sharsholders were present and voting:

VOTED: That, Pau Mb ‘\Qd

y list more than one person) is
(Name and Tiile)

duly authorized to enter into contracts or agreemants on behalf of

with the State of New Hampshire and any of

Name of Corporgtion ) ‘ rd) ;
(ame o Corporgton) gt = Adenr cms’rmrﬁ\:b (o
its agencies or departments and further is authorized 10 execute any documents
which mmay in hisher judgment be desitable or necessary 16 effect the purpose of
tus voie.
Thereby certify that said vote has not been amended or repealed-and remains in full force
and éffect as of the date of the.contract io. which this. certificate is attached. I further certify that it
is understood that the State of New Hampshire will tely on this certificate as evidence that the
person(s) listed above currently ‘occupy the posmon(sJ indicated and that- they have full authority
to bind the corporation. To the extent that there are:any limits on the authority of any listed
individual to bind the corporation in contracts with the State of New Hampshire, all such
limitations are expressly stated herein.

(Name & Title)
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CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

COVERS0 ____  oPID;BJ
DATE (MMDDIYYYY)

05/07/2025

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy{ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed.
If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on
this certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such‘endorsementgs).

PRODUCER

IMMANUEL tnsurance Agy- SAN
PO Box 300 3 Brittany Lane
Barrington, NH 03825-0300
IMMANUEL Ins Agy Inc &

603-335-4300

ACT IMMANUEL Ins Agy Inc &
PHONE ey, 503-3354300

FX. 1 503-822-7101

L . david@immanuelins.com

149 Hidden Oak Wa:
Manchester, NH 03102

INSURER(_S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #
wsurer A ; Concord Group Insurance 20672
INSURED msurer g ; 1ravelers Insurance Company
Covered Bridge Qutdoor Construction Corp. i i
Paul Bilodeal \nsurer c - Main Street America 10787

INSURER D :
INSURERE :
INSURERF :

COVERAGES

CERTIFICATE NUMBER; _

REVISION NUMBER:

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TQ THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

(R TYPE OF INSURANCE i BUBR POLICY NUMBER : fW‘Bﬂ% UMITS
A | X | COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY EACH OCCURRENCE s 2,000,000
| cLamsmae | X | occur 20007856 01/22/2025|01/22/2026 | BAMASETORENTED | 50,000
- MED EXP {Any cne person) s 5,000
|| PERSONAL & ADV. INJURY | 3 2,000,000
GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: GENERAL AGGREGATE $ 4,000,000
PoLICY \:I S D Lec PRODUCTS - COMP/OP AGG | § 4,000,000
OTHER: 5
C | automomLe LasiLTY o oy GLELIMIT | 1,000,000
ANY AUTO CA00030137 08/22/2024 | 0812212025 | oniLY INJURY (Per person) | 5
OWNED SCHEDULED
AUTOS ONLY AUTGS BODILY INJURY (Per accident) | §
X | HIRED NON-QWNED PROPERTY DAIAGE
| A aUTOS oNLY AUTOS ONLY or accident) 3
5
UMBRELLA LIAB OCCUR EACH OCCURRENCE s
EXCESS LIAB CLAIMS-MADE AGGREGATE s
DED | | RerenTiONS 3
B |WORKERS COMPENSATION PER oTH-
AND EMPLOYERS'® LIABILITY YIN 8RR | [OF
ANY PROPRIETOR/PARTNER/EXECUTIVE UB-85093917-23-42-G 09/17/2024( 091712025 | o | cacn accipent 3 500,000
OFFICERMEMBER EXCLUDED NJA
(Mandatory In NH) E.L. DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE] § 500,000
If yes, describe under 500,000
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below £ DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT | § !

DESCRIPTION OF CPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / YEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Scheduls, may be attached if r-nnre space is required)

CERTIFICATE HOLDER

CANCELLATION

Department of Administrative
Services Bureau of Purchase

and Property
25 Capitol Street

Concord, NH 03301

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE

THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE
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