
State of New Hampshire
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL & CULTURAL RESOURCES

OFFICE OF THE COMMISSIONER

1 72 Pembroke Road Concord, New Hampshire 03301
Phone; 603-271-2411 Fax- 603-271-2629

TDD Access: Relay NH 1 -800-735-2964
dncr.nh gov

NEW

May 7,2025

Her Excellency, Governor Kelly A. Ayotte
and the Honorable Council

State House

Concord, New Hampshire 03301

REQUESTED ACTION

Pursuant to Chapter 113 (Laws of 2023) Section 7, II, authorize the Department of Natural and Cultural Resources (DNCR)
to accept and expend Federal Emergency Management Agency (FEMA) grant funds in the amount of $287,001 from the
New Hampshire Department of Safety (NHDOS) to be used to supplant funds specifically for repairs to the asphalt parking
lot and seawall at North Hampton Beach State Park, effective upon Governor and Executive Council approval through June
30, 2025. 100% Federal Funds.

Funds are to be adjusted in Fiscal Year 2025 in the following account:

03-035-035-350030-55650000, L23:1 XII-Roofing& Repair

Class- Account Description
FY25 Current

Adjusted
Authorized

Requested
Action

Revised FY25

Adjusted
Authorized

OOS-000010 General Funds $1,182,900 ($287,001) $895,899

OOD-488523-69 Fed Rev Xfers Fr Oth Agenc $0 $287,001 $287,001

Total Revenue $1,182,900 $0 $1,182,900

034-500161 Capital Projects $1,182,900 $0 $1,182,900

Total Expenses $1,182,900 so $1,182,900

EXPLANATION

In June 2024, DNCR entered into a contract with Lupoli Excavator, LLC., approved by Governor and Executive Council
on June 26, 2024 Item #130. (Item attached) The purpose of this contract was to perform repairs to the North Hampton State
Park parking lot and seawall for damage that occurred during a weather event which was ultimately authorized as a
reimbursable cost under declaration by the Federal Emergency Management Agency (FEMA). Thus, DNCR was able to
receive back 75% or $287,001 of the total project cost in federal reimbursement funds.

The Department of Natural and Cultural Resources requests approval to supplant a portion of general funds approved in the
capital budget for the biennium ending June 30, 2025 with federal grant funds received, as authorized under Chapter 113
(Laws of 2023) Section 7:

Powers of Governor and Council. The governor and council are hereby authorized and empowered:

I. To cooperate with and enter into such agreements with the federal government, or any agency thereof as they may deem
advisable, to secure federal fundsfor the purposes hereof



II. To accept anyfederal funds which are. or become availablefor any project under sections I and 2 beyond the estimated
amounts. The net appropriation ofstatefundsfor any projectfor which such additional federal funds are accepted shall be
reduced by the amount ofsuch additional funds, and the amount ofbonding authorized by section 5 shall be reduced by the
same amount.

Should the Governor and Council approve of this request, the Department will notify the Treasurer so the amount bonded
for project 2023, 113:1, XI, 1 for Roofing and Repair is reduced by $287,001, as required in Paragraph II.

Respectfully submitted.

Jarah L. Stewart

Commissioner



State of New Hampshire
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL & CULTURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF PARKS & RECREATION

172 Pembroke Road Concord, New Hampshire 03301
Phor>e: 603-271-3556 Fax; 603-271-3553

TDD Access: Relay NH 1-800-735-2964
nhstateparks.org 130

June 12. 2024

His Excellency, Goverrtor Christopher T. Sununu
and the Honorable Executive Council

State House

Concord, New Hampshire 03301

REQUESTED ACTIOW

Pursuant to RSA 21-l:80, 1(b), authorize the Department of Natural and Cultural Resources, Division of Parfcs and
Recreation, to enter into a contract with Lupoii Excavators, LL.C. (VC 4205736), North Hampton, NH In the amount of

$382,669 to provide asphalt parking lot and seawall repairs at North Hampton State Park effective upon Governor and

Council approval through August 30,2024. 100% Capital Fund.

Funding is available in account, 123:1X1 ♦ Roofing and Repairs, as follows:

03-035*035-350030-55650000-034-500162 - Capital Projects

FY2024

$382,669

EXPLANATION

The Division of Parks and Recreation manages North Hampton State Park in North Hampton, NH. Due to storm damage
and erosion, the parking tot and the seawall at the park need to be repaired. .

On April 9, 2024, an invitation to submit bids for Parking Lot and Seawall repair at North Hampton State Park was posted
on the Division of Purchase and Property's website, the Division of Parks and Recreation's website, and the following

construction services' websites: Construction Summary of NH, Alpha Graphics, McGraw Hill Construction, Signature
Digital imaging, and Works in Progress. Nine contractors attended a mandatory pre-bid meeting on April 23,2024. Three

bid proposals were received on May 2,2024, and Lupoii Excavators, L.LC. was the selected low bidder. Attached for your
information is a summary of the bids received for this project.

The Attorney General's Offke has approved the contract as to form, substance, and execution.

Resi>ectfully submitted.

1

■  ..-n ,
.  ,'/ ••• / 1

Brian J. Wilson

Director

Concurred,

Sarah L. Stewart

Commissioner



state of New Hampshire

Department of Natural and Cultural Resources

Division of Parks and Recreation

Capital Projects & Maintenance

Bid List

Project No.

Parking Lot & Seawall Repair Date:

North Hampton State Park, North Hampton NH

CAP-2419

S/Z/2024

Contractors Name and Address Lump Sum Base Bid

Lupoii Excavators

56 Lafayette Rd.

North Hampton. NH

$  382,669.00

A Bidder

Awarded Pending

G&C Approval

Triple Construction

237 OW Highway

Merrimack, NH

S  493,778.00

B Bidder

Samuel Jeffers Excatation & Trucking LLC

361 Titus Hill Rd.

Cotebrook, NH

S  494,382.00

C Bidder

Powell Enterprises

152 Atlantic Ave.

North Hampton. NH

No Bid

Apex Earthworks

46 Dover Rd.

Chlchester, NH

No Bid

Bourassa Construction

85 Heritage Ave.

Portsmouth, NH

No Bid

Baldwin & Son LLC

21 Youngs Rd.

Harrison. ME.

No Bid

C.R. Demers Construction

PO Box 62

Suncook, NH

No Bid

WP Davis Excavation

PO Box 758

Hampton, NH

No Bid

Biddine Procedure; This oroiect was out out to bid on April 9. 2024. It was advertised through the NH Bureau

of Purchase and Property's website. NH State Parks' website. Construction Summary of NH. Alpha Graphics,

Signature Digital Imaging, McGraw Hilt Construction, and Works In Progress. The bidding period went on for

two weeks. A mandatory pre*bid meeting was held on April 23, 2024 and 9 potential bidders attended. Bids

closed at 2:00 pm on May 2. 2024. Three bids where received and the low bidder, Lupoii Excavators was

accepted in the amount of $382,669 pending Governor and Council approval.



FORM NUMBER P-37 (version 2/23/2023)

Notice: This agreement and all of its attBchments shall become public upon submission (o Governor and
Executive Council for approval. Any information that is private, confidential or proprietary must
be clearly identified to the agency and agreed to in writing prior to signing the contract

AGREEMENT

The State of New Hampshire and the Contractor hereby mutually agree as follows:

GENERAL PROVISIONS

1.1 State Agency Name

DqMJtment of Natural and Cultural Resources
1.2 State Agency Address

172 Pembroke Road

Concord, NH 03301

1.3 Contractor Name

Lupoli Excavators, L.L.,C.

1.4 Contractor Address

56 Lafayette Road
North Hampton, NH 03862

l.S ContraaorPhone

Number

603-964-1949

1.6 Account Unit and Class

0010-035-3500-

55650000-034

1.7 Completion Date
S/30/2024

1.8 Price Limitation

382,669.00

1.9 Contracting Officer for State Agency
Ed Mussey, Project Manager

1.10 State Agency Telephone Number

603-271-3973

1.11 Contractor Sigmlfiua 1.12 Name and Title of Contractor Signatory

Nathan Lupoli-Managing Member

1.13 Stale Agency Signature

D.t.: 6/12/24

1.14 Name and Title of State Agency Signatory

Sarah L. Stewart, Commissioner

1.1S Approval by the N.H.fOepartment of Administration, Division of Personnel {t/applicable)

By: N/A | Director, On:
1.16 Approval by the Att(|ney General (Form, Substance and Execution) (ifapplicablt)

By- ,AAG 6/12/2024

1.17 Approval by the Governor and Executive Council (if applicable)

G&C Item number: GAC Meeting Date:
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2. SERVICES TO BE PERFORMED. The Ststc of New

Hampshire, acting through the agency ideatifted in block M
("State"), engages contractor identified in block 1.3 0*ContTBCtOT^)
to perform, and the Contractor shall perform, the work or sale of
goods, or both, identified and more particularly described in the
attached EXHIBIT B which is

("Services").
incorporated herein by reference

3. EFFECTIVE DATE/COMPLETION OF SERVICES.

3.1 Notwithstanding any provision of this Agreement to the
contrary, end subject to the!approval of the Governor and
Executive Council of the Statejof New Hampshire, if applicable,
this Agreement, and all obligations of the parties hereunder, shall
become effective on the date (he Governor and Executive Council

approve this Agreement, unless no such approval is required, b
which case the Agreement shall become effective on the date the
Agreement is signed by the State Agency as shown in block 1.13
C'Effective Dale")- 1
3.2 If the Contractor commence tiie Services prior to the Effective
Date, all Services performed by the Contractor prior to the
Effective Date shall be perfomied at the sole risk of the Contractor,
end in the event that this Agreement does not become effective, the
State shall have no liability to the Contractor, mcluding without
limitation, any obligation to ]pay the Contractor for any costs
Incurred or Services performed.
3.3 Contractor must complete all Services by the Completion Datespecified m block 1.7. j
4. CONDITIONAL NATURE OF AGREEMENT.

Notwithstanding any provtslojt of this Agreement to the contrary,
alt obligations of the State hereunder. inchiding, without limitation,
the continuance of payments hereunder, are contingent upon the
availability and continued app opriation of funds. In no event shall
the Stab be liable for any pmonents hereunder in excess of such
available appropriated fundb. In the event of a reduction or
termination ofappropriated funds by any state or federal legislative
or executive action that redu<)es, elimmates or otherwise modifies
the appropriation or availability of fundmg for this Agreement and
the Scope for Services provid^ m EXHIBIT B, b whole or m part,
the State shall have the right to withhold payment until such funds
become available, if ever, and shall have the right (o reduce or
terminate the Services undef this Agreement immediately upon
givbg the Contractor notice of such reduction or termbation. The
State shall not be required to transfer funds from any other account
or source to the Account ide^fied in block 1.6 b the event funds
in that Account are reduced or unavailable.

5. CONTRACT PRICE/PRICE LIMITATION/ PAYMENT.

S. I The contract price, method of payment, and terms of payment
are identified and more particularly described b EXHIBIT C
which is incorporated herein by reference.
5.2 Notwithstandbg any | rovision m this Agreement to the
contrary, and notwithstanding unexpected circumstances, b no
event shall (he total of ell p tyments authorized, or actually made
hereunder, exceed the Price Limitation set forth b block 1.8. The

payment by the State of the ontract price shall be the only and the
complete reimbursement to the Contractor for all expenses, of
whatever nature bcunred bfy the Contractor io the perfonnancc

hereof, and shall be the only and the complete compensation to the
Contractor for the Services.

5.3 The State reserves the right to of&et from any amounts
otherwise payable to the Contractor under this Agreeinent those
liquidated amounts required or permitted by N.H. RSA 80:7
throu^ RSA 80;7-c or any other provision of taw.
5.4 The State's liability under this Agreement shall be limited to
monetary damages not to exceed the total fees paid. The Contractor
agrees that it has an adequate remedy at law for any breach of this
Agreement by (he State and hereby waives any right b specific
perfonnancc or other equitable remedies against the State.

6. COMPLIANCE BY CONTRACTOR WITH LAWS AND

REGULATIONS/EQUAL EMPLOYMENT
OPPORTUNITY.

6.1 In connection with the performance of the Services, the
Contreaor shall comply with all applicable statutes, laws,
regulations, and orders of federal, state, county (v municipal
authorities which impose any obligation or duty tq)on the
Contractor, inciudbg, but not limited to. civil ri^ts and equal
employment opportunity laws and the Governor's order on Respect
and Civility In the Workplace, Executive order 2020-01. In
addition, if this Agreement is funded in any part by monies of the
United States, the Contractor shall comply with all federal
executive orders, rules, regulations and statutes, and with any rules,
regulations and gutdelmes as the State or the United States issue to
implement these regulations. The Contractor shall also comply
with all applicable intellectual property laws.
6.2 During the term of this Agreement, the Contrecbr shall not
discriminate against employees or applicants for emplc^ent
because of age, sex, sexual orientation, race, color, marital status,
physical or mental disabiliD', religious creed, national origin,
gender identity, or gender expression, and will take afftrmative
action to prevent such discrimination, unless exempt by state or
federal law. The Contractor shall ensure any subcOTtractors
comply with these nondiscrimbation requirements.
6.3 No payments or transfers of value by Contractor or Its
representatives in connection with this Agreement have or shall be
made which have the purpose or effect of public or commercial
bribery, or acceptance of or acquiescence b extortion, kickbacks,
or other unlawful or improper means of obiabbg busmess.
6.4. The Contractor agrees to permit the State or United States
access to any of the Contractor's books, records and accounts for
the purpose of ascertaining compliance with this Agreement and
all rules, regulations and orders peitambg b the covenants, terms
and conditions of this Agreement

7. PERSONNEL.

7.1 The Contrecbr shall at its own expense provide all personnel
necessary to perform the Services. The Contractor warrants that all
personnel engaged m the Services shall be quaiified b perform the
Services, and shall be properly licensed and otherwise authorized
to do so under all applicable laws.
7.2 The Contractmg Officer specified in block 1.9, or any
successor, shall be the State's point of contact pertabbg to this
Agreement.
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would otherwise accrue to the

the date of such notice until su

6. EVENT OF DEFAULT/RE riEDIES.

8.1 Any one or mon of the fallowing acts or omissions of the
Contractor shall constitute an event of default hereunder ("Event

of Default"):
6.1.1 fulure to perform the Services satisfiactonly or on schedule;
8.1.2 failure to submit any rqx)n required hereunder; and/or
8.1.3 fwlure to perform any otljer covenant, term or condition of
this Agreement
8.2 Upon the occurrence of anV Event of Default the State may
take any one, or more, or all, ofjthe following actions:
8^. I give the (Contractor a written notice specifying the Event of
Default and requiring it to be remedied within, In the absence of a
greater or lesser specification of time, thirty (30) calendar days
from the date of the notice; and Ifthe Event of Default is not timely
cured, terminate this Agreement, effective two (2) calendar days
after giving the Contractor nodpe of tenninetion;
%22 give the Contractor a wrmen notice specifying the Event of
Default and suspending all i ayments to be made under this
Agreonent and o^ering that the portion of the contract price which

'(^ntractor during tbe period from
:h time as the State determines that

the Contractor has cured the E trent of Default shall never be paid
to the Contractor;
8.2.3 give tbe Contractor a wr tien notice specifying the Event of
Default and set off against any Kber obligations ̂ e State may owe
to the Contractor any damage the State suffers by reason of any
Event of Default; and/or
8.2.4 give tbe Contractor a w( ition notice specifying the Event of
Default, treat the Agreement a breached, terminate the Agreement
and pursue any of its remedic at law or in equiQ^, or both.

9. TERMINATION.

9.1 Notwithstanding paragn ph 8, the State may, at its sole
discretion, terminate Agre ;ment for any reason, in whole or in
part, by thirty (30) calendar days written notice to the Contractor
that tbe State is exercising its c^on to terminate the Agreement.
9^ In the event of an early t< rmination of this Agreement for any
reason other than the compli lion of the Services, the Contractor

, deliver to the Contracting Officer,
calendar days after the date of

nation ReporO describing in detail
the contract price earned, to and

nation. In addition, at the State's

shall, at the S^'s discretior
not later than fifteen (IS
termination, a report CTerm
all Services perform^ ant
including the date of termi
discretion, the Contractor sh^l, within fifteen (IS) calendar days
of Dotice of early tenninatio\ develop and submit to the State a
transition plan for Services u ider the Agreement.

10. PROPERTY OWNER! HIP/DISCLOSURE.
ID.I As used in this Agreer ent, the word "Property" shall mean
all dwtn, Information and thi gs developed or obtained during the
performance of, or acquin j or developed by reason of, this
Agreement, including, but n t limited to. all studies, reports, files,
formulae, surveys, maps, charts, sound recordings, video
recordings, pictorial rtprod tctions, drawings, analyses, graphic
representations, computer | rograms, computer printouts, notes,
letters, memoranda, papers, ruJ documents, all whether finished or
unfinished.

10.2 All data and any Property which has been received from the
State, or purchased with fUnds provided for that purpose under this
Agreement, shall be the property of the State, end shall be returned
to Che State upon demand or upon termination of this Agreement
for any reason.
10.3 Disclosure of data, informatioo and other records shall be
governed by N.H. RSA chapter 91-A and/or other applicable law.
Disclosure requires prior written approval of the State.

11. CONTRACTOR'S RELATION TO THE STATE. In the
performance of this Agreement tbe Contractor is in ell respects an
independent contractor, and is neither an agent nor an employee of
the State. Neither the Contractor nor any of its officers, employees,
agents or members shall have authority to biod the State or receive
any benefits, workers' compieDsation or other emoluments
provided by tbe State to its employees.

12. assignment/delecation/subcontracts.
12.1 Contractor shall provide tbe State written notice at least fifteen
(IS) calendar days before any proposed assigomeot, delegation, or
other transfer of any interest in this Agreement. No such
assignment, delegation, or other transfer shall be effective without
the written consent of the State.

12.2 For purposes of paragraph 12, a Change of Control shall
constitute assignment "Change of Cootrol" means (a) merger,
consolidation, or a transaction or series of related transactions in
which a third party, together with its affiliates, becomes the direct
or indirect owner of fiffy percent (50%) or more of the voting
shares or similar equity interests, or combined voting power of the
Cootractor, or (b) the sale of all or substantially all of the assets of
the Contractor.

12.3 None of the Services shall be subcontracted by the Contractor
without prior written notice and consent of the State.
12.4 The State is entitled to copies of all subcontracts and
assi^unent agreements and sball not be bound by any provisions
contained in a subcontract or an assignment agreement to which it
is not a party.

13. INDEMNIFICATION. The Contractor shall indemnify,
defend, and hold harmless the State, its officers, and employees
from and against all actions, claims, damages, demands,
judgments, fines, liabilities, losses, and other expenses, including,
without limitation, reasonable attorneys' fees, arising out of or
relating to Ais Agreement directly or indirectly arising from death,
persona] injury, property damage, mtellectual property
infringement, or other claims asserted against the State, Its officers,
or employees caused by the acts or omissions of negligence,
reckless or willfbi misconduct, or fraud by the Contractor, Its
employees, agents, or subcontractors. The State shall not be liable
for any costs incurred by the Contractor arising under this
paragraph 13. Notwithstanding the for^omg, nothing herein
contained sball be deemed to constitute a waiver of the State's
sovereign immunity, which immunity is hereby reserved to the
Slate. This covenant in paragr^h 13 shall survive the termination
of this Agreement.
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14. INSURANCE.

M.I The Contractor shall, i

to obtain and or

18. AMENDMENT. This Agreement may be amended, waived or
its sole expense, obtain and discharged only by an instrument in writing signed by the parties

continuously maintain in force, I nd shall require any subcontractor hereto and only after approval of such amendment, waiver or
aintain in force, the following discharge by the Govenior and Executive Council of the State of

New Hampshire unless no such approval is required under the
circumstances pursuant to Stale law, rule or policy.

or assignee

insurance:

14.1.1 commercial general liabi ity insurance against all claims of
bodily injury, deatborpropertyi amage, In amounts ofnot less than
SI.000,000 per occurrence ant S2,000.000 aggi^ate or excess^
and

14.1.2 special cause of loss co 'erage form covering all Property
subject to subparegreph 10.2 I erein, in an amount not less than
80% ofthe whole replacement -aluc of the Property.
14.2 The policies described in s ibparagreph 14.1 herein shall be on
policy forms and endorsement i approved for use in the State of
New Hampshire by the N.H. D iparonent of Insurance, and issued
by insurers licensed in die Stat of New Hampshire.
I4J The Contractor shall ft mish to the Contracting Officer
identified in block 1.9, or ny successor, a certificate(s) of
insurance for all insurance req ired under this Agreement At the
request ofthe Contracting Offi er. or any successor, the Contractor
shall provide certificate(s) o insurance for all renewal(s) of
msurance required under thii Agreement. The ceTtificate<s) of
insurance and any renewals hereof shall be attached and art
incoqxirated herein by referen e.

15. WORKERS' COMPENS \TION.
15.1 By signing this agraemen , the Contractor ̂ rees, certifies and
warrants that the Contractor is n compliance with or exempt ftom,
the requirements of N.H. RSA chapter 281-A ("Wwken'
Compensation").
\ 5.2 To the extent Che Contra tor is subject to the requirements of
N.H. RSA chapter 281 ̂A, C< itractor shall maintain, and require
any subcontractor or assignee co secure and maintain, payment of
Worken* Compensation in c mnection with activities which the
person proposes to undertaki pursuant to this Agreement. The
Contractor shall ftimish the C ntracting Officer identified in block
1.9, or any successor, proof of Workers' Compensation in the
manner described in N.H. RS K chapter 281 -A and any applicable
renewals) thereof, which sh Jl be attached and art incorporated
herein by reference. The Stat shall not be responsible for payment
of any Workers' Compensatlt n premiums or for any other claim or

my subcontractor or employee of
Contractor, which might ar se under applicable State of New
Hampshire Workers' Comp< uaiion taws in connection with the

I ' Oder this Agreementperformance of the Services

Id. WAIVER OF BREACF

with respect to any single or
shall not act as a waiver of th

such rî ts or to enforce any

17. NOTICE. Any notice b
be deemed to have been di ly
mailing by certified mail, pt aagi
Office addressed to the pa^p
and 1.4, herein.

a pa

. A State's failure to enforce its rights
continuing breach of this Agreement
right ofthe State to later enforce any
other or any subsequent breach.

19. CHOICE OF LAW AND FORUM-
19.1 This Agreement shall be governed, inteiprcted and construed
in accordance with the laws ofthe State of New Hampshire except
where the Federal supremacy clause requites otherwise. The
wording used in thb Agreement b the wording chosen by the
parties to express their mutual intent, and no rule of construction
shall be applied against or in favor of any party.
19.2 Any actions arising out of thb Agreement, inctuding the
breach or alleged breach thereof, may not be submitted to binding
arbitration, but must, instead, be brought and maintained in the
Merriinack County Superior Court ofNew Hampshire which shall
have exclusive jurisdiction thereof.

20. CONFLICTING TERMS. In the event of a conflict between
Che terms of thb F>37 form (as modified in EXHIBIT A) and any
other portion of thb Agreement inchiding any attachments thereto,
the terms of the P*37 (as modified in EXHIBIT A) shall control.

21. THIRD PARTIES. Thb Agreement b being entered into for
the sole benefit ofthe parties hereto, and nothing herein, express or
implied, b Intended to or will confer any legal or equitable right,
benefit, or remedy of any nature upon any other person.

22. HEADINGS. The headings throughout the Agreement are for
reference purposes only, and the words contained therein shall in
no way be held to explain, modify, amplify or aid in the
interpretation, construction or meaning of the provisions of thb
Agreement.

23. SPECIAL PROVISIONS. Additional or modifying
provisions set forth in the attached EXHIBIT A are incorporated
herein by reference.

24. FURTHER ASSURANCES. The Contraaor, along with its
agents and affiliates, shall, at its own cost and expense, execute any
additional documents and take such further actions as may be
reasootftity required to carry out the provisions of this Agreement
and give effect to the transactions contemplated hereby.

25. SEVERABILITY. In the event any ofthe provbiona of thb
Agreement are held by a court of competent jurisdiction to be
contrary to any state or federal law. the remaining provbions of
thb Agreement will remain in full force and effect.

rty hereto to the other party shall 26. ENTIRE AGREEMENT. Thb Agreement, whtcb may be
delivered or given at the time of executed in a number of counterparts, each of which shall be
;e prqiaid, in a United States Post deemed an origina], constitutes the entire agreement and

at the addresses given in blocks 1.2 understaruling between the parties, and supersedes all prior
agreements and understandings wttii respect to the subject matter
hereof.
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STATE OF NEW HAMPSHIRE

department of natural and cultural resources
DIVISION OF PARKS AND RECREATION

NC

Scope of Sorvic

PROJECT No. CAP-2419

PARKING LOT & SEAWALL REPAIR

RTH HAMPTON STATE PARK NORTH HAMPTON. NH

EXHIBIT A

ThetB are no additional provisions on this contract.

EXHIBIT B

ea:

The intent of thd contract is to provide the State with an Asphalt Parking Lot Repairs at
North Hampton E each State Park. The following work items give a general summary of the
extent of the wor: but are not intended to t>e a complete itemization of the work.

1. Remo NB debris from sink hole, salvage granite curbing for re-use.
2.. Repaii Seawall Mortar joints.
3. Repla e Stones along the base of the seawall.
4. Fill Sir khole

5. Pave *arking area with 2 courses of 2 Inch asphalt.
6. Pave Jdewalk with 2" base course &1'inch wearing course.
7. Remo re cobbles, boulders and stones from in front of the granite block wall in

tt>e ar ia as indicated in the drawings. Install armored stones along the ocean
side c the wall for seawall protection.

6. Repla :8 concrete barriers.
9. Re-st ipe parking lot areas.

Contract Price

Total contract is

Payment Term ̂
Payments (net

EXHIBIT C

not to exceed; $382,669.00

i 0 days) shall be made upon satisfactory completion of services and
receipt of itemiz 3d invoices

Term

This contract sf
completion date

all commence upon approval by Governor and Executive Council, with a
of August 30.2024.

Contractor Initials

Date



State of New Hampshire

Department of State

CERTIFrCATfi
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1 iinit€d PartncKhiP or LLC Ctrdflcate of Authority

(Sole partner, member, or manager)

1, Nathan I /UpoU, hereby certify that I am the sole Partner, Member or (Name)
manager of LupoU Excavators LLC a limited liability partnership under RSA 304-B, a

limited (N< me of Partnership or LLC)
liability profession i\ partnership under RSA 3D4-D, or a limited liability company under

RSA 304-C.

I certify that

understood that th

I am authorized to bind the partnership or LLC. I further certify that it is

; State of New Hampshire will rely on this certificate as evidence that I

currently occupy me position indicated and that 1 have full authority to bind the partnership

or LLC and that U is authorization shall remain valid for thirty (30) days from the date of

the signature below.

DATE: ATTEST;

(Signature)

Managing Member

fnsle)



ACOKcF CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE OATS <IUMIO/rYTY)

5/22/2024

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS AINATTER OF MF0RRUT10N ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTiFiCATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND. EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S). AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER. AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT If the cartincata holder Is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the pollcy(ls«| muti bs sndormsd. If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to
the term* end eondltlofts of the policy, certain pollclei may require an endersament A •tatamam on this csrttficsts does not confer rights to the
ctruncate holder in lieu of such endorMmant(a).

pdooucea

THS ROWLEY AGENCY LLC

4S Constitution Avenue

P.O. Box 511

Concord NB. O39O2-0S11

Susan Cllaan

(603)224-2562

Aomta- agllaani rovlayagancy. COS

wsuRewat afforoinc coveracs NAIC 0

MURERA: Prankannuth Mutual Ins Co 13966

iMsumo

Li90li Bxeavators, LLC

55 Lafayatta Road

North Raapton NB 03662-2405

imuRERB:Allied Kastam Indasnity Co. 11242

MURCRC:

MURCRD:

■MUWPRP:

MUftfR F :

COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER:24-25 C«tt» REVISION NUNI8ER:

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT TH£ POUCIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDIMG ANY REQUIREMENT. TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT VSdTH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN. THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS.
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDfTIOHS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

MR

m. TYRf OR MWRAMCe ROUCY NWOt

COMHCRCIM. OENCtUL ULBB.nY

I Claws MAD6 OCCUR
CC0<37 1100.000 Unit

CEKIAOGREOATE LMTT AAPLtCS PER:

mo-
JECTPOLICY Bs't □ LOC

OTHER;

i/}s/se34 Each OCCURRENCE
DUUfiETOftENTED
Fnrnifl t'lnrfirrr'
NED exp {Any pmoK}

PERSONAL « AOV MJURY

GENERAL AGGREGATE

PROOUCTS. CCUPiOP AGO

1,000,000

SOO.OOO

10,000

1,000.000

2,000.000

2,000,000

AimMioen.E UAsaJTY

* ANY AUTO
AUOMKOI
AUTOS

WREO AUTOS

1/23/2024 1/3S/3C29
UMiiNl&fiiH&ifTJOir
iEsj 1.000.000

0OOILY UilURY <P« panon)

8CHE0ULE0
AUTOS
MON-OVWEO
AUTOS

BOOILY PUURY (PW MdSM)

PROPERTY OAMAOE
IPm leeMMi

UMttRELLA LlAB

exCCMUAB

OCCUR

CLAIMS MADE

1/23/2034 i/23/2029 EACH OCCURRENCE 1.000,000

AGGREGATE 1.000.000

DEO ' RETEMT10M 3 10.000

8TATVTEWORKERS COMPENSATION
AND EMPLOTERr UASUTY
ANY PROPmETOR/PARTNERieXGCUnVE
OfnCERAIEIilSER EXClUOEOT
(H4lldN»fy m NH)

olSRIPTIONOPOPeRATXNgNWo
0

03-00001IT1«3-3034A

JA OtBta: NS

3/l«/3e24 3/14/2023

fi.U EACH ACODENT 500.000

e.L CKSCASE • EA EMPLOYEE SOO.OOO

E.L DISEASE • POLICY UNIT SOO.OOO

Losaod/Rontad EqulpMnt 1/33/2034 1/23/3023 tzeo.oeoiM.ACv I

OCBCIVnON OP OPERATIONt f LOCATKMS / VCMCLXS lACORO 101. MOMaiwI Ramarta SaNaOMN. r—y ka (OaaM ■ mara tptaa M
Pcojoct: Bosch Grading at Valllo Bands, I^o, KB. Stats of HB, Dopt of Natural and Cultural Rosourcos is
an additional insurod undoz tho gonoral liability and auto liability if raquirad by writtan contract with
nasMd insurad.

CERTIFICATE HOLDER CANCELLATION

Stata of KH, Dapt of Natural and Cultural
Raaouccas, Division of Parka/Racreaticn
Oparations Planning/Pcojact Managaaant
172 Paabroka Road

Concord, NH 03301

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POUCIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF. NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED M
ACCORDANCE WRH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

AUTHOMZeO REPRCSCMTATM

Susan Giloan/SJG

ACORD 25 (2014/01)
INS029 (30MOI)

019eB-2014 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights rMsrvtd.
The ACORD name end logo ere regtstsrad marks of ACORD


