State of New Hampshire

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES
25 Capitol Street - Room 100
Concord, New Hampshire 03301

(603) 271-3201 | Office@das.nh.gov \ ' ’

Catherine A. Keane
Deputy Commissioner

Charles M. Arlinghaus
Commissioner Sheri L. Rockburn
Assistant Commissioner

August 26, 2022

His Excellency, Governor Christopher T. Sununu
and the Honorable Council

State House

Concord, New Hampshire 03301

REQUESTED ACTION

Authorize the Department of Administrative Services to enter into a retroactive sole source
amendment to an existing contract with Solid Roots Construction LLC, (VC# 297068), for Carpentry
Services at State owned facilities in the Concord, Southern and Seacoast Regions of the State, by increasing
the price limitation by $145,170 from $145,430.00 to $290,600.00 with no change in the contract term
effective upon Governor and Council approval for the period of August 15, 2022 to expire November 9,
2023. The original contract was approved by Governor and Council on November 10, 2021, Item #64.

The cost of the contract amendment shall be paid contingent upon availability and continued
appropriations through various individual Department of Administrative Services budgeted contract class
048 contract maintenance line expenditures or emergency capital budget line expenditures, none of which
shall be permitted unless there are sufficient appropriated funds to cover the expenditures.

EXPLANATION

In accordance with RSA 21-1:12, 11, B, The Department of Administrative Services (DAS),
Division of Plant and Property Management is responsible to “provide for the general maintenance of
state-owned buildings and grounds, except as otherwise provided by law.” DAS maintains approximately
91 state owned facilities located throughout the State.

On the weekend of August 6, 2022, a water pipe broke on the second floor of the Van McLeod
building in Concord causing significant damage. Our original estimate for carpentry services did not take
into consideration a project of this magnitude. In accordance with DAS MOP 150, IX, this contract
amendment is considered to be sole source because it exceeds 10% of the dollar amount of the original
contract. The retroactive contract amendment is required to complete the demolition and reconstruction
to the interior of the building in a timely fashion. We intend to go out to bid for a new carpentry services
contract for the Concord, Southern and Seacoast Regions of the State within the next six months.



" His Excellency. Govermor Christopher T. Sununu
and the Honorable Council

August 26, 2022
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In September of 2021, DAS issued an RFB for Carpentry Services for five geographic regions in
the State. Solid Roots Construction, LLC was the low bidder for the Concord, Southem and Southeast
Regions of the State. In November 0of 2021, DAS obtained approval from Governor and Council for a
contract totaling $145,430. Attached is a copy of the bid results and original contract.

Respectfully submitted,

K (Rl

FO‘/ arles M. Arlinghaus,
Commissioner

TOD ACCESS: RELAY NH 13007352961



Contract Amendment
Carpentry Services

It is hereby agreed that the contract approved by NH Governor and Council on November
10, 2021, between Solid Roots Construction LLC, as “Contractor” and the Department of
Administrative Services as “State”, for carpentry services at state owned buildings located in
the Concord, south and seacoast areas of the State, is amended as follows:

1. Delete in its entirety section 1.8 Price Limitation and substitute therefore the
following:

1.8 Price Limitation $290,600.00
2. Delete in its entirety Exhibit C, Paragraph 1 and substitute therefore the following:

1. The Contractor hereby agrees to provide Carpentry Services in complete
compliance with the terms and conditions specified in Exhibit B for an amount up to
and not to exceed a price of $290,600.00. This figure shall not be considered a
guaranteed or minimum figure; however, it shall be considered a maximum figure from
the effective date through the expiration date as indicated in Form P-37, Block 1.7.

All other provisions of that certain service agreement, approved by Governor and
Council on November 10, 2021, shall remain in full force and effect.

SOLID ROOTS CONSTRUCTION LLC STATE OF NEW HAMPSHIRE

BY % ov_Sone L (Beblywrn

%EF(@/ Kelley Sheer L Fockbord

(Print Name) (Print Name)
Title: Ma/\a 2.( Aq MCABW‘ Title: A'QS’TL. CbmijS}ﬂ\é/p-

Date: 0 5/1 t/2022 Date: 6)/2(0/22-
NOTARY PUBLIC/JUSTICE OF THE PEACE OFFICE OF THE ATTORNEY GENERAL
On the ﬂday of /'L Vgd 3 T_ ,  BY: ﬁ%"i"‘—/ i
Siate-and county foresaia & porson who Tadhwiira fathrateve
satisfactorily identified himself as (Print Name)

JeC ~|/ e ”C’;/ ,and  Title: (p staey Cz-ﬁ(ﬂ”‘f g (?ficf-;»c-g
acknowledged that he executed this Date: (f7 29 / d X .

I

document indicated above.



The foregoing contract amendment was
In witness thereof, | hereunto set my approved by Governor and Council of
hand and official seal.

M New Hampshire on:

. s T
Notary Public/Justice of\‘\, “uﬁgsggh’ _
SN "LEI'E'ES!}S\%‘ Signed:

. . > et P.". ”"

My Commission EXQites " . Y _
O commasn 1} Title:
"”’J,%:ﬁﬁ!g """" \\"l~
¢/



State of New Hampshire
- Department of State

CERTIFICATE

l,' David M. Scanlan, Secretary of State of the State of New Hampshire, do hereby certify that SOLID ROOTS CONSTRUCTION
LLC is a New Hampshire Limited Liability Company registered to transact business in New Hampshire on April 14, 2017.1
further certify that all fees and documents required by the Secretary of State’s office have been received and is in good standing as

far as this office is concerned.

Business 1D: 768387
Certificate Number : 0005849674

IN TESTIMONY WHEREOQF, 7

1 hereto §ct my hand and cause to be affixed
the Seal of the State of New Hampshire,
this 23q.'d day of Augusf A.D: 2022,

David M. Scanlan
Secretary of State




Limited Partnership or LLC Certification of Authority

1, ) '?‘Sl'l Ve H ame \ , hereby certify that | am a Partner, Member or
(Name)

Manager of Sd“i Q 0¢TS ConSTlucTion LLL a limited liability professional partnership
(Name of Partnership or LLC)

under RSA 304-D, or a limited liability company under RSA 304-C.

| certify that ‘SLGF(GJ \¢e 1 C*I is authorized to bind the partnership or LLC. |
(Amendment Srgnatory)*

further certify that it is understood that the State of New Hampshire will rely on this certificate as
evidence that the person listed above currently occupies the position indicated and that they have full
authority to bind the partnership or LLC and that this authorization shall remain valid for thirty (30)

days from the date of this Corporate Resolution.
Q /\ / o f . ,
DATED: 0/17'* Lol ATTEST: \Tézw/k 7 [tpme

4/6/9/

Tm’e)

STATE OF NEW HAMPSHIRE
COUNTY OF HILLSBOROUGH

Onthe |H" day ofAu_AogMMZ/,before me _ Sl'\ (LN H'g()lgvé/’l/ undersigned officer

personally appeared \]aél’)l/wL H i C( , known to me or satisfactorily proven to be the person

whose name is subscribed to the within instrument and acknowledged that he/she executed the same for

u
‘ EMQ!!!!? !Mbgﬂ‘mmg Sy “SATE Se;
Justice of the Peace/ Notary/Public -" m:mm :}i

purposes therein contained. In witness '“"t' '&B&g{;to set me hand and official seal:

- ; 2
My Commission Expires: % ‘_4,,..-' F
o5 ameste &
J "H""B\gf\\*

ittt

e Note: The signatory to this Certificate of Authority and the signatory of the contract amendment
may not be the same individual.



: g DATE (MM/DD/YYYY)
A‘CORD CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

05/23/2022

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed.
If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement A statcrncnl on
this certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsomaent(s).

PRODUCER CONTACT  Jackie Manles
Cross Insurance PHONE .. (603)812-2600 Tk Noy. (803) 570-1073
75 Porismouth Bhvd. ADDRESS: jackie.montes@crossagency.com
Swite 100 INSURER{S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #
Portsmouth NH 03801 INSURER A; Continental Western Ins Co 10804
INSURED msurer p: Acadia Ins Co. 31325
Solld Roots Congtruction LLC INSURER C -
815 Elm Street INSURER D :
Suite 58 INSURER E :
Manchester NH 03101 INSURER F :
COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER:  22-23 Liabillty Master REVISION NUMBER:

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERICD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO YWWHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN 1S SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

T EODLSUBR 7 T
b TYPE OF INSURANCE mso [ wvo POUCY NUMBER ;r:af"[la%‘:'v?vn (MMDONY YY) UL :
| COMMERCIAL GENERAL UIABILITY EACH OCCURRENCE ¢ 1,000,000
[[OAMAGE TO RENTED
| cLams-wae E OCCUR PREMISES (Es ocourenca) s_300.000
|| | MED EXP (Ar one persony | 5 10.000
A CPA5431762-12 031972022 | 0311972023 | pcpconn s aovimmry | s 1:000.000
GENL AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: GENERAL AGGREGATE s 2.000.000
POLICY e Loc PRODUCTS - COMPIOPAGG | s 2/000.000
OTHER; s
COMBINED SINGLE LIMIT
_A_U—rouom.a LeABILITY [En accident) $ 1,000,000
D ANY AUTO BODALY INJURY (Parperaon) | §
[ | OWNED SCHEDULED
A || AuTos oNy ALTOS CAASA32315-12 QX19/2022 | 03/19/2023 | RBODILY INJURY (Per accident} | $
HIRED NON-QWNED [ PROPERTY DAMAGE s
] AUTOS OMLY AUTOS ONLY | (Por accident)
: Medical paymants s 5,000
| 5X| UMBRELLA LiAB OCCUR EACH OCCURRENCE s 1000000
B EXCESS LIAB o —_— CUA5432316-12 0341972022 | 03/18/2023 | searecare s 1.000,000
oeo | | mevenmion s - $
WORKERS COMPENSATION Nz i
AND EMPLOYERS LLABILITY ViN [shire [ &5 g
B {EA PRORETO AR R e aUTIVE NiA WCA5475300-11 03/19/2022 | 03192023 [EL EACHACCIDENT o
(Mandisory in NH) E.L. DISEASE - EA EMPLOvee | ¢ 1:000.000
1) yas, dascribe u 1,000,000
DERCAIPTION OF OPERATIONS below EL DISEASE - PoucY UMt |5 1,000

DEICRIPTION OF DPERATIONS | LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additionsl Remarks Schedule, may be stischad if more space is required)

Certificate holder is named as Additional Insurad on a Primary and Non-Contributory basis under the Commercial General Liability (CGL) and Commercial
Autto {CA} policy if required by wrilten contract. CGL includes Ongoing Compleled Operations and CGL & CA include Waiver of Subrogation when required
by wrltten contract. Jefl Kelly and Joshua Hamel are excluded from Workers Compensation. insurance afforded by the policies described hereln Is subject to
all the terms, exdusions, warranties and conditions of such policies.

CERTIFICATE HOLDER CANCELLATION

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN

State of New Hampshire Departiment of Administrative Services ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.
25 Capitol Street, Room 1138

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

Concord NH 03301
i -

© 1988-2015 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.
ACORD 25 (2016/03) The ACORD name and logo are reglsterad marks of ACORD
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State of New Hampshire [3’ [’04
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES

25 Capitol Strect -'Room 120
Concord, New 'Hampshire 03301

i n v
Joseph B. Bouchard )
Charles M. Arlinghous - - . ) Assistant Commissioner
Comumissioner LI ' {603) 271-3204

(603) 271-3201
‘ Catherine A. Koang
Deputy Commissioner
(603) 271-2068%

Oclober 18, 2021

His Excellency. Governor Christopher 1. Sununu
ond the Honorable Counc:l

Stote House

Concord, New Hampshire 03301

REQUESTED ACTION

Authorize the -Department of Administrative Services to enler into a contract wilh Solid Roofs
Construclion LLC.. (VC# 297048) Manchester, New Hampshire, for o {otal price nol 1o exceed
$145,430.00 for Corpentry Services al severol state owned buildings managed by the Deparimenl of
Administrative Services. The lerm of the contract shall begin on November 10, 2021 orupon approval of
the Governor and Executive Council whichever is later, through November 9, 2023 a perod of

. approximalely two (2) years with an option 1o renew for on additional yeor subject to Governor and
Council cpproval,

The cost of the contract shall be paid contingent upon availability and continued appropriations
ihrough various individuol Department of Administralive Services budgeted closs 048 contract
maintenance 'line expenditures, none of which shall be permilied unless there are sufficient
appropriated funds to cover the expenditure. '

EXPLANATION

The Deportment of Administrative Services mainlains over 90 stale owned buildings.
Occasionally, Carpentry Services are required to supplement the existing statl in emergency situations
as well as when there is o shortage of skilled labor due 1o employee vacancies or absences. This contract
would pravide all labor, tools, fransportation, materials, equipment and permils 0s necessary 1o provide
lhe requnred level ol service on an as needed basis. ‘

On September 27, 2021, ihe Bureau of Purchose and Property |ssued RFB Adm Svs 2022-01 for
Carpentry Services; compliant bids were received from three (3) Vendors and twg {2) olher bids
submilied afler the deadline, were rejecled. Allached is a copy of the bid resulls.

The Deportmenr of Admnnnsirchve Services requests the approval of this contract.

l Respectluﬂy submitied,.

QL

Charles M. Alinghous .
Commissioner



Carpentry Services
RFB Adm Svs 2022-01
" September 27, 2021 @ 2:00 PM B .
1 1 | ] | [
Concord Area
Concord , Hooksett Approximately 60 facilities | |

Solid Roots Construction, LLC

I |
. Hourly Rate Saturday, Sundays,
Hourly Rate Monday through Friday 7:00 | Holidays and Monday through Friday | Total Estimated
AM 10 5:00 PM ‘from 5:01 PM to 6:59 AM Amount in Dollars
Vendor Hours Rate - Total Hours Rate Total
Amoskeag Maintenance Services, LLC 1060 $85.00 $90,100.00 . 292 $127.50 $37,230.00 $127,330.00
D.L. King & Associates, Inc 1060 $78.00 $82,680.00 292 $105.00 $30,660.00 " $113,340.00
Solid Roots Construction, LLC l 1060 l $57.00 l © $60,420.00 l 292 l $80.00 | 523,360.00 I $83,780.00
) 5 South .
Manchestef, Derry, Nashua, Milford, Merrimack Approximately 7 fadilities
| : I I

| _
: ' | Hourly Rate Saturday, Sundays,
_Hourly Rate Monday through Friday 7:00 | Holidays and Monday through Friday | Total Estimated
AM t0 5:00 PM from 5:01 PM to 6:59 AM Amount in Dollars
Vendor Hours Rate Total Hours Rate Total
Amoskeag Maintenance Services, LLC . 250 -1 $85.00 $21,250.00 250 $127.50 $31,875.00 $53,125.00
D.L. King & Associates, Inc 250 $78.00 " $19,500.00 250 $105.00 $26,250.00 $45,750.00
Solid Roots Construction, LLC [ 250 ‘ $57.00 l $14,250.00 I . 250 | $80.00 | $20,000.00 ‘ $34,250.00
- Central
" Laconia, Plymouth, Franklin Approximately 7 facilities £
1 I I I
Hourly Rate Saturday, Sundays,

Total Estimated

Hourly Rate Monday through Friday 7:00

Holidays and Monday through Friday

Amount in Dollars

AM to 5:00 PM from 5:01 PM to 6:5% AM
Vendor Hours Rate Total Hours Rate Total
Amoskeag Maintenance Services, LLC 150 $95.00 $14,250.00 150 | 5142.50 $21,375.00 $35,625.00
D.L. King & Associates, In¢ 150 $80.00 $12,000.00 150 -$110.00 $16,500.00 $28,500.00
solid Roots Construction, LLC 150 No Bid $0.00 150 No Bid $0.00 No Bid




Door Repair and Installation Services

RFB Adm Svs 2022-01

September 27, 2021 @ 2:00 PM

l [ |

I

Seacoast

Portsmouth, Dover, Bren

|

twood, Rochester, Hampton Approximately 5 facilities .

Hourly Rate Monday through Friday 7:00

Hourly Rate Saturday, Sundays,
Holidays and Monday through Friday

Total Estimated

AM to 5:00 PM from 5:01 PM to 6:59 AM Amount in Dollars
Vendor Hours Rate Total Hours Rate' Total
Amoskeag Maintenance Services, LLC 200 $95.00 $19,000.00 200 $142.50 $28,500.00 $47,500.00
D.L. King & Associates, Inc 200 - $80.00 $16,000.00 200 $110.00 | $522,000.00 $38,000.00
. Solid Roots Construction, LLC l 200 I $57.00 l $11,400.00 | 200 ] $80.00 l $16,000.00 $27,400.00
: ' North

I |

Ossipee, North Conway, Lancaster, Approximately 3 facilities

:

Hourly Rate Monday through Friday 7:00

" Hourly Rate Saturday, Sundays,
Holidays and Monday through Friday

Total Estimated

AM to 5:00 PM from 5:01 PM to 6:59 AM Amount in Dollars
. Vendor Hours Rate Total Hours Rate Total T
Amoskeag Maintenance Services, LLC 150 $110.00 $15,500.00 150 $165.00 $24,750.00 $41,250.00
D.L. King & Associates, Inc ) 150 . SBS.00 - $12,750.00 | 150 $120.50 $18,075.00 $30,825.00
solid Roots Construction, LLC 150 No Bid $0.00 150 No Bid $0.00 No Bid
West
Lebanon, Jaffrey Approximately 2 facilities

Hourly Rate Monday through Friday 7:00

Hourly Rate Saturday, Sundays,
Holidays and Monday through Friday

Total Estimated

AM to 5:00 PM from 5:01 PM t0 6:59 AM Amount in Dollars
Vendor Hours Rate Total Hours Rate Tota! '
Amoskeag Maintenance Services, LLC 100 $110.00 $11,000.00 100 $165.00 | $16,500.00 $27,500.00
D.L. King & Associates, Inc 100 $85.00 $8,500.00 100 $120.50 $12,050.00 $20,550.00
Solid Roots Construction, LLC 100 No Bid $0.00 100 No Bid $0.00 No Bid




FORM NUMBER P-37 (version 12/11/2019)

Notice: This agreement and all of its attachments shell become public upon submission to Governor and
Excecutive Council for approval. Any information that is private, confidential or proprictary must
be clearly identified to the agency and agreed to in writing prior to signing the contract.

AGREEMENT
The Statc of New Hampshire and the Coatractor hereby mutually agree as follows:

’ GENERAL PROVISIONS

1. TDENTIFICATION.

1.1 State Agency Name

Department of Administrative Services

1.2 State Agency Address
25 Capitol Street, Room 120
Concord, NH 03301

1.3 Contractor Name

Gulid Leo™s CoasTruerion LLC

1.4 Contractor Address |
Ggls E\m ST SuTR 5%
Manchestel A 0Fwd

1.5 Contractor Phone
Number

L03-7 5% = botv

1.6 Accoun; Number

VARIOUS

1.7 Completion Date 1.8 Price Limitation

November 9, 2023 $145,430.00.

1.9 'C-ontmcting Officer for Statc Agency
Andrea Williams-Cameron

1.10 State Agency Telephone Number
(603) 271-6864

1.11 Contractor Sigpature

Y

Date: Yo/6/ T\

1.12 Name and Title of Contractor Signatory

Teeecey Kelled, Member

1 1.13 State Agency Signature

(e L

Date: V0 492 ¢

.| 1.14 Name and Title of State Agency Signatory

Charles M. Arlinghaus, Commissioner

1.15 Approval by the N.H. Department of Administration, Division of Persoanel (if applicable)

By:

Director, On:

Approval by the Attomey General (Form, Su'bstnncc and Execution) (if applicable)

On: JQ,DZ//M/

117

C&C Item number:

A‘ﬁ)rovﬁ'l by the Governor and Executive Council (if applicable)

'G&C Meeting Date:

Page 10f 11

Contractor initials é ;

Date_10/&/L1



2. SERVICES TO BE PERFORMED. The State of New
Hampshire, acting through the agency identified in block 1.1
(“Stote”), cngages contrector identified in  block 1.3
(“Contractor”) to perform, and the Contractor shall perform, the
work or sale of goods, or:both, identified and more particularly
described in the attached EXHIBIT B ‘which is incorporated
herein by reference (“Services™).

. 3. .EFFECTIVE DATE/COMPLETION OF SERVICES.

3.1 Notwithstanding any provision of this Agreement to the
contrary, and subject to the approval of the Governor and
Executive Councit of thc Statc of New Hampshire, if
applicable, this Agreement, and oll obligations of the partics

hereunder, shall become effective on the date the Govemor and’

Executive Council approve this Agrecment as indicated in
block 1.17, unless no such spproval is required, in which case
the Agreement shall become effective on the date the
Agrecment is signed by the State Agency as shown in block
1.13 (“Effective Datel).

3.2 If the Contractor commences the Services prior to the
Effective Date, all Services performed by the Contractor prior
to the Effective Date shall be performed at the sole risk of the

Contractor, and in thc cvent that this Agreement does not

become effective, the State shall have no liability to the
+ Contractor, including without limitation, eny obligation ‘to pay

the Contractor for any costs incurrcd or Scrvices performed. -

Contructor must completc all Services by the Completion Dalc
. specified in block 1. 7

4. CONDITIONAL NATURE OF AGREEMENT.
Notwithstanding any provision of this Agreement to the

contrary,. all obligations of the State hereunder, including,

without limitation, thc continuance of payments. hereunder, are
contingent upon the availability and continued ‘appropriation of
funds affected by any state or federal legisiative or executive
action that, reduccs, tliminatcs or othcrwise modifics the
-appropriation or dvailability of funding for this Agreement and
the 'Scope for Services provided in EXHIBIT B, in'whole or in’
.part. In no event shall the State be liable for any payments
hereunder in excess of such ayailable eppropriated funds. “In

the event of a reduction or termination of appropnated funds,’

the Statc shall have the right to withhold payment until such
funds become available, if ever, and shall have. the right to
reduce or . ferminatc the Services under this Agrecment
immediatcly upon giving the Cootractor notice of such
reduction or termination, The Statc shall not be required to
transfer funds from any other account or source to the Account

identified in block 1.6 in the cvent funds in that' Account arc

reduccd or unavailable,

5. CONTRACT PRICE/PRICE LIM’ITA’I‘IONI
PAYMENT.

5.1 The contruct price, method of payment, and terms of
payment are identified and more particularly described in
EXHIBIT C which is incorporated herein by reference.

5.2 The payment by the State of the contract price shali be the
oaly and the complele reimbursemeént to the Contractor for all

Page 2 of 11

cxpenses, of whatever nature incurred by the Contractor in the

.performance hereof, and shall be the onlty and the complete

compensation to the Contractor for the Services. The State shali
have no liability to the Contractor other than the contract price.
5.3 The State reserves the right 1o offset from any amounts:
otherwise payable to the Contractor under this Agreement those -

.liquidated amounts required or permitted by N.H. RSA 80:7

through RSA 80:7c ar any other prows:on of law.
5.4 Notwithstanding any provision in this Agrccmcnl to the

‘contrary, and notwithstanding unexpected circumstances, in no

event shall the total of all payments authorized, or actunlly
made hereunder, exceed the Price Lumr.anon set forth ip block
1.8.

6, COMPLIANCE BY CONTRACTOR WITH LAWS
AND REGULATEIONS/ EQUAL EMPLOYMENT
OPPORTUNITY.

6.1 In connection with the pert'ormancc of the Services, the
Contractor shall comply with ali applicable stalutes, laws,
regulations, and orders of federnl, state, county or municipal
authorities which impose any obligation or duty upon the
Contractor,. including, but not limited 1o, civil rights and equal

-employment opportunity laws. In addition, if this Agreement is

funded in any part by monies of the United States, the
Coatractor shall comply with all federa] exccutive orders, rules,
regulations and statutes, and with any rulcs, rcgulations and
guidelines as the State or-the United States issue to implement
these regulations. The Contractor shall also comply with all
applicable intellectual property laws.

6.2 During the term of this Agrecment, the Contractor shall not
discriminate ageinst employees or applicants for employment
because of racc, color, rchglon creed, age, scx, handicap,.
sexual orientation, or national origin and will tnke affirmative

- gction to prcvcnt such discrimination.

6.3. The Contmclor agrees to permit the State or United States
access to any of the Contractor's books, records and accounts
for the purposc of ascenaining compliance with all rules,
regulations and orders, and the covenants, terms and conditions
of this Ag-reement

7. PERSONNEL. _

7.1 The Contractor shall -at its own expense provide all
personnel riccessary. to perform the Services. The Conuactor -
wairants that all* personncl -cngaged ‘in the Scrvices shall be
qualificd to perform the Services, and shail be properiy licensed
and otherwise authorized to do so under all applicable laws. : -
7.2 Unless otherwise authorized in writing, during the term of
this Agreement, and for & period of six (6) months after the

. Completion Date in block 1.7, the Contractor shall not hire, and

shall not permit any subcontractor or other person, firm or
corporation with whom it is engaged in a combined effort to
perform the ‘Services io hire, any person who is 8 State
employee or official; who. is materiglly involved in the
procurcment, administration or performance of this Agreement.
This provision shall survive tcrmination of this Agreement.

7.3 The Contracting Officer specificd in block 1.9, or his or her
successor, shall be the Siate’s representative. In the event of

Contractor Initials gz '
f Date\ O/b/ll

™.

!



any disputc conceming the interpretation of this Agreement, the
Contracting Officer's decision shal) be final for the State,

8. EVENT OF DEFAULT/REMEDIES,

8.1 Any onc or more of the following acts or omissions of the
Contractor shall constitute an event of default hereunder
{“Event of Default™):

8.1.1 failurc to pérform the Services sansfnctonly or on
schedule;

8.1.2 foilure to submit any report required hereunder; end/or
8.1.3 failure to perform any other covenant, term or condition
of this Agreement.

8.2 Upon the occurrence of any Event of Dcfault, the Swuie may
take any one, or more,-or all, of the following actions:

8.2.1 give the Contractor a written notice specifying the Event
of Defoult and requiring it-to be:remedied within, in the
absence of o greater or lesser specification of time,. thirty (30)
days from the date of the notice; and if the Event of Default is
not timely cured, temhinate this Agreement, effective two (2)
days after giving the Contrector notice of termination;

8.2.2 give the-Contractor a written notice specifying the Event
of Default and suspending all payments to be made under this
Agreement and ordering that the portion of the contract price
which would otherwise accrue to the Contactor during the
period from the date of such notice until such time as the State
determines that the Contractor has cured the Event of Default
shall never be paid to the Contractor;

8:2.3 give the Contractor a written notice specifying the Event
of Default and sct off against any other obligations the State

- may owe 1o the Contractor any damages the State suffers by

reason of any Event of Default; and/or

. 8.2.4 give the Contractor a written notice specifying the Event
of Default, treat the Agreement as breached, terminate the
Agreement and pursue any of its remedies at law or in equity,
" or both.

8.3, No failure by the. State to enforce any pIOVISIOIJS hereof
afier any, Event of Default shall be decmed a waiver of its rights
with regard to that Evem of Défaull, or any subsequent Event
“of Defaull. No express failure to enforce any Event of Default
'shall be deemed 8 waiver of the right of the State to enforce

each end all of the provisions hercof upon any further or other

Event of Default on the part of the Contractor.

9. TERMTNATION

9.1 Notwithstanding paragraph 8, thc State may, at ils sole
discretion, terminate the Agreement for any reason, in whole or
in part, by thirty (30) days written notice to the Contractor that
the State is cxercising its option to lerminate the Agreement.

9.2 In the event of an early termination of this Agreement for
any reason other than the completion of the Services, the
Contractor shall, at the Siate’s discretion, deliver to the
Contracting Officer, not later than fifieen (15) days after the

datc of termination, a report (“Termination Report™) describing

in detail ell Scrvices performed, and the contract price camed,
to and including the date of termination. The form, subject
matler, conten, and number of copics of thc Termination
Report shall be identical to those of any Final Report described
in the attached EXHIBIT B. In addition, at the State's
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discrction, the Contractor shall, within 15 days of notice of
carly termination, develop and submit 1o the State @ Transition
Plan for services under the Agreement,

10. DATA/ACCESS/CONFIDENTIALITY/
PRESERVATION.

10.) As used in this Agreement, the word “data” shall mcan oll
information and things developed or obtained during the

performance of, or ecquired or developed by reason of, this

Agreement, including, but not limited to, all studies, reports,
files, formulae, surveys, maps, charts, sound recordings, video
recordings, pictorial reproductions, drawings, analyses, graphic
represcotations, compitler programs, compuier printouts, noles,
lcttcrs, memoranda, papers, and documents, all whether
finished or unfinished.

}0.2 All data and any property which has been received from
the State or purchascd with funds provided for that purpose
under this Agrecment, shalt be the property of the State, and -
shall be returned 1o the State upon demand or upon lcmunauon
of this Agreement for any reason.

10.3 Confidentiality of data shail be governed by N.H. RSA
chapter 91A or other existing law. Disclosure of data requires
prior written approval of the State:

11. CONTRACTOR'’S RELATION TQO THE STATE. In
the performance of this Agreement the Contractor is in all
respects an independent contractor, a.nd'isl neither en agent nor
an employee of the State. Neither the Contractor nor any of its
officers, employees, agents or members shall have authority to
bind the State.or receive eny benefits, workers’ compensation
or other emoluments provided by the State to its employees.

12. ASSIGNMENT/DELEGATION/SUBCONTRACTS.

12.1 The Contractor shall not assign, or otherwise transfer any
interest in this Agreement without the prior written notice,
which shall be provided to the State at least fificen (15) days
prior to the assignment, and a written consent of the State. For
purposcs of this parograph, e Change of Control shall constitute
assignment. “Change of Control” 'means (a) merger,
consolidation, or a transaction or series of related transactions
in which a third party, together with its affiliates, becomes the
direct or indirect owner of fifty percent (50%) or more of the
voling shares or similar cquity interests, or combined voting

- power of the Coatractor, or (b) the sale of ull or subsiantially all |

of the assets of the Contractor.

12.2 None.of the Services shall be subcontrocted. by the
Contractor without prior written notice and consent of the State.
The State is entitied to copics of &ll subcontracts and
assignment agreements and shall not be. bound by any
provisions contained in a subcontracl or an askignment
agreemeiit to which it is not a party.

13. INDEMNIFICATION. Unless otherwisc.cxcmpted by
law, the Contractor.shall indemnify and hold harmless the
State, its officers and employees, from and ogainst any and all
claims, liabilities and costs for any personal injury or property
damages, patent or copyright infringement, or other claims
asserted against the State, its officers or employees, which arise
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out of {or which may be claimed to arisc oul of) the acts or,
omission of thc Contractor, or subcontractors, including but not
limited 1o the negligence, reckless or intentional conduct. The
State shail not be liable for any costs incurred by the Contruclor
arising under this paragraph 13. Notwithstanding the foregoing,
nothing herein contained shall be deemed to constitute a waiver
of the sovcrcign immunity of thc State, which immunity is
hereby reserved to the Statc. This covenant in paragraph 13
shall survive the termination of this Agreement.

i4. INSURANCE.

14.1 The Contractor shall, at its sole expense, obuin and
continugusly maintain in force, and shall require any
subcontractor or assignee to obtain and maintain in force, the
following insurance:

14,1.1 commercinl general liability insurance agnlnsl all claims
of bodily injury, death or property damage, in amounts of not
less than $1,000,000 per occurrence and $2,000,000 aggregate
or excess; and o

14.1.2 special cause of lass coverage form covering alt property
subject to subparagraph 10.2 herein, in an amount not less than
80% of the whole replacement value of the property.

14.2 The policics described in subparagraph 14,1 herein shall
be on. policy forms and endorsements approved for usc in the
State of New Hampshirce by the N.H. Dcpartment of Insurance,
and issued by insurers licensed in the State of New Hampshire.
14.3 The Conwractor shall fumish to the Contracting Officer
identified in block 1.9, or his or her successor, a certificate(s) of
insurance for all insurance required under this Agrcement.
Contractor shall also fumish to the Coatrecting OQfficer
identified in block 1.9, or his or her successor, certificate(s) of
insurance for all rencwal(s) of insurance required under this
Agreement no later than ten (10) days prior to the expiration
date of each insurance policy. The centificate(s) of insurance.
and any rencwals thercof shall be attachcd and are incorporated
-berein by reference.

15. WORKERS’ COMPENSATION.

© 15.1 By signing this agreement, the Contractor agrees, certifies
and warrants that the Contractor is in compliance with or
exempt from, the rcqulrcmcms of N.H. RSA chapter 281-A
(“Workers" Compensation”)."

15.2 To the extent the Contractor is subject to the requiréments
of N.H..RSA chapier 281-A, Contractor shall. maintain, snd
requirc any subcontractor or assignce to secure and maintain,
payment of Workers' Compensation in connection with’
activities which the person proposes to undertake pursuant to
-this Agreement. The Contractor shall furnish the Contracting
Officer identified in block 1.9, or his or ber successor, proof of
Workers' Compensation in the manner described in N.H. RSA
chapter 281-A end any applicable renewal(s) thercof, which
shall be attached and ere incorparated herein by reference. The
State shall not be- responsible for payment of any Werkers’
Compensation premiums of for any other claim or benefit for
Contracior, or any subcontractor or employee of Contractor,
which might erisc under applicable Siate of New Hampshire

Workers' Compensation laws in  connection with the.

perfarmance of the Services under this Agreement.
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16. NOTICE. Any noticc by a party hercto to the other party
shall be deemed to have been duly delivered or gwcn at the
time of mailing by certificd mail, postage prepaid, in a United
States Post Office addressed to the partics at the addresses
given in blocks 1.2 and 1.4, herein,

17. AMENDMENT. This Agrcement may be umended,
waived or discharged only by an instrument in 'writing signed
by the parties herelo and only after approval of such
omendment, waiver or discharge by the Govermor and
Executive Council of the State of New Hampshire uniess no
such approval is required under the circumstances pursua.nt 0
State law, rulc or policy.

18. CHOICE O_F' LAW AND FORUM. This Agreement shail
be governed, interpreted and construed in accordance with the
laws of the State of New Hampshire, and is binding upon and
inures to the benefit of the partics and their respeciive
successors and assigns. The wording used in this Agreement is
the ‘wordifig chosen by the parties to express their mutual intent,
and no rule of construction shall be applied against or in faver
of any party. Any actions arising out of this Agrecment shall be
brought and maintsined in New Hampshire Supcrior Coun
which shall have exclusive jurisdiction thercof.

19. CONFLICTING TERMS. In the event of & conflict
berween the. terms of this P-37 form (as modified in EXHIBIT
A) and/or attachments and amendment thercof, the terms of the
P-37 (as modified in EXHIBIT A) shall control,

20. TI:II‘RD PARTIES. The parties hereto do not intend to
benefit any third parties and this Agreement shall not be
construed to confer any such benefit, -

'21. HEADINGS. The headings throughout the Agrecment are

for reference purposes only, and the words contained therein
shall in no way be held to explain, modify, emplify or aid in the
interpretation, construction or meaning of the provisions of this
Agreemenit.

22. SPECIAL PROVISIONS. Additional or modifying
provisions sct forth in the auachcd EXHIBIT A are
mcorporntcd herein by reference.

23. SEVERABILITY. In the event any of the provisions of
this Agreement arc held by a court of competent jurisdiction to
be contrary to eny state or federal law, the remaining provisions
of this Agreement will remain in full force and effect.

24. ENTIRE AGREEMENT. This Agrcement, which may be
executed in 8 number of counterparts, each of which shall be
deemed an original, constitutes the entirc agreement and
understanding between the -parties, and- supersedes ell prior
agreements and understandings with respect to the subject
matier hereof,
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EXHIBIT A
SPECIAL PROVISIONS

There are no special :pfovisiohs of this contract.
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EXHIBIT B
" SCOPE OF SERVICES

1. INTRODUCTION

Solid Roots Construction LLC (hereinafter referred to as the “Contractor”) hereby
agrees to provide the State of New Hampshire, Department of Administrative Services
(hereinafter referred to as the “State”), with Carpentry Services in the following regions:
Concord, South and Seacoast.

2. CONTRACT DOCUMENTS:

This Contract consists of the following documents ("Contraci Documents”) in order of
precedence: ‘

o

State of New Hampshire Terms and Conditions, General Provisions Form P-37
EXHIBIT A Special Provisions . ‘
EXHIBIT B Scope of Services

EXHIBIT C Payment Terms

aooo

3. TERM OF CONTRACT

This Coniract shalt commence on November 10, 2021 upon fhe approval of Governor
and Executive Council and shall terminate on November 9, 2023, a period of
approximately twenty-four (24) months, unless extended for additional terms. i

The Contract may be extended for an additional one (1) one-year term thereafter under
the same terms, conditions and pricing siructure upon the mutual agreement between
the Contractor and State, and with the approval of the Governor and Executive Council.

The maximum term of the Contract (including all extensions) cannot exceed three (3)
years. )

4. TERMINATION WITHOUT CAUSE

The State of New Hampshire has the right to terminate the Contract at any time by
giving the Contractor thirty (30) days advance written notice.

5. SCOPE OF WORK

The Contractor shall provide all labor, tools, transportation, materials, equipment and
permits as necessary to provide the required level of services as described herein. The
Contractor shall work on an on-call basis. - The types of services that may be requested
ur]d‘er Carpentry Services shall include the following: -

1. Demolition of gypsum wall board, plaster, metal, masonry and wood wail systems
2. Demolition, repair or replacement of flooring and subflooring systems

‘Page 6of 11
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3. Rough carpentry related to commercnal construction of walls, doors, windows and

ceilings
4. Finish carpentry related to commeércial construction of walls, doors windows and
ceilings
5. Demolition, repair or replacement of ceilings
6. Demolition, repair or replacement of suspended acoustical tile celllngs
7. Demolition, repair, fabrication, installation or replacement of cabinetry
"8. Installation and removal of temporary enclosures comprised of materials rated for
. the purpose
9. Protection of looring and countertop surfaces with Builder Board, Ram Board or
equivalent

10.Demoalition, repair or replacément of building envelope components

Individual projects are not to exceed $25,000 including all costs associated with any
individual project, including supervision, labor, mileage, equipment, construction -
equipment, machinery and supplies unless a waiver is obtained from the Director of
Plant and Property. -

The Contractor shiall submit a not to exceed quote to individual projects at rates
established in this Contract. :

- For emergency work requiring immediate attention, the Contractor shall work on a Time
and Material basis subject to review and approval! by the State Projec_:t Manager.

All services performed under this Contract shall be performed between the hours of
7:00 A.M. and 5:00 P.M. unless other airangements are made in advance with the
State. Any deviation in work hours shall be pre-approved by the Contracting Officer.
‘The State requires ten-day advance knowledge of said work schedules to provide
security and access to respective work areas. :

The Contractor shall not.commence work until a conference is held with each agency, at
which rep'res’entatiyes of the Contractor and the State are present. The conference will
be arranged by the requesting agency (State). '

The Contractor shall initiate, maintain and supervrse alI safety precautlons and program
in-connection with the work,

The Contractor shaII take all reasonable precautions for the safety of, and shall provide
all reasonable protection to prevent damage, injury or loss to:

a} All.employees of the work and all other persons who may be affected thereby;,

b) All the work and all materials an equipment to be incorporated therein, whether in
storage on or.off the site, under the-care, custody or control of the Contractor or
any of their subcontractor(s).
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. ¢} The Contractor shall give all notices and comply with all applicable laws, .
ordinances, rules, regulation and lawful orders of any public authority bearing on
- the safety of persons or property or their protection from damage, injury or loss.

vood) If at any time during the performance of the work required by the Contract, the
Contractor finds, or has reason to suspect, the presence of asbestos, lead paint,
or other hazardous materials in the work area, Contractor shall immediately notify
the State representative in writing setting forth the observation;’ suspicions and
requesting instructions. At the same time, the Contractor shaII ‘withdraw all
personnel from the potentially contaminated area.

The Contractor shall provide adequate supervision of their employees to ensure
complete and satisfactory performance of all work in accordance wnth the terms of the
Contract. '

. The Contractor shall provide methods, means ahd facilities to.minimize noise produced
by construction operations.

The Contractor shall ensure that all materials shall be of-the best quality, alI work is
completed in a professional manner and all aspects of the project are delivered in good
working order, complete and perfect in every fespect.. All materials and equipment shall
be new unless otherwise specmed and all Carpentry Services shall be good quahty free
from faults'and defects. :

The Contractor shall supervise and direct the work, using their best skills and attention,
The Contractor shall be solely responsible for all construction, means, methods,
techniques, sequences and procedures and for coordinating all portions of the work. Al
aspects of the project shall be subject to the inspection and approval of the State. The
Contractor guarantees to repair, replace, re-execute, or otherwise correct any defect-in
workmanship, material, of the like that fails to conform to the requirements of the State,
or that appear during the progress of the work or wnthm one year of final acceptance by
the State.

'The Contractor shall be responsnble to the State for the acts and omissions of their
employees, subcontractors and their agents and employees and other personnel
performing any of the work under this Contact .

All Carpentry Services shall be completed in such-a manner as not to mterfere with the .
State’s operating functions. The Contractor and their employees shall familiarize ,
themselves and comply with all rules and regulations applicable to each state building.

The State shall require correctlon of defective-work or damages to any part of a building
or its appurtenances when caused by the Contractor’s employees, equipment or
supplies. The Contractor shall replace in satisfactory condition all defective work and
damages rendered thereby or any other damages incurred. Upon failure of the
Contractor to proceed promptly with the necessary corrections, @he State may withhold
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any amount necessary to correct ail defective work or damages from payments to the
Contractor

The work staff shall consist of qualified persons completely familiar with the products
and equipment they shall use. The Contracting Officer may require the Contractor to
dismiss from work such employees as deemed incompetent, careless, insubordinate, or
otherwnse objectionable, or whose continued employment on the work is deeméd to be
contrary to the public interest or inconsistent with the best interest of security and the
State. . . -

The Contractor or their personnél shall not represent them_selveé as employees or
agents of the State.

While on State property, employees shall be subject to the control of the State, but
under no circumstances shall such persons be deemed to be employees of the State.

The work staff shall consist of qualified persons completely familiar with the products
and equipment they shall use. -The Contracting Officer may require the Contractor to
dismiss from work such employees as deemed incompetent, careless, insubordinate, or
otherwise objectionable, or whose continued employment on the work is deemed to be
contrary to the public interest or inconsistent with the best interest of secunty and the
State.

The Contractor or their personnel shall not represent themselves as employees or
agents of the State.

While on State property, employees shall be subject to the control of the State, but
under no circumstances shall such persons be deemed to be employees of the State

The Contractors personnel shall be aliowed only in areas where serwces are being
performed. The use of State telephones is prohibited.

. If sub-contractors are to be utilized, Contractor shall provide information regarding the
proposed sub-contractors including the name of the company, their address, contact
person and three references for clients they are currently servicing. Approval by the
Staté must be received prior to a sub-contractor starting any work. :

6. @NFIDENTIALL_ITY & CRIMINAL RECORD

If requested, the Contractor and its ern_ployees.' and Sub-contractors (if any), shall be
required to sign and submit a Confidentia!l Nature of Department Records Form and a
-Criminal Authorization Records Form. These forms shall be submitted prior to the start
of the work.
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EXHIBIT C

PAYMENT TERMS

1. CONTRACT PRICE

The Contractor hereby agrees to provide Carpentry Services in complete compliance
with the terms and conditions specified in Exhibit B for an amount up to and not to
exceed a price of $145,430.00; this figure shall not be considered a guaranteed or
minimum figure; however it shall be considered a maximum figure from the effective

date through the explratnon date as indicated in Form P- 37 Block 1. 7

2. PRICING STRUCTU RE

Scheduled Carpentrv Services, shall be lnvouced on a fixed price basis based

on the rates listed b below

Any emergency Ca[gentry Services shall be completed on a Time and Material

basis at the rates listed below.

Regions ' Description Unit Cost
Concord Area Labor Rate Monday - Friday $57.00/Hour
Concord, Hooksett 0700-1700
Approximately 60 facilities : , '
" Labor Rate Saturday $80.00/Hour
Labor Raté Sundays, Holidays $80.00/Hour
Labor Rate Monday — Friday $80.00/Hour
1701 - 6:59 AM
South . Labor Rate Monday - Friday - $57.00/Hour
Manchester, Derry, Nashua, 0700-1700
Miford, Merrimack : .
Approximately 7 facilities Labor Rate Saturday $80.00/Hour
. Labor Rate Sundays, Holidays $80.00/Hour
Labor Rate Monday — Friday $80.00/Hour.
1701 - 6:59 AM
* Seacoast . Labor Rate Monday - Friday $57.00/Hour
Portsmolith, Dover, Brentwood, ’ 0700-1700
Rochester, Hampton
Approximately 5 facilities , " Labor Rate Saturday $80.00/Hour
B . Labor Rate Sundays, Holidays $80.00/Hour
Labor Rate Monday — Friday ~ $80.00/Hour

1701 —'6:59 AM

| The Hourly Rate shall be for the actual amount of time at the respective job sites.
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The Mt|eage Charge shall be $0.575 per mile portal to portal, or the distance from the
previous worksite to the new worksite whichever is less.

All materials shall be invoiced at a markup not to exceed 30% over Contractor's cost.

The maximt;m markup rate shall not exceed 10% for any work performed by approved
subcontractors. ‘

The maximum markup rate shall not exceed 30% for any materials utilized by
subcontractors. :

For scheduled Carpentry Services completed on a'fixed price basis, the Contractor shall
provide information on the invoice that includes detail of the work performed, dates and
location of the Carpentry Services.

For Emergency Carpentry Services awarded on a Time and Material basis the
Contractor must provide detail of the work performed, dates and location of the
Carpentry Services, a copy of the material invoices to verify mark up and number of
hours pet person worked. ' '

The Contractor shall submit invoices at rates stated in the Contract. The State reserves
the right to examine the Contractor’s invoices for the material used in completmg the
work.

3. INVOICE

Itemized invoices shall be submitted to the individual bureau after the completion of the
job/services and shall include a brief descnpuon of the work done along with the
location of the work.

Contractors shall be paid within thirty (30) days after recelpt of property documented
invoice and acceptance of the work to the State's satnsfactnon

4, PAYMENT

Payments may be made via ACH. Use the followmg link to enroll with the State
Treasury for ACH payments: https://www nh.gov/treasury
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Certificate of Authority #3 ' : {Limited Pennership, Limited Lisbiliry
Profcssional Partnership or LLC)

Limited Partnership or LLC Certificate of Authority

I, Joshus H’CLI’W bereby certify thatlam a Partner Member or Manager

(Name)
of _hl Rovis fonrrvetltna limited liability partnersh:p under RSA 304-B, a limited

ﬂVame of Partnership or LLC)

_liabilify professic)nal partnership under RSA 304-D, or a limited liability cor‘npaﬁy under
RSA 304-C.

[ certify that -St.WfC\( 1<ett 21 is authorized to bind the partnership or LLC. I
(P-37 Signatory)*

further centify that it is understood that the State of New Hampshire will rely on Lhis
certificate as evidence that the person listed above currently occupies the position indicated
and that they have full authority to bind_thc paitnership or LLC and that this authorization
shall remain valid for tlhir(y (30) days from the date of this Corporate Resolution

DATE: /{//// z/ aTTEST:  Teftun 7. I%?MZ'-—

(Vame)
e be—

(Title)

STATE OFNIew) HompShir<
COUNTY OF {hlls iprovgh

On the U'W'day of QC40’, before me | ] .+ | the undersigned officer
personally appeare J known to me or satisfactorily proven to be the person
whosc.name is subscribed to the within instrument and acknowledged that he/she executed the same for

oses thereg iped. fin witness whereof, | hereunto set me hand and official seal: e i '

Justice of the Peace / Notary Public

My Commission Expires: . BHAWN H. BOISVERT
NOTARY PUBLIC
Btatct of Nlnwll-la llpl!tlru
omm ssion e
il Moy 1,2024

* Note: The sngnatory to this Certificate of Authority and the signatory to the P-37 may not be -
the same individual.




State of New Hampshire
Department of State

CERTIFICATE

]

I, William M. Gardner, Sccretary of State of the State of New Hampshire, do hercby centify that SOLID ROOTS
CONSTRUCTION LLC is a New Hampshire Limitéd Liability Company ngislcréd to transact business in Nesw Hampshire on
April 14, 2017, } further certify that all fees and documents réquired by the Secretary of State’s office havé been received and is in

good stending as far as this office is concerned.

Business 1D: 768387
Cenificate Number:"0005454116

IN TESTIMONY WHEREOF.

| hereto set my hand and couse to be affixed
the Seat of the State of New Hempshire,
this 1 Lth day of October A.D. 2021.

Dr ok

William M. Gardner

Secretary of Siate




State of New Hampshire
Department of State

Business Information Change

BUSINESS NAME: SOLID ROOTS CONSTRUCTION LLC
BUSINESS TYPE: Damestic Limited Liabllity Company
BUSINESS (D: 768387

STATE OF FORMATION: New H)ampshlre

UPDATED BUSINESS ADDRESS .
PRINCIPAL OFFICE ADDRESS: 815 Elm Street, Suite 58, Manchester, NH, 03101, bSA
MAILING ADDRESS: B15 Eim Street, Suite 5B, Manchester, NR, 03101, USA

Filed
Date Filed : 100112021 04:52:33 IPM
Ellective Date : 10/0172021 04:52:3) PM
Filing ¥ ; 5450951 Pages: 1
Business ID ; 763357
Wilkiam AL Gardner
Sctrctary of Sine
State of New Hampshire

1, the underslgne.d. do hereby certily that the above information is true 10 the best of my knowledge and bellef.

Title: Member

‘ Signature: Jeffrey Kelley

Name of Signer: Jefirey Kelley

Date signed: 10/01/2021

DISCLAIMER: All documents filed with the Corporation Division become public records and will be available for public inspection in either tangible

or elecironic lorm.

Muiling Address - Corporation Divisre, NH Depasiment of State, 107 Noah Muin Strect, Reom 20, Concord, NH 4#5301-4489
Physical Loeation - State House Annex, Jed Fliwr, Room 317, 23 Capitel Streer, Concond, NH ] ~

Phone: (60312713246 | Fax: 1603)271-3247 | Eonails corpinaiefesas.nh, gov | Website: sos.aih,gov
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'CERTIFICATE OF LIABII_.IfY INSURANCE

DATE (MMWDOYYTY]
10/06/2021

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND QR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
{ BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORLZED

REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

TMPORTANT: I the certificats holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(iss) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorssd.
If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terma and conditions of the policy, certaln policies may require an sndorsament A statement on

this cartificate doos not confer rights to tho cortificats holder in lieu of such endormement(s).

PRODUCER LONALT  Taryn Masse
Crass Insurance PHONE  (603) 812-2800 [ 1A% oy, (603) §70-1073
75 Portsmouth Slvd. AODHES!; Taryn.MasseQcrossaponcy.com .
Suits 100 INSURER(E] AFFORDENG COVERAQE NAICS
Portsmouth NH 03801 WSURER A; Continentsl Wastern Ins Co 10804
INSURED. wsuner p: Acadis ing Co. 31328
SOLID ROOTS CONSTRUCTION, LLC wauRER ¢ ; Unjon Insranca Company 25844
815 ELM ST, STE 58 WAURER D :
WSURIN'S ;
MANCHESTER NH 03101 JS—
COVERAGES ) CERTIFICATE NUMBER:  21-22 Lisb Master REVISION NUMBER:
THIS 1S TO GERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POUCY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REOUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED QR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN RECUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.
T{_‘}: TYPE OF INSURANCE ‘WW POLICY NUMBER m_:cnmﬂ: ; m LMTS
D¢} COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY : EACH OCCURRENCE g 1.000.000
| cummssace (>4 oocun ;  PREWSES (£ ocpurerny | 3 300.000
- _ ' MED EXP (A one parson) | 3 10.000
A CPAS5431762-11 031812021 | 031872022 [ pepsomnt s aovinamy | 3 1000.000
| GENL AGGREGATE 04T APPLIES PER: GENERAL AGGAEGATE 3 2:000.000
|| pouey r: o toc PRODUCTS - CoMPrOP AGQ_| ¢ 2:000.000
OTHER: - s Mﬂ-ONGOGNG H
SOMBNED SINGLE UMIT
AUTOMOBILE UABILITY | pcxiont) 3 1,000,000
& ANY AUTO : BOCILY INJURY {Pot pormon] | 3
| owseD SCHEDILED
AT | SiTos owy e CAAS432315-11 0318/2021 | 03/18/2022 | BOOILY INJURY (Per ecident) | §
HIRED NOW o [THGPERTY DAMAGE 5
|| autos onwy AUTOS ONLY | [Pyv pocident)
Medical payments 5 5,000
5 UMBRELLA LAD )_( OCCUR EACH OCCURRENCE 3 1.000.000
8 EXCESS LiAD CLANMS-MADE CUA5432018-11 V182021 | 0INMB2022 | L anreaaTe 3 1,000000
vep | |revawmons - '
WORMERS COMPENSATION X Etnre | |Be
AND EMPLOYERSF LARILITY d YiN 3.000.000
B [ R e I T WCA 5475300 2. NH 0M2172021 | 03192022 |Eb EACHACCIDENT s
(Mandatory inKH) £ DISEASE . EAEMPLOVEE | 3 1.000.000
11 yoa, deacride under 1,000,000
DESCRIFTION OF OPERATIONS below EL DISEASE - poucyumey | ¢ O
Joft Kelly and Joshus Hamel Excluded :
lrom Worker's Compensetion ' -

DESCRIPTION OF GPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (ACORD 191, Additionsl Remasks Schadubs, may be afieched #f more space Is rewdred)
Jafl Kelly end Joshus Hamel are excluded from Workers Compensaton. lnsurance efiorded by the poficies described harein is sublect o efl the lomms,

exdusions, wamranties snd condlitions of such paticies.

CERTIFICATE HOLOER

CANCELLATION

v

Stote of New Hampshire Depl of Administrative Services
25 Cepitol 51, Rm 1138
Concord NH: 03301
1

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WLl BE DELIVERED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POUCY PROVISIONS.

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

*

s

ACORD 25 (2016/03)
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